REDACTED

INVOICE

Lewis Builders Development Inc ‘ Invoice Number: 19068
54 Sawyer Ave Invoice Date: 11-30-2019
Atkinson, NH 03811 |
| Customer ID: HAWC
To: Job Location:
HAMPSTEAD AREA WATER CO., INC. Job # 19-9850
54 SAWYER AVE 2020 HAWC Rate Case
ATKINSON, NH 03811
|
|
!
|
Fixed .Alsset No:
|
: Unit of
Item  Description Units Measure Unit Price Amoun
|
1 Work Performed During the Month of | 327.05

November 2019

Amount Billed $327.05

Retainage Held

Amount Due $327.05
DATE DUE: 12-30-2019

A finance charge of 12% per year will be assessed on aIII invoices not paid by the due date.




REDACTED

12111201 \ i
’ Job Cost Transaction Report for Labor Burden  0.63

LLBD to HAWC Jobs - Noveml?er Overhead 0.1

Job # 19-9850 2020 HAWC Rate| Case .
. EQID Units

- 01-070 Legal :
11/28/2019 L SPRATT,LAURA J ! \/ 3.00 135.70
Total - Legal . 135.70
99.923 Accounting & Management /
12912019 L SULLIVAN;JOHN F 2.00 191.35
Total - Accounting & Management 191.35
Sub-Total 327.05

Job Total for Last Month 5.00 327.05




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, ING. EMPLOYEE #: 1931

54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Laura J. Spratt

ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature; EE': 1% Z ‘ i;i?

WEEK #1/16/19 | through 11/22/19
Date Day Time In Out In Time Dut|! Comments Worked
11/16/18 Salurday | 0.00
11/17/18 Sunday ! 0.00
111181 Monday | 7:00 AM [12:00pm | 12:3Com | 4:30pm |: 9.00
11191 Tu=sday 7:00 AM |12:00pm | 12:30PM | 4:30PM |1 9.00
11/20/1 Wednesday | 7:00AM | 12:00PM | 12:30PM | 4:30PM }I 9.00
112111 Thursday | 7:00 AM | 12:00 PM| 12:30FPM | 4:30PM | 9.00
11122119 Friday 7:00 AM {12:00pm | 12:30PM | 4:30PM || 9.00
] Additional hours not shown above: 0.00
Comments: D ¢ | 45,00

Fﬂ |
11/22/19 9-5850 m review PUC admin rules for new Rate case



LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELCPMENT, INC.

54 SAWYER AVENUE
ATKINSON, NH03811

|
Empl. #: 495
@ohn gﬁliﬁ n M
Signatures ___f—sORfeT
1116118

Names

1112219

111719 Sunday
1111819 Menday
111919 Tuesday
1172019 Wednesday
1112119 Thursday
11/22/19 Friday

Additional hours neol shown above - after hours meeting, etc - write tolal hours in "Net Hrs Werked” column

Comments:

ok |_ssssso | sy | Gost o Senica sudy 20

T 40AM

12:00 PM

12:30 PM

S20PM

7:50AM

11:30 AM

12:00 PM

4:30 PM

7T.05AM

4:45 PM

T:35AM

12:00 FM

12:30 PM

2:30 PM

7:20AM

12:00 PM

12:30 PM

6:15 PM

VWLEFSOTLB-Data\UserData\John\ Time Sheets.ssx

w—

[NetHrs:
.| Worked

0.00
0.00
9.147
817
987
6.42

10.42

43.85

REDACTED




RAFTELIS
227 W. Trade St
Suite 1400
Charlotre, NC 26202

John Sullivan

Hampstead Area Water Company
54 Sawyer Ave.

Atkinson, NH 035811

= RAFTELIS

Project R-HAWC2001.00 Hampstead Area Water Comp

Professional Personnel

Hours
Manager
Fox, David 23.00
Consultant
Eastman, Luke 400
Associate
Rinehart, Ryan 30.00
Totals 57.00
Total Professional Fees
Project Expenses
Project Travel Expenses
Technology & Communications Charge
Contract Current
Total Billings 11,546.12
Contract Ceiling
Remaining
Current Prior

Billings to Date 11,546.12 000

March 11, 2020
Invoice No: 14315
y Cost of Service
Rate Amount
240.00 5,520.00
185.00 740.00
155.00 4,650.00
10,910.00
66.12
66.12
570.00
570.00
Prior Billings
0.60 11,546.12
20,000.00
845388
Total this Invoice
Total Received
11,546.12 0.00

10,910.00

570.00

$11,546.12

A/R Balance
11,546.12

With Billing inquiries, please contact us at billing@raftelis.com

REDACTED




REDACTED

INVOICE

Lewis Builders Development Inc Invoice Number: 20192

54 Sawyer Ave Invoice Date: 03-31-2020

Atkinson, NH 03811 :

Customer ID: HAWC
To: ' Job Location:

HAMPSTEAD AREA WATER CO., INC. Job # 19-9850

54 SAWYER AVE 2020 HAWC Rate Case

ATKINSON, NH 03811 .

Fixed Asset No:
Unit of

tem Description Units Measure Unit Price Amoun!
1 Work Performed During the Month of March 133.94

2020

Amount Billed 1$133.94

Retainage Held

Amount Due $133.94
DATE DUE: 04-30-2020 ’ .

A finance charge of 2% per month assessed on all invoices not paid by the due date,




4112020 Job Cost Transaction Report for

LBD to HAWC Jobs - 3/1/2020 to 3/31/2020

Job #19-9850 2020 HAWC Rate Case

EQID
01070 Legal

202020 L AUGERI;ANTHONY
Total - Legal

Sub-Total

Job Total for Last Month

Labor Burden

0.63
Overhead 0.1
Units
1.10 133.94
133.94
__ 13394
1.10 133.94

REDACTED




REDACTED

LEWIS EUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.
- 54 SAWYER AVENUE

ATKINSON, NH 03811

EMPLOYEE #: 140

NAME: Anthony Augér  «
Slgrature: < ..,7

WEEK: 0350?!20{,....-, through 03/13120
Date Day Time In Out in Time Out _Cofiments Worked
AL — — I o152 -
a0 Saturday 0.00
IBZ0 -~ Sunday 000
amro Monday 7:00 AM 5.00 PN 850
31020 Tuesday B:45 AM 4:45 PN, 8501
1120 Wednesday 7:00 AM 5:45 PM 1025
31220 Thursday 7:00 AM 5:00 PM 850
31320 Friday 7:00 AM -~ | 500PM 850
Additional hours not shown above:]| 0
Comments: ﬂ(. D ﬁb"/ T




Stephen P. St. Cyr & Associates
17 Sky Oaks Drive

Biddeford, Me. 04005

207-423-0215

stephenpstcyr@yahoo.com

© April 4,2020
. John Sullivan
Lewis Builders

54 Sawyer Avenue
Atkinson, N. H. 03811

Hampstead Area Water Company

Re: Year End, ROE, Tisdale, Kelly Green, CIAC 'fariff, SNHRWIP Financing &
Truck Financing .

Fee for professional services rendered March 2020 (see attached detail):

Current Month (26.25 hours @ $140.00 / hour) $3,675.00
Reimbursable Expenses: Copies 1.95
Postage 1.60
Scan / Email 0.00
Tax software fee 0.00
Total Billing ' $3.678.55

Payment due upon receipt.

If you have any questions or comments, please call me at 207-423-0215.

Sincerely,

* Stephen P. St. Cyr

REDACTED




REDACTED

Date Description of Service Hours




REDACTED

HAWC 2020 Rate Case (DW 20-xxx)

03/05 Talk w/Tony re: notice of intent . 0.125

SPSL. Cyr
404120




2,376.25

130.00

$2,506.25

AJR Balance

RAFTELIS | ' .
27W. Trade't RAFTELIS
Sulte 1400 .
Charlotte, NC 25202 .
. April 7, 2020
Joha Sullivan Invoice No: 14732
Hampstead Area Water Company
54 Sawyer Ave.
Atkinson, NH 03811
" Project R-HAWC2001.00 Hampstead Area Water Company Cost of Service
iona i
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Manager
Fox, David . 4.25 240,00 1,020.00
Associate
Rinehart, Ryan 875 155.00 1,356.25
Totals 13.00 237625
Total Professional Fees
Technology & Communications Charge 130.00
130.00
Confract Current Frior Billings
Total Billings 250625 154612 14,05237
Contract Ceiling 20,000.00
Remaining 5,947.63
Total this Invoice
Current Prior Total Received
Billings to Date 2,506.25 11,546.12 14,052.37 11,546.12

With Billing inquiries, please contact us at billing@raftelis.com

REDACTED




REDACTED

INVOICE

Lewis Builders Development Inc Invoice Number: 20297
54 Sawyer Ave

i Invoice Date: 04-30-2020
Atkinson, NH 03811

Customer ID: HAWC

Ta: Job Location::
HAMPSTEAD AREA WATER CO., INC. {Job # 19-9850
54 SAWYER AVE 12020 HAWC Rate Case
ATKINSON, NH 03811 i
Fixed Aslset No:
!
}
Unit of
ltem Description Units Measure Unit Price Amount
1 Work Performed During the Month of April ' 2,070.47
2020 ;

Amount Billed $2,070.47
Retainage Held

DATE DUE: 05-30-2020

i
; Amount Due $2,070.47
|
A finance charge of 2% per month assessed on all invo]caslnot paid by the due date.

i

'




5/5/2020

01-070
4/10/2020
417/2020
4/2412020

REDACTED

Job Cost Transaction Report :for
LBD to HAWC Jobs - 4/1/2020 to 4/30/2020

Job # 19-9850 2020 HAWC Rate-! Case
- EQID
Legal
L AUGERI,ANTHONY
L AUGERL,ANTHONY
L AUGERI;ANTHONY
Total - Legal

Sub-Total

Job Total for Last Month

Labor Burden 0.48

Overhead 0.23
Units

9.90 1,212.88
2.90 355.29
4.10 502.30

T 2,07047
2,070.47

16.90 2,070.47




|
|
|
|

REDACTED

e - Fa i

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC,

' EMPLOYEE #: 140 ”
. 54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Anthony ﬂgﬁ
= ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature: | r oA
Cut In

WEEK: 0328120/ through — B40373
Date Oay Time In Tima Out | | /_Coments Werked

2820 Saturday [ 0.00
3129720 Sunday 0.00
33020 Manday 7:00 AM S:00PM | - 975
33120 Tuesday §:45 AM 5:45 PM 10.00
420 -+ | Wecnesday | 7.00 AM 5:00 PN 10.50
A0 Thursday 6:45 AM 500 PM | - - 375
41320 Friday £:45 AM AXSPN | | 950

! Additional hours notshown above: 0.00

Comments: 4 0 l’\ & \/ | .

ot (sss) (0rm0) Mokensocswponmacivs |73

04161:20 i 19-6850 'ﬂ!ﬁ) Work on rate case pefition and exhibits |

g




REDACTED

BBl 2 b e s,

. s =

G

B < LEW+A1:1501S BUILDERS DEVE LOFMENT, INC. EMPLOYEE #: 140 PAGE 2
£ ..~ 54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Anthany Augeri

i ATKINSON, NH 03811 |

i WEEK: mzmzn to 04/03/20

S Revise petition and exhibits including prefied testimoney for Steve and
i .- |o4m2r20 ( Harold, review PUC filing rues for ralz case, outling timeling 1)

|
M ([01-070) _|Revise rate casa documents and review PUC fules lor al requitements ki)




REDACTED

e M -. - A g /
i . .LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, ING—~ V EMPLOYEE #; 140
7,54 SAWYER AVENUE HAME: Anthony Augerl .
_ ATKINSON, NHD3g11 Signature; | -
: WEEK: 04i04/20 /(_thrgugh 041020
Date Day Tima In Qut In Timo Out | | Cemments/ Worked
44720 Saturday N R o g 0.00
AS20 Sunday | 0.00
4620 Monday 7.00 AM 530PM | | 10.00
- &7i20 Tuesday 6:45 AM 500 PM | | 9.75
48720 Wednesday | 6:45 AM 4:45 PM | 9.25
4820 Thursday B:45 AM 515 PM [ 10.00
A/1020 Friday 6:30 AM S1PM | 1 - 10.25
Additional hours not shown above: 0co /
comments: - 49.25




~a

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.

EMPLOYEE #: 140

54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Anthony Atgerl
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Slgnature: 7, — 7 -
WEEK: 04/11/20, through 04117120
Dale Day Time In Out In Time Out | | L. Comments Worked
4111120 Saturday i 0,00 |
412720 Sunday i [1¢]
411320 Manday 5:45 AM 445 PM | | 950
4114120 Tuesday 7:00 AM 515PM | ¢ a7s
41520 Wednesday | 6:45AM 445PM | 925
416720 Thursday B:45 AM 515PM | 1 1009
4117120 Frday 6:30 AM | 515PM | | 1025
Additional hours not shown above: 000
Comments: 40 \'\ (&} \/ | 48.75

'V¥ork on rate case petiion, draft

| :
prefied testimeny, and exhibis

REDACTED




REDACTED

Stephen P. St. Cyr & Associates
17 Sky Oaks Drive

Biddeford, Me. 04005

207-423-0215

stephenpsteyr@yahoo.com
May 2, 2020
John Sullivan
Lewis Builders
54 Sawyer Avenue
Atkinson, N. H. 03811
Hampstead Area Water Company

Re: Year End, ROE, Tisdale, Kelly Green, CIAC Tariff, SNHRWIP Financing &
Truck Financing

Fee for professional services rendered April 2020 (see attached detail):

Current Month (15.6875 hours @ $140.00 / hour) $2,196.25

Reimbursable Expenses: Copies 0.00
Postage 0.00
Scan / Email 10.55
Tax software fee 0.00
Total Billing 2.206.80

Payment due upon receipt.

If you have any questions or comments, please call me at 207-423-0215.

Sincerely,

Stephen P. St. Cyr




REDACTED

Hours

Date Description of Service




REDACTED

HAWC 2020 Rate Case (DW 20-xxx)
04/03 Review email re: pet, TofC, SPS’s test,, & Harold’s test; Review email re: exh; Prepare

2019 act rofr; Review cover ltr, lir,, notice & req for waiver 0.875
04/08 Review 2019 act r of r; make minor changes; Prepare email re; same 0.50
04/09 Review/Reply to email re: act rofr 0.25
04/14 Talk w/Tony re: RC 0.0625
Total 1.6875

SPSt. Cyr
502120




RAFTELIS
227 W. Trade St
Suite 1400
Charlotte, NC 28202

% RAFTELIS

May 7, 2020
John Sultivan Invoice No: 14943
Hampstead Area Water Company
54 Sawyer Ave.
Atkinson, NH 03811
Project R-HAWC2001.00 Hampstead Area Water Company Cost ofSel!'vIce
Professional from April 1, 2020 to April 30, 2020 !
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Manager
Fox, David 9.25 240.00 2,220.00
Totals 9.25 | 2,220.00
Total Professional Fees 1
|
Technology & Communications Charge | 92.50
| 92.50
Contract Current Prior Biuingsl
Total Billings 231250 14,!15?_37i 16,364.87
* Contract Ceiling | 20,000.00
Remaining 3,635.13
Total this Invoice
Current Prior To;tal Received
Billings to Date 231250 14,052.37 16,36-1i87 14,052.37

2,220.00

AR Balance
2,312.50

With Billing inquiries, please contact us at billing®raftelis.com

REDACTED




Lewis Builders Development Inc Invoice Number: 20382
54 Sawyer Ave Invoice Date: 05-31-2020
Atkinson, NH 03811
Customer ID: HAWC
To: Job Location:
HAMPSTEAD AREA WATER CO., INC. Job # 19-9850
54 SAWYER AVE 2020 HAWC Rate Case
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Atkinson, NH
Fixed Asset No:
Unit of
Item Description Units Measure Unit Price Amount
1 Work performed during the month of May 904.88
2020
Amount Billed $904.88
Retainage Held
Amount Due $904.88

DATEDUE: 06-30-2020

A finance charge of 2% per month assessed on all invoices not paid by the due date.

REDACTED



6/2/2020

'JOWJ

01-070
5112020
5/8/2020

5/22/2020
5/22/2020

Iy

Legal

L
L
L
L

Job Cost Transaction Report for Labor Burden
LBD to HAWC Jobs - 5/1/2020 to 5/31/2020 Overhead

Job # 19-9850 2020 HAWC Rate Case

AUGERIANTHONY
AUGERI,ANTHONY
AUGERIANTHONY
SPRATT,LAURAJ

Total - Legal

Sub-Total

Job Total for Last Month

0.48
0.23
EQID Units
1.60 196.02
2.70 330.78
2.30 281.78
2.00 96.30
904.88
904.88
8.60 904.88

REDACTED



REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.

Call with plainiffs’ counsel regarding request for insurance policies
hack 1o 2010 provide summary to team: Call to Pascos

( EMPLOYEE #: 140
54 SAWYER AVENUE [4 NAME: Znthony Auger
ATHINSON, NH 03311 Signature: 2
WEEH: TAI1020"— __ througn __ U4iZaizl
Data Day Time in Out in Time Out i Eamments Warked
4118720 Saturday 0.00
4118720 Sunday ]
42020 Monday 7.00 AM 445 PM .50 |
421720 Tuesday | 630 AM 245 P 75
412272) Wednesday | 630 AM 500 PM 10.00
423720 Thursday | €45 AM 500 PM 9.75 L4
42470 Friday £:30 AM 430 PM .00
Additonal hours not shown abave: 0.00
Comments: A(D "’\?_‘Ea \/

Work on notice of intent to file rate case and request for waiver; Revisa
management les agreement




REDACTED

LEW*+A1.150iS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC,
B4 SAWYER AVENLE
ATKINSOM, NH 03811

EMPLOYEE #: 140
HAME: Antheny Auger

PAGE 2

YWEEK: 04/1820




LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOFMENT, INC.
E4 SAWYER AVENUE
ATHINSON, NH 03811

%ﬂu‘kw EMPLOYEE #; 140

NAME: Rnthony Lug -~

Signature; /

WEEK: 0423207 = trough 050 1Z0

04727120

oo loewn )|

Dats Day Tima I Out In Time Out /_Compiants Waorked
4125720 Saturday 0.00
412610 Sunday I3 0.00
421720 Monday | T.00 AM GZ5PM_ 9.25
4728720 Tuesday 3:45 AM 530 FM 10.25 |
Ar2AR0 Wednesday 5:45 AM 500 PM B8.75
473020 Tl'md_gy 5.45 AM 5:00 FM 8.75
61120 Friday 7:00 AM 5:30 PM 10.00

Additional hours not shown above:| 0.00

Work onexhibits to rate case peti

REDACTED



REDACTED

; LEW+A1:1501S BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC, EMPLOYEE #: PAGE 2
| 54 SAWVER AVENUE HAME: ¥ Augdn
ATHINSON, NH 03311

WEEK: 04/2520 05010



REDACTED

LEW:S BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.

54 SAWYER AVENUE
ATKINSON, NH 03811

EMPLOYEE #: 140

NAME: Ant Autert -
Signature: */

WEEK: 0503%40— __ through

051520

Data Day Time In Out In TimeOut| ° Fomments Worked
5920 Saturday 000
SNoo S 0.00
SM120 Maond.ay 645 AM 445 PM 850
1220 Tuesday 7:00 AM 5.00 PM 9.50
20 | Wednesday | 645 AM 5:00 PM 975
/14120 Thursday | 7:00 AM SO0 PR 350
EN520 Frday 7.00 AM 7430 PM .00
Additlonal hours not shown above: 0.00
Comments: 4_ 0 {}:J \/ 47.25




REDACTED

LEW+A1:15013 BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, ING, EMFLOYEE #: 140 PAGEZ
£4 SAWYER AVENUE HAME: Anthony Augerd i

ATKINSON, NH 038114

WEEK: 05109720

e
0514120 ‘m Waork on rate case petdisn and exhibie, review pue reg ‘ﬁ’



REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. C@\N\JMPLQYEE #1931 //r

54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Lauraa Snr
Signature; W i h%

ATKINSON, NH 03811 s
WEEKWW%IW thrpugh  RELIT 69/ S

Data Day Iimain | Out In | Time Out Commants Worked '
59720 Saturday i N 0.00
5110/20 Sunday Tevyonalc 0.00
5111720 Monday | 7.00 AM 8:00] 10:00am | 4:30 FM }Eick time=2 hours - dentist .00
5112120 Tuesday | 7.00 AM 12:00] 12:30pm | 4:30PM — - 5.00
513720 Wednesday | 7:00 AM | 12:00pm | 12:30pm | 4:30PM N et Ty .00
014120 Thursda 700 AM J12:00 PM| 12:30 PM | 4:30PM pa’> .00
15720 Friday 7.00 AM J12:00PM | 12:30 PM | 4:30 FM e LS .00

Addilional hours not shown above:

Commants: 43.00

{erson]

Dwe




REDACTED

LEW+AT1:1501S BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. EMPLOYEE #: 1934 PAGE 2
54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Laura J. Spratt

ATKINSON, HH 03811

WEEK 09/21/19 09127119




REDACTED

Stephen P. St. Cyr & Associates
17 Sky Oaks Drive

Biddeford, Me. 04005

207-423-0215

stephenpsteyr@yahoo.com

June 6, 2020
John Sullivan
Lewis Builders
54 Sawyer Avenue
Atkinson, N. H. 03811
Hampstead Area Water Company

Re: Year End, ROE, Tisdale, Kelly Green, CIAC Tariff, SNHRWIP Financing &
Truck Financing

Fee for professional services rendered May 2020 (see attached detail):

Current Month (20.25 hours @ $140.00 / hour) $2,835.00
Reimbursable Expenses: Copies 0.00
Postage 0.00
Scan / Email 0.00
Tax software fee 0.00
Total Billing $2.835.00

Payment due upon receipt.

If you have any questions or comments, please call me at 207-423-0215.

Sincerely,

Stephen P. St. Cyr




REDACTED




2.
J,
6.4,

r

HAWC 2020 Rate Case (D'W 20-xxx
04728  Part in conf callre: RC

05/04  Part in confcallre: RC

05/04 Review/eply to cmail re: conf call

05/21  Setup RC sch; Populate data into B/S, I/S & RoR info

05/26  Review/Reply to email re: notice; Review Reply

05727 Review RC Exh; Review plant, CWIP & def dr; Review cap struct; Review rev & exp;
Prepare Review for pro forma adj

05/28  Review review for pro forma adj; Prepare email re: same

Total

SPSt. Cyr
6/06/20

0.125
0.25
0.25

REDACTED




REDACTED

54 Sawyer Ave
Atkinson, NH 03811

To:

HAMPSTEAD AREA WATER CO., INC.

54 SAWYER AVE
ATKINSON, NH 03811

INVOICE

Lewis Builders Development Inc

Invoice Number: 20511
Invoice Date: 06-30-2020

Customer [D: HAWC

Job Location:

Job # 19-9850
2020 HAWC Rate Case
Atkinson, NH

Fixed Asset No:

ltem  Description

1 Work performed during the month of June
2020

Unit of
Units Measure Unit Price Amoun
280.07
Amount Billed $280.07
Retainage Held
Amount Due

DATEDUE: 07-30-2020

A finance charge of 2% per month assessed on all invoices not paid by the due date.

$280.07




REDACTED

70712020 St
Job Cost Transaction Report for Labor Burden  0.48
LBD to HAWC Jobs - 6/1/2020 to 6/30/2020 Overhead 0.23
Job # 19-9850 2020 HAWC Rate Case
EQID Units
01-120 Project Manager
6/12/2020 L LANZA;CHARLES P : 1.00 175.03
Total - Project Manager 175.03
99-923 Accounting & Management
61272020 L SULLIVAN;JOHN F 1.00 105.04
Total - Accounting & Management T 105.04
Sub-Total T 28007

Job Total for Last Month 2.00 280.07




REDACTED

LEW'S BULDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. M Empl #; 1204
£4 SAWYER AVENUE Name: Charlia Lanzpe —

ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature: 7~y T 7
Week: 0500120 To S0
Lunch Lurch Net His
[=F11Y Dy Timah Chi in Tims Ot Commenta
BI3LI020 Saturday TN
snzozo Sunday  NA
ar20zo Mondsy TooAM [ 1200PM] 1230FK | aJ0PM 800
&R2020 Tuesday 70004 [1200PM] 1230PK | 430 PM 900
GA2020  Wednesday TO0AM | 1200PM | 1230 PM PP ioco
[ il Thursday FTOOMA [ 1100AM] 1730PM | 500 P BED
BAS2020 Frday TOOAM [ 1200PM]| 1230PM | 430PW 900
Additional hours ot Shown above - ARE! RO MEBENg. B2 « wiild IOLE Bouti i "Nel Hs Wadked cblurn . 100 "
Comments: Mise emads and cafs afler houes . 45 50

!
|
i
|
|

[ (TssioN (jovins | [WCremvososwss (o) ||

CL Tima Sheet 05-30 1o 06-09 dix




LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.

Empl. #: 1955

54 SAWYER AVENUE " Name; Jopnsupvan /4

ATKINSON, NH 03311 W\M\o‘ Slgnature: LT s SO
CD Weok: sno20 2 10: ¢ wem
Lunch Lunch NetHrs
ate Day Time In Out In Time Out Comments Worked
5130720 Saturday | 0.00
S31R20 Sunday 0.00
6/1120 Monday 7.00AM | 12:00 PM | 12:30PM | 4:45PM 9.25
672120 Tuesday 705 AM 4230 PM 842
6300 Wednasday f:50 AM { 12200 PM | 12:30PM | 4:45 PM .42
B840 Thursday 7:00 AM 4:30 PM 9.50
6/5120 Friday 700AM | 1Z00PM | 12230PM | 4:30 PM 9,00
Additional hours not shown above - after hours meebng, elc - wrte lotal hours in "Net Hrs Warked™ column —

Comments: 46.59

|
L
o

= T — e
1 5-9350 Review HAWC schedules and spreadsheets m‘

REDACTED




REDACTED

Stephen P. St. Cyr & Associates
17 Sky Oaks Drive

Biddeford, Me. 04005

207-423-0215

stephenpstcyr@yahoo.com

July 5, 2020
John Sullivan
Lewis Builders
54 Sawyer Avenue
Atkinson, N. H. 03811
Hampstead Area Water Company

Re: Year End, ROE, Tisdale, Kelly Green, CIAC Tariff, SNHRWIP Financing &
Truck Financing

Fee for professional services rendered June 2020 (see attached detail):

Previous Month Balance $2,835.00
Current Month (16.25 hours @ $140.00 / hour) $2,275.00
Reimbursable Expenses: Copies ©0.00

Postage 0.00

Scan / Email 0.00

Tax software fee 0.00
Total Current Month Billing $2,275.00
Total Billing ' $5,110.00
Payment due upon receipt.

If you have any questions or comments, please call me at 207-423-0215.

Sincerely,

Stephen P. St. Cyr




REDACTED




REDACTED

HAWC 2020 Rate Case (DW 20-xxx)

06/01 Review/Reply to email re: 2019/2018 F/S by month 0.25
06/04 Review email re: Def Drs; Review Def Drs 0.25
06/18 Review Charlie’s email re: status of RC; Review Tony's reply 0.25
06/19 Review RC sch; Review F/S by month; Review RC items for pro formas; Review 2019

Misc Def Drs; Prepare email re: same; Populate RB sch 2.75
06/26 Review John's email re: conf'call / status 0.125
0627 Reply to same 0,125
06/29 Review email re: RFP; Review RFP; Reply to same; Review/Reply to same 0.50
06/30  Review status; Review sch; Update same; Prep for / part in conf call; Update sch for Atk

Tank 3 3.75
Total 8.0

SPSt. Cyr
705720




REDACTED

INVOICE

Lewis Builders Development Inc
54 Sawyer Ave
Atkinson, NH 03811

To:
HAMPSTEAD AREA WATER CO., INC.
54 SAWYER AVE
ATKINSON, NH 03811

Invoice Number: 20657
Invoice Date: 07-31-2020

Customer ID: HAWC

Job Location:
Job # 19-9850
2020 HAWC Rate Case
Atkinson, NH

Fixed Asset  No:

ltem  Description

1 Work Performed During the Month of July
2020

Unit of
Units Measure Unit Price Amount
' 3,380.87
Amount Billed $3,380.87
Retainage Held
Amount Due $3,380.87

DATE DUE: 08-30-2020

A finance charge of 2% per month assessed on all invoices not paid by the due date.




REDACTED

8/6/2020

01-070
71312020
7/10/2020
712412020
7/31/2020
713172020

01-120
711712020
7/2412020

99-923
71712020
712412020

Job Cost Transaction Report for

LBD to HAWC Jobs - 7/1/2020 to 7/31/2020

Job # 19-9850 2020 HAWC Rate Case

Legal
AUGERL,ANTHONY
SPRATT;LAURAJ
AUGERI;ANTHONY
SPRATT,LAURAJ
AUGERIANTHONY
Total - Legal

[l el

Project Manager
L LANZA;CHARLES P
L LANZA;CHARLES P
Total - Project Manager
Accounting & Management
L SULLIVAN;JOHN F
L SULLIVAN;JOHN F
Total - Accounting & Management

Sub-Total

Job Total for Last Month

EQID

Labor Burden 0.48
Overhead 0.23
Units
1.50 183.77
4.00 192.60
5.20 637.07
3.00 144.45
2.00 245.03
1,402.92
1.00 175.03
7.00 1,225.22
1,400.25
2.00 210.07
3.50 367.63
577.70
3,380.87
29.20 3,380.87




R
T

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC, EMPLOYEE #: 140
54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME; Anihony-Augert —
e s e
ATKINEON, HH 03811 % Signature: Tl
WEEK! 062020 23 06/16/20
Date Day Time In Qut In Time Out | - Comments Veorked
620,20 Saturday " 0.00
821120 Sunday 0.00
B/2220 Monday 6.45 AM 530 PM 10.25
62320 Tuesday T:00 AM 5:30 PM 10.00
62420 | Wednesday | 7:00 AM 4.45 PM 9.25
62520 Thursday | 7:00 AM B30 PM 13.00
626720 Frday 7:00 AM pd 500 PM 9.50
D h \/ ‘Additional hours not shown above; 52{:;
rate rasa pefition 15

REDACTED




._q..._,,,.....

REDACTED

R e ]
PRI
LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC, - EMPLOYEE #: 140
54 SAWYER AVENUE - NAME: Anthony-Ager P
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signaturei=y .
; WEEK: oriinzo /. L~ 23 07117120
Data Day Timeln [¥ Out In Time Out / Comments Warked :
711720 Saturday . 0.00 i
Th20 Sunday 0.00
71320 Monday 7.00 AM 5.00 PM 9.50
Ti14/20 Tuesday T.00 AM 4$45FPM 925
71520 | Wednesday | 7.00 AM 4:30 PM 9.00
71620 Thursday 7.00 AM 4:45 PM 8.00
71720 Friday 7.00 AM 445 PM 1 hour personal ime 9.00
Additlonal hours not shown abeve: 0.0
Comments: A{D h &1\/ 45.75

Work on rate case petition documents




REDACTED

A e T e ;
»
LEW+A1LISUIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC., EMPLOYEE #: 140 PAGE 2
54 SAWYER AVENUE HAME: Anthony Augerl

ATKINSON, NH 01811

WEEK: 0711/20 Q7/17120

Review dralt schedulag from Sleve




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. {bb EMPLOYEE #: 1931 -
54 SAWYER AVENUE A NAME: Laura JfSprat lA'
ATKINSON, NH 03811 gl / Signature: E%Z( ; :
.—/'J’}-[]—Fhé, WEEK06/27120,/7/ _ 4hrodgh __ 07/03/20
Date Day Timelin | Out in__|Time Out| [/ //Comments Worked

627120 Salurday 0.00

6/26/20 Sunday 0.00

6/29/20 Monday 7:C0 AM 12:00] 12:30pm_| 4:30 PM 9.00

630720 Tuesday | 7:00 AM 12:00] 12:30pm | 4:30PM 9.00

7i1120 Wednesday | 7:00 Al 12:00pm | 12:30pm | 4:30PM 9.00

712120 Thursday | 7:00 AM | 12:00 PM| 12:30 PM | 4:30PM 9.00

71320 Friday 7:00 AM |12:00PM | 12:30PM | 4:30 PM Holiday 8.00

Additional hours not shown above: *

Comments: i 44,00 ‘

Begin reviewing and prepare degument for rate case m.




LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.

EMPLOYEE #: 1931

54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Taurgil, Sprait— , / 7
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature 77 /T 7 /- i e
WEEK Q7/18/20° ‘ throurgh 07124120
Date _Day Time In Qut In Time Out ' Comments Worked
711820 Salurday 0.00
711520 Sunday 0.00
7720720 Monday 7:00 AM 12:00] 12:30pm | 4:30 PM 9.00
7121120 Tuesday 7:00 AM 12:00] 12:30pm | 4:30PM 9.00
7122120 Wednesday | 7:00 AM | 12:00pm | 12:30pm | 4:30PM 9.00
723120 Thursday | 7:00 AM [12:00 PM| 12:30 PM 4:30PM 9.00
7124120 Friday 7:00 AM |12.00PM | 12:30 PM | 4:30PM 3.00
Additional hours not shown above:
45.00

REDACTED




REDACTED

L]
i -

LEWIS EUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. EMPLOYEE #: 140
54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Anthony Augerl
ATHINSON, NH 03811 Slgnature:  /: eme, St
WEEK: 07M820~— 23 07124120
Data Day Time In Out In Time Qut [ Camments Worked
7118420 Saturday * 0.00
1520 Sunday 0.00
70 Monday T.00 AM 515 FM 8.75
TRAZD Tuesday 7:00 AM 500 FM 9.50
2270 | Wednesday | 7.00 AM 445 FM 9.25
220 Thursday 7:00 AM 545 PM 10.25
24120 Friday 7.:00 AM /| 445 FM 9.25
Additional hours net shown above: 0.00
omments: 4 ' v M t 48.00




REDACTED

——
LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. @* \( EmplL#&; 1204
54 SAWYER AVENUE Mame: Charlis Lanza
ATKINSON, NH 03311 Slgnature: ¢ .
Week: 07704/20 To: 711012020

RgkeLien co Luneh of ot Lunehy ooy e T - b+ NetHrs,
. Date ; S T QU A TR e U Comments -~ .S il Worked

TH2020 Sawrday NA |

7020 Sunday NA | ’

TeR020 Maonday TO0AM [1700PM| 1230PW_| 330PM 800

72020 Tuesday | 630AM [12:00PM| 1230PWA | 430PM 950

TIEQ020  Wedresday | B30AM | &¢ A:00 PM 950

TR2020 Thursday 630 AM 1200 PM | 1230PM 430 PM 950
712020 Frday T.00AM [12C0PM | 1230FM | 330FHM - 8.00
Additional hours not shéwn above - after hours meeting, ic - wiila Iotal hours in et Hrs Worked: calumn = 100

Comments: Misc, emails and calts afer hours i 4550 }

CL Time Sheet 07-04 to O7-10.xisx




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. Empl.#: 1204
54 SAWYERAVENUE Kame; Charlie Lanza -
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature: (T —T___-
Week: o720 To: TI471/2020
R Pu g IR X e . sozaluneh)io - Luneh: "+ P e
c.Date Ty L DayISN owt e +- ' Comments "
7112020 Saturday  NA
2020 Sunday A
71122020 Monday BOAM | 1200PM | 1230 PM 4. 30FM 9.50
711412020 Tuesday 30 AM | 11:C0AM [ 1:00 PM 11:58 PM 15.48
THS2020 Wednesday 30 AM | 12.00FM 1:00 PM 4 30PM 7.00
71162020 Thursday 30 AM [12200PM [ 1230 PM | 4:30PM 8.50
72020 Friday 6:30AM | 12.00PM | 1230 PM 330PM 6.50
Additienal hours not shown above - afier heurs meebng, etc- wive 1013l Rours in“Nel Hrs Worked” columin — _____600]
e e D2 Tie in £6.98 |

| 1998500  [01120 | [HAWGRaleCase ciscussion and prepars schedules (3200 Y A=)

m_ HAWC Rate Casa discUssicn and prepara scheduies ‘m_

— T, 020 || Rate case msc_fems. discuss with Jonn and Steve ~zo0y | |

CL Time Sheel 07-11 ta 07-17.xsx




REDACTED

Empl. #: 955
Name: John $uilivan
Signature:

Week: 714120 é / To:( TI10/20

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC,
54 SAWYER AVENUE "
ATKINSON, NH 03811

f e i Cal

Saturday .
71520 Sunday " 0.00
76120 Monday 7:30 AM 435 PM 9.08
0 Tuesday 7:00 AM 4:15 FM 0.25
TIER0 Wednesday 7.00 AM 4:40 FM 9.67
708120 Thursday 6:45 AM 440 PM 9.92
TI20 Friday 7:00 AM | 12:30 PM | 1:00PM | 4:30 PM 9.00

Additional hours not shown abave - after hours meeting, ec - write total hours in "Net Hrs Worked" column —
Comments: 46.92
e

718120 19.0350) | 99.023 | | Conference call with Dave Fox and Steve St Cyr f_ 1.00")
THOIZ0 19-985 N 93-923 Call with Steve St Cyr and}ony ‘I.Mﬁ

UATime Sheets.xlsx




REDACTED

Signaturer

Week: ?.‘111’20(/ To: NHTIED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, ING, Empl.#: 1955
54 SAWYER AVENUE Name:_John Wiy:?\’ V.
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Cq%.‘ 7

2.0 Date: iy < Day: ime In
TMrzo Saturday
712120 Sunday
TMazo Monday 7:30AM 4:45 PM
TH4r20 Tuesday 7:05AM 4:45 PM
TI1820 Wednesday 7:00 AM 4:45 PM
THERD Thursday 6:55 AM 1:30 PM
iz Friday 7:15AM | 12.30FPM | 1:00FPM | 445 FM
Additional hours not shown above - after hours meeting, etc- write tolal hours in "Net Hrs Worked” column e 2.00
Comments: Tuedsay night reviewing dotuments 46.25

TH¥20

Ti15120 -98 - Work on rate case schedules

TH6I20 - call with Steve St Cyr and Charlie L




REDACTED

Stephen P. St. Cyr & Associates
17 Sky Oaks Drive

Biddeford, Me. 04005

207-423-0215

stephenpstcyr@yahoo.com

August 1, 2020
John Sullivan
Lewis Builders
54 Sawyer Avenue
Atkinson, N. H. 03811
Hampstead Area Water Company

Re: Year End, ROE, Tisdale, Kelly Green, CIAC Tariff, SNHRWIP Financing &
Truck Financing

Fee for professional services rendered July 2020 (see attached detail):

Current Month (17.00 hours @ $140.00 / hour) $2,380.00
Reimbursable Expenses: Copies 0.00
Postage 0.00
Scan / Email 0.00
Tax software fee 0.00
Total Current Month Billing 2,380.00
Payment due upon receipt.

If you have any questions or comments, please call me at 207-423-0215.

Sincerely,

Stephen P. St. Cyr




REDACTED

HAWC 2020 Rate Case {DW 20-xxx)

07/06
07/08
07/09
07/10
0713

07/14

07715

Talk w/John re: conf call; Review/Reply to email re: same

Prep for / Part in conf call re; COS

Review email re: conf call; Review invite; Reply to same

Prepare for / Participate in conf call re: notice, RC sch, test, ete.

Review RFP; Prepare response; Review same; Scan/Email re: same; Review/Reply
to email re: CWIP / proforma exp; Review reply

Review/Reply to email re: CWIPicall; Review CWIP wkst; Review/Reply to email re:
CWIP/eall

Review/Reply to email re: CWIP/call

0.25
0.625
0.25
0.625

0.50
0.125



REDACTED

07/16 Review CWIP; Review sup docs by plant acct; Review pro forma exp; Part in conf call;

Cale CIAC Tax on SMHRWIP; Prepare Other Plant by plant acet; Make pro

forma adj tp RB; Review pro forma rev/exp; Make adj; Add efT tax rate; Add

Inc Tax Calc; Make adj; Add cash working cap to RB; Make adj; Add

SNHRWIP to pro forma LTD; Adj COE; Make adj to RofR info; Add rev;

Prepare prop rev; Prepare email re: RC sch 5.125
07/17  Review RC sch; Prepare email re: same; Review/Reply to John's email re: CIAC Tax;

Allocate CIAC tax to plant; Make RB & 1S adj; Review same; Review reply  3.75
07/22  Review/Reply 1o John's email re: notice; Review Teny®sreply; Review John's reply,

Review RC sch for notice; Reply to emails re: approx. rev amt & % 0.50
07/23  Review email, cover ltr, Itr & notice; Review Charlie’s email; Review Tony’s reply;

Reply to same; Review Co filing of notice 0.50
07124  Review email; Review PUC ack lir; Tdk w/PUC re: RC 0.375
07/27 Review/Reply to email re: conf call wiPUC; Review reply 0.23
07/28 Review/Reply 1o email re: cenf czll wPUC 0.125
07/20  Review/Reply to email re: conf call w/iCo 0.125
Total 4.125

$PSt, Cyr
801720




INVOICE

Lewis Builders Development Inc
54 Sawyer Ave
Atkinson, NH 03811

Invoice Number: 20794
Invoice Date: 08-31-2020

Customer ID: HAWC
Tor Job Location:
HAMPSTEAD AREA WATER CO., INC. Job # 19-9850
54 SAWYER AVE 2020 HAWC Rate Case
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Atkinson, NH
Fixed Asset  No:
Unit of
ltem Description Units Measure Unit Price Amount
1 Work performed during the Month of August 2,301.66
2020
Amount Billed $2,301.66
Retainage Held
Amount Due $2,301.66

DATEDUE: 09-30-2020

A finance charge of 2% per month assessed on all invoices not paid by the due date.

REDACTED



83112020

Job Cost Transaction Report for Labor Burden  0.48
LBD to HAWC Jobs - 8/1/2020 to 8/31/2020 Overhead 0.23
Job #19-9850 2020 HAWC Rate Case
EQ!D Units
01-070 Legal
8/7/2020 L AUGERI;ANTHONY 0.20 24.50
8772020 L SPRATT,LAURAJ 3.00 144 .45
8/14/2020 L SPRATT;LAURAJ 9.50 457.43
8/21/2020 L AUGERIANTHONY 3.60 441.05
8/21/2020 L SPRATT;LAURAJ 8.00 385.20
8/28/2020 L SPRATT,LAURAJ 6.00 288.90
Total - Legal 1,741.53
01-120 Project Manager
8/21/2020 L LANZA;CHARLES P 2.00 350.06
Total - Project Manager 350.06
99-923 Accounting & Management
8/21/2020 L SULLIVAN;JOHN F 2.00 210.07
Total - Accounting & Management 210.07
Sub-Total 2,301.66
Job Total for Last Month 34.30 2,301.66

REDACTED



LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOP MEP‘ZAN

EMPLOYEE #: 140

c 1
54 SAWYER AVENUE &(; / NAME: AnthonyAugsi
ATKINSON, NH 03811 @1 Signaiure: r
WEEK: 07/25/20 A\ _»—"2% 07131120
Date Day Time In Out in Time Qut Comments Waorked
FI2520 Satrcay 0.00
| 7r28120 Sunday 0.00
20 Monday 7.00 A 5.15PM 9.75
7128120 Tuesday | 7:00 AM 4 45PM 9.25 |
7129120 Wednasday | 7.00 AM 430PM 2.00
7130020 Thursday 7:00 AM 5.30PM 10.00
713120 Friday 7:00 AM 445PM 9.25
Additional hours nol shown above: 0.00
Comments: 47.25

Review issues Lo discuss w
meetng paor o meeting w

ith stafl, email (o l2am 10 schedule irlernal

REDACTED



Y d

LEW+A1:1501S BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.
54 SAWYER AVENUE
ATKINSOM, NH 02811

EMPLOYEE #: 140
MAME: Anthony Augeri

PAGE 2

WEEK: 07/25/20

LR

REDACTED



LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC,

ey

EMPLOYEE #: 1931

54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Laura J. Spratt - 4 \ } S
eSS /
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature: /4 — i :
Cé\‘ _ WEEK7/25/20 through _ 07/31i20
Date Day | Timeln Out In Time Out|” Comments Worked
7125120 Salurday | 0.00
7126120 Sunday 0.00
7277120 Monday 7:00 AM 12:00f 12:30om | 4:30 PM 9.00
7028120 Tuesday 7.00 AM 12:00| 12:30pm | 4:30PM 9.00
7025120 | Wednesday | 7:00 AM | 12:C0pm | 12:30pm | 4:30PM 9.00
7130/20 Thursday 7:00 AM | 12:00 PM | 12:30 PM | 4:30PM 9.00
7431120 Friday 7:00 AM [12:00PM | 12:30PM | 4:30 PM 9.00
Additional hours not shown above:
Comments: 4\0 h?‘j \./ 45.00
Discuss with AA. Draft template tab documents and draftindex
07/31720 19-3850/ /101-070  |of rate case

REDACTED



LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, |
54 SAWYER AVENUE
ATKINSON, NH 03811

EMPLOYEE #: 1931
NAME: Laurard, Spra\tf._-
Signature: ,7—T 24« " - 3 s

WEEK p&foy20 -~ U1r§tgh

080720 /]13-0850)

Create new templates for rate case

Work on templates for rate case.

08/07/20

Date Day Time In Out In Time Qut Comments Worked
anzo Saturday 0.00

_8r220 Sunday | | 0.00
B/3r20 Monday 7:00 AM 12:00{ 12:30pm { 4:30 FM 9.00
8420 Tussday | 7:00 AM 12:00] 12:30pm | 4.30PM 9.00
BI5/20 Wednesday | 7:00 AM | 12:00pm | 12:30pm | 4:30FM 9.00
BIEI20 Thursday | 7:00 AM | 12:00 PM | 12:30 PM | 430FM | 9.00
87120 Friday | 7:00 AM [12:00PM | 12:30PM | 4:30 PM 9.00

4’_ / Additional hours not shown above:
Comments: O [ 45.00

REDACTED



LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. EMPLOYEE #: 140
54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Anthany Auger” -
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature: _/,—-,7
WEEK: 08108120 _— 23 08114120
Date Day Time In Out In Time Out I Comments Worked
8/8/20 Saturday - 0.00
8820 Sunday 0.00
1020 Monday 6:30 AM 4.45 PM | 9.75
B/1120 Tuesday 6:45 AM 4.45PM 950
B12720 | Wednesday | 645 AM G:15PM 11.00
8/13°20 Thursday | 7:00 AM 4:30PM 9.00
8114720 Frday 7:00 AM 4:30PM 200
Additional hours not shown above: 0.00
Comments: 4 D 1!'1 If‘?‘3 \/ 48.25

‘aanam (IV\O-QE 50 |D1 070 |Noﬂx on rate case documents including Puc Rule 1604 .01 requirements

Teams meeting with Steve St Cyr, John, and Charlie to review rate case
{! 3 . wark on Puc required documents

REDACTED



REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, ING.
54 SAWYER AVENUE
ATKINSON, NH 02811

EMPLOYEE #: 1931

NAME: Laura <. Spratt
Signature: “or 7w/ /il

a5y A

WEEK 08/08/20 U/ thfough

081020

08114120
Date Day Time In Cut In Time Qut|” Comments Worked

BIE20 Saturday 0.00

8/8/20 Sunday / 0.00

8/10/20 Monday 7:00 AM 12:00] 12:30pm | 4:30 PM 9.00

a/11/20 Tuesday 7.00 AM 12:00] 12:30pm | 4.30FPM out perscnal Vv B.00
&8N0 Wednesday | 7:00 AM | 12:00pm | 12:30pm | 4:30PM 9.00

8/13/20 Thursday | 7:00 AM | 12:00 PM| 12:30PM | 4.30PM 9.00

&8/14720 Friday 7:00 AM |12:00PM 12:30 PM | 430 PM 9.00

Additional hours notshown above:|

Comments:

DBM12/20 1970550 |01 -070  |continue fo work cn rale case templa -ﬁ’



REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DE\"ELGPMENT INC EMPLOYEE #: 1931 ,ﬂ_‘

54 SAWYER AVENUE NANE: Lau;a J&SDr)
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature:

WEEK &81‘,1:!20’ through 08121120

Date Day Time In Out In Time Out Tomments Worked
8/15/20 Saturday 0.00
8116120 Sunday . 0.00
8/17/120 Monday | 7:00 AM 12:00] 12:30pm | 4:30 FM 9.00
8/18/20 Tuesday 7:00 AM 12:00| 12:30pm | 4:30PM 9.00
819720 Wednesday | 7:00 AM | 12:00pm | 12:30pm | 4.30PM 9.00
8/20/20 Thursday | 7:00 AM | 12:00 PM | 12:30 PM | 4:30FM 9.00
B/121/20 Friday 7:00 AM [12:00PM 12:30 PM | 4:30 PM 9.00 /
Additional hours not shown above:
Comments: 4 D @'J' \/' 45.00

Continue to prepare rate case

Finish Rate case templates and seclions __'



REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. Empl. #: 1204
54 SAWYER AVENUE Name: Charlle Lanza -
ATKINSON, HH 03814 i g Signature: 77 o= ——

Week: 08/08520 To: 814/2020

e T T
L) Dale “Comments - .
am02
BerZ020 Suncay
8102020 Maonday B30 AM 112200 PM|  12:30 PM 430 PN _ §.50
81172020 Tuesday 530 AM [12:00 PM] 12:30 FM 430 PN 9.50
8122020  Wednesday 630 AM [ 12:00 PM | 12:30PM 5:00 PM 10.00
&M 372020 Thursday BA0AM [ 1200PM| 1230 PM | 500FN 10.00
B/1472020 Friday B30 AM | 1200 PM| 12:30PM 00PN 8.00
Additional hours not shown above - sfter hours meetng, elc - wnte total hours in “Het Hrs Warkes IS, emails r— 200
Comments: 4900

HAWL Rale Case D

CL Time Sheet 06-08 1o 08-14.xlsx



LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.
54 SAWYER AVENUE
ATKINSON, NH 03811

Empl. #: 10855

_;Data;

B/R20
8/9120
8raor0
81120
8/12/20
Mo
8114120

Y. L
BM4/20 19-98- Meeting to review HAWC rate case .@

Day
Saturday
Sunday
Monday
Tuesday
Wednesday
Thursday
Friday

Comments:

Name: Johnsutivan s /¥
Signature: %4
Week: BIBI20 j/; To: 8114120

DreocZylunch? . Lunchi? i i “Net Hrs:
Timeln .-~ Out™" In ° . Time Qut ‘.- Comments ;. " Worked
0.00

0.00

7:30 AN 4:55 PM 9.42
7:30 AM 4:30 PN 9.00
7:10 Al 4:40 PM 9.50
7:05 AM | 4:50Pm 975

7:05 AM_| 12:00 PM | 1230 PM | 4:30 PM 8.92
Additional hours not shown above - after hours meeting, etc - wiite total hours in "Nel Hrs Worked" column — |
46.59

REDACTED



REDACTED

Stephen P, St. Cyr & Associates
17 Sky Oaks Drive

Biddeford, Me. 04005

207-423-0215

stephenpstcyr@yahoo.com

September 7, 2020
John Sullivan
Lewis Builders
54 Sawyer Avenue
Atkinson, N, H. 03811
Hampstead Area Water Company

Re: Year End, ROE, Tisdale, Kelly Green, CIAC Tariff, SNHRWIP Financing &
Truck Financing

Fee for professional services rendered August 2020 (see attached detail):

Current Month (17.875 hours @ $140.00 / hour) $2,502.50
Reimbursable Expenses: Copies 0.00
Postage 0.00
Scan / Email 0.00
Tax software fee 0.00
Total Current Month Billing $2,502.50
Payment due upon receipt.

If you have any questions or comments, please call me at 207-423-0215.

Sincerely,

Stephen P. St. Cyr




REDACTED

Date Description ice Hourg




REDACTED

HAWC 2020 Rate Case (DW 20-117)
08/13  Review email; Review OCA ltr re: part; Review email re: COS study; Review email re:
video conf w/PUC Staff; Review/Reply to email re: video conf; Review PUC

webex invitation 0.5625
0R/14  Prep for video confi Review RC sch; Part in in conf; Review 1604 req; Review hookup
fee; Review cert sch 1.50
08/17 Review/Reply to email re: Pennichuck/ QCPAC; Review DW 19-035; Review email re; I
831 draft agenda; Review agenda; Review email re: COS study 0.75 |
08/18  Review reply re: COS study 0.125
08/24  Prepare email re: 2019 wages & benefits, legal exp., ete. Talk wilohn re: same; Review
email; Review emp rep 0.375
08/25 Review emp rep; Reply to email; Review email re: 2020 pross pay; Review sup sch;
Review email re: COS; Review John's reply 0.875
08/26  Prepare for & part in conf call re: PUC conf call 2.00

08/27  Review/Reply to email re: video conf w/PWW re: QCPAC; Review email re: mgmt fee;
Review mgmit fee cale; Review email re: COS; Review email re: COS rate scen; 0.50
08/28  Prep for video conf w/PEU; Review Sum of PUC order; Review PUC order; Part in conf
call; Review email re: COS; Review reply; Review email re: video conf on COS;
Reply to same; Review email on agenda for PUC video conf: Reply to same;
Review email re: stat being shut down; Review Charlie's reply 215
08/31 eview email re; selling water to Plaisiow; Review John's email re: stat being shut down;
Review updated NBV net of CIAC; Prep for / Part in video conf w/FUC; Review
email re: revised COS sch; Review John®s reply re: fire prot; Review var emails
re: same 2,437
Total 11.87.

SPSt. Cyr
907720




REDACTED

INVOICE

Lewis Builders Development Inc Invoice Number: 20875

54 Sawyer Ave Invoice Date: 09-30-2020

Atkinson, NH 03811

Customer ID: HAWC
To: Job Location:

HAMPSTEAD AREA WATER CO,, INC. Job # 19-9850

54 SAWYER AVE 2020 HAWC Rate Case

ATKINSON, NH 03811 Atkinson, NH

Fixed Asset  No:
Unit of

Item  Description Units Measure Unit Price Amount
1 Work Performed during the Month of 8,032.58

September 2020

Amount Billed $8,032.58
Retainage Held
Amount Due $8,032.58

DATE DUE: 10-30-2020

A finance charge of 2% per month assessed on all invoices not paid by the due date.




REDACTED

101172020

01-070
9/4/2020
9/11/2020
9/11/2020
8/18/2020
9/18/2020
9/25/2020
9/25/2020

01-120
9/4/2020
9/11/2020
9/18/2020
9/25/2020

99-923
9/4/2020
9/11/2020
9/18/2020
9/25/2020

Job Cost Transaction Report for
LBD to HAWC Jobs - 9/1/2020 to 9/30/2020

Job # 19-9850 2020 HAWC Rate Case

Legal
AUGERLANTHONY
AUGERI,ANTHONY
SPRATT;LAURAJ
AUGERI,ANTHONY
SPRATT;LAURA J
AUGERLANTHONY
SPRATT;LAURAJ
Total - Legal

rrrereee

Project Manager
LANZA;CHARLES P
LANZA;CHARLES P
LANZA;CHARLES P
LANZA;CHARLES P
Total - Project Manager

Accounting & Management
SULLIVAN;JOHN F
SULLIVAN;JOHN F
SULLIVAN;JOHN F
SULLIVAN;JOHN F
Total - Accounting & Management

-

rerrr

Sub-Total

Job Total for Last Month

EQID

Labor Burden 0.48

Overhead 0.23
Units
220 269.53
8.40 1,029.11
1.00 48.15
3.80 477.80
2.50 120.38
8.20 1,004.61
0.50 24.08
2,973.66
3.00 525.11
4.50 787.65
1.00 175.03
4.50 787.65
2,275.44
5.00 525.19
2.00 210.07
3.00 315.11
16.50 1,733.11
2,783.48
8,032.58
66.20 8,032.58




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. EMPLOYEE #: 140
54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Anthony Augerl |
ATKINSON, HH 03311 Slignature: ~ 4 ‘,-.,7 k! |
WEEK: 08/2220 23 CB/28/20 |
Date Day Jima In Out In Tmeout] 7 Cdmments Worked |
/22720 Saturday ] 7 0.m .
w2320 Sunday - 0,00
824720 Monday B.45 AM 4:30 PM 5.00
BIZ50 | Tuesday | 6:45AM 5:30 PM 10.25
B/26/20 | Wednesday | 6:45 AM 4:30 FM 925
a2720 Thursday 7:00 AM 515 PM 9.75
B/28/20 Friday 7:00 AM 515 PM 975
Additional hours not shown above: 0.00 /
Comments: JTO lﬂg‘r\/ 48.00

Prepare far and attend rate case mesting will Sieve L LY 10 preparg
for meeting with Staff August 31




REDACTED

LEW+AT:I150iS BUILDERS DEVELOFPMENT, INC. EMPLOYEE #: 140 PAGE 2
S4SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Anthony Auger

ATKINSON, NH 03811

WEEK: 08/22/20 DE/2E/20




REDACTED

‘\‘- ;
LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, IN MPLOYEE#: 140
54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Anthony.Auger ;
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature: 71y oy
WEEK: 08/28/20,/ 23 08/04/20
Dats | Day | Timeln Qut Time Out | { \Comments Warksd
820R0 Saturday 7 000
23020 Sunday L 000
&3120 Monday B:45 AM 5.00 PFM 10.75
8150 Tuesday 7:00 AM 5:00PM 10.50
492120 Wednesday | 645 AM 4:30 PM 9.25
D320 Thurscay 7:00 AM 5:15 PM 975
8/4/20 Friday 7.00 AM »4:30 PM 9.00
Additionzl hours not shown above: 0.00
Comments: 40 h e, 49.25
08/31120 19-5850 01-070 Work on pelition and required exhibits for rate case filing | (2 3
ﬁ { Review PUC administrative nies and statutes for rate cases and prepare ( R ‘}
08/01/20 18-3850 01-070 lah template fof upcoming rate case 36




REDACTED

LEW+AL:IS0IS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.

EMPLOYEE #: 140 PAGE 2
54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Anthony Auger
ATKINSON, NH 03811 !
WEEK: 08/29120 o 09/04120

‘Work on rate case documents required by Pue nules




LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, |NC>
54 SAWYER AVENUE
ATKINSON, NH 03811

MPLOYEE #: 1931

NAME: LaurAd. Spr
Signature: | 7 —T&£73 a,n%§_

03/04/20

i i
03/04/20 'ﬁ 19-9850 . 01-070 Review rale case and prepare redling tariff and cover letter m

WEEK 08/29/200 7 through
Date Day Timeln | Out In Tima Out| Comments Worked
B/29/20 | Saturday 0.00
8130720 Sunday 0.00
B/31720 Manday 7:00 AM 12:00| 12:30pm | 4:30 PM 9.00
81720 Tuesday | 7:00 AN 12:00] 12:30pm | 4:30PM 9.00
/220 Wednesday | 7:00 AM | 12:00pm | 12:30pm | 4:30PM 900
84320 Thursday | 7:00 AM | 12:00 PM| 12:30 PM"| 4:30 PM 9.00
14120 Friday 7:00 AM |12:00PM [ 12:30.PM | 4:30 PM 9.00
.d-- \/ Additional hours not shown abova:
] ¥ 00

REDACTED




REDACTED

LEWS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. EMPLOYEE #: 140
54 SAWYER AVENUE C NAME: AnthonyAdger|
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature: ~ 7 , ——— v
WEEK: 09/05120 /7 23 0911720
Data Day Time In Dut In TimeOut| .  Comments Worked
/520 Saturday v 0.00
Q620 Sunday 0.00
TR0 Monday 7:00 AM 430 PM , Labor Day Holiday 8.00 |
S840 Tuesday | 7.00 AM 530 PM i 10.00 |
2/8720 Wednesday | 7:00 AM 430PM |V 2 hours vacaton time 9.00 [
1020 Thursday | 6:45 AM 5.15 PM 9.75
211720 Friday 7.00 AM 500 PM . 9.50
Additonal hours not shown above: 0.00
Cemments: 4725

m- Work on rate case fiing inciuding review of puc nies to ensure
‘ 0 01070 i

Waork an rate case documents

Work on lariff revisions to file with rate case and draft nseh lest:mony
lor Steve




REDACTED

- e e e b it v

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT., INC EMPLOYEE #: 1931 /it\‘

54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Laura J..Spratt ]

ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature; . -

- WEEK 03/05/20 / .- through~ - 09/11/20

Date Day Time In Out In__ |Time Qut| ¥ “ Comments Worked
9/5R20 Salurday 0.00
9/6rz0 Sunday 0.00
9o Mecnday | 7.00 AM 12:00] 12:30pm | 4:30 PM 9.00
9/820 Tuesday | 7:00 AM 12:00] 12:30pm | 4:30PM 9.00
5/8r20 Wednesday | 7:00 AM | 12:00pm | 12:30pm | 4:30PM 9.00
9/10/20 Thursday | 7:00 AM | 12:00 PM| 12:30PM | 4:30PM | 9.00
91120 Friday 7:00 AM 112:00PM | 12230PM | 4:30 PM 9.00
i Additional hours not shewn above:
Comments: ] 45,00

("’ -y work on HAWG tanff and updatz it with most recent and 1
09/09720 119-9850 01-070 compare with tariff on PUC website 2.5




REDACTED

e = - e s ki e i g g e L g —

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. EMPLOYEE #: 140

54 SAWYER AVENUE : NAME: Anthuqu—/ #

ATKINEON, NH 02811 Signature:

WEEK: 081220 /.~ 23 03118120
Date Day Time in Out In Time Out | epts Worked
8112720 Ssaturday J 0.00
8120 Sunday A 0.00
SM4R0 Monday 7.00 AN 500 PM ol 9.50
81520 Tuesday 7.00 AM 515 PM a.75
I16A0 | Wednesday | 6:45 AM 5.00 PM Fa 975
1720 Thursday 7:00 AM 5:00 PM P 9.50
918720 Friday 7:00 AM 4:30 PM vacation day \/ 9.00
Additienal hours net shown above:| 0m
Coamments: 47.50

owrenn (0.0850) 01070 |Revise rate case peition and review Steve's schedues

Emailto Chns Tuomala to request 3 week time exiension 1o file (ale case

1(1.2

Revise Steve's prefiled testimony and organize schedules to malch tab
oarro _ ({Fa.0ss0 01070 farmat staff requires for the entire rate case submission &:E
0.2




REDACTED

[—— : e e g e % e

H

L LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. EMPLOYEE #: 1931 i

! 54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Laura J. Spr. i i} ’

| TKINSON, NH 03611 Signature? /4

| WEEK (RI05120// / through  09/11/20

| Date Day Time In Out In Time Qut Comments Worked

g 8/12/20 | Salurday | 0.00

I 0/13720 Sunday 0.00

i /14120 Monday | 7:00 AM 12:00] 12:300m | 430 PM 3.00

i 15720 Tuesday 7:00 AW 12:00} 12:3Cpm | 4;30FPM 9.00
9/15/20 Wednesday | 7:00 AM | 1 2:00pm | 42:3Cpm | 4:30PM 2.00
9/17/20 Thursday | 7:00 AM [ 12:00 PM| 12:30 PM | 4:30 PM 9.00
911820 Fnday 7:00 AM |12:00PM | 12:30 P4 4:30 PM 9.00

Additional hours not shown above:
Comments: ‘%O ’f\n“ﬂ \/

_ -
091820 M prepare draft moticn to withdraw m




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. Empl. #: 1204
54 SAWYER AVENUE Name: Chaglie Lanza
ATKINSOM, NH 03811 s:gnauro:ﬂ_,ﬁ/
S =y
Woek: 08115120 To: 22112020 |
. - il
D SRE] 11\ SRR o Time Out < l
BNS2000 Saturday A | |
BHE2020 Sunday HiA _ 1 | |
BN72000 Menday 5:30 AM [ 12:00PM | J0PM | 4:30PM 9.50
B/ /2010 Tuesday B30 AM | 12:00 PM | 1230 FI 0OFM 8.00
BMS2000 Wednesday 5:30 AM | 12:00 PM -30 P 4:30 FM 9.50
B202020 Thursday G0 AM | 12200PM | 1230FM | 430PM 9.50
BR112000 . Fnday 6:20 AM J00PM 8.50
Additional hours net shown above - afler hours meeing, elc - wile tolal hours an “Net Hrs Worke rEsc, amal = 300
Comments: 48.00

| Feosso) o120 ) [Discuss WICA with Ponnichuck R

CL Time Sheet 08-22 1o 03-28.xdsx




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. Empl. #: 1204
54 SAWYER AVENUE Nama: Charia Lapza .~
ATHINSON, NH 03811 Slignature: ~ . /
Week: 08r29/20 To: S/4I2020
w S i TimeOut T
Saturday WA
Sunday A
Monday | 630 AM | 1200PM| 1230 PM | 4.30PM 9.50
Tuesday 630 AM | 1200 PM | 1230 PM_| 4 30FM 950
Wednesday 630 AM [ 1200 PN 30 PM_| 430PM 950
Thursday A | 1200 PN 30 P DOPM 1000
9472020 Friday :30 AN | 12200 PM 30 P | 400 PM
Additional hours. nct shown above -after hours meetng, elc - whle haurs m “Net Hrs Wor

L (fwassg) Joii2 [ ReweCase oy | |

CL Time Sheet 09-29 o 09-04 xlsx




LEMS EUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.
54 SAWYER AVENUE

ATKINSON, NH 02811

Empl. &;
Hame:

REDACTED

1204

Charlie Lanza -~

Signature: ¢ . L=

Comments:

"1s-9850 01-120 | |RevewRate Case Pro-Formas S ™ | ]

CL Time Sheet 03-05 to 05-11.dsx

Weak: 08/05/20 To: 811112020
-2 e ~bunch- ;. Luneh:e v an a3 “ * Net Hrs
a'Date . Out'r " in Time Out A L YWorked
W52020 '
L8200
872010 1200PM| 1230 FPM | 3:30PM 8.00
282020 1200 FPM| 1230 PM 4.30PM 9.50
99/2020 1200PM| 1230PM | 430FPM 2.50
o020 Thasday 630 AM | 12:00 #M 12:30 FM 430 FM 9.50
BM12020 Friday B:I0AM [1200PM| 1230 PM 4:30PM 9.50
Additional hours not shown above - afier hours meeung, €ic - wiTle [olal DoWs in - Nel Fes Worke HSC. ey o 2.00 |




REDACTED

LEWIS BULDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. Empl. #: 1204
54 SAWYER AVENUE Nama: Charlis Lanza e
ATKINSON, NH D381 Signature: ¢ e e
Week: L8270 To: 8182020
3 DA e oay s, - LUDEH Lunch -+ LN S L e g i
.. Date s Tmeln T Outi- - in s TimeOut . - - - Comments © . - -
: 8122020 Saluday  NA
| #132020 Sunday MNA i
' 8142020 Maonday A45AM | 1200PM| 12-30 PM 4:30 PM 8.25
91152020 Tuesday 645 AM [ 1200 PM| 12:30FM | 430 PM
BMA2020 Wednesday TOOAM [1200PK| 12:30PM | 3:90 PM
an72020 Thursday TOOAM J1200PM| 12230PM | 3:30PM
882020 Fricay BOOAM |1200PM| 12:30PM [ 4:30PM
H Additional hours not shown above - after hours meeting, eic - write tatal hours o " Met Hrs WWorkes mesc. emaly —
: Comments:

CL Time Sheet 03-12 to 03-18.xisx




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.

54 SAWYER AVENUE
ATKINSON, NH 03811

Empl. #: 1955

. ame: Jofin Sullpah /2
CNQ‘U,% Sl'gnr:ture: %@
Week: ﬁ : S

8122120

A
Saturday
Sunday
Monday 7:00 AM 4:40 PM
Tuesday 710 AM 4:55 PM
8126120 Wednesday 7:00 AM 5:35 PM
8127120 Thursday 7:30 AM 4:45 PM
826720 Friday G:50AM | 12.00PM | 1230 FM | 4:35 PM
Additional hours not shown above - after hours meeting, etc - write tatal hours in "Net Hrs Worked™ column — o .
Comments: 48.50

|
|
|
|

Review rate case documents

8128120 m- Prepare for meeting with PUC —— m




1

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.

Gl

54 SAWYER AVENUE
ATKINSON, NH 03811

REDACTED

Empl. #: 1955

NameTJohmrSullivanZ /0
signatMv% '

[~

Week: 825120 #// Tdo: /4120
T aarieniriocbunchy CLUnERIY ;P st .1 NetHrs
Da CTimelnv. . Out < ° lInt . TimeOut: " . ‘Worked
séﬁga} X e it T oo0
Sunday 12:00 PA 2:00 PM 200
Manday 7:25AM | 12:00PM | 1230 PM | 4:40 PM 8.75
Tuesday 7.05 AM 520 PM 10.25
Wednesday 7:05 AM 4.30 PM 9.42
320 Thursday 7.00AM | 12.00PM | 1230 PM | 4:30 PM 9.00
Ql4r20 Friday 7:20AM | 12:00PM | 1230 FM | 4:30 PM -4

Additional hours nct shown above - after hours meeting, el - write total hours in “Net Hrs Worked™ column

Comments:

48.0%

- 19-9850

Conference call with PUC staff




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. Ermpl. #: 1955
' 54 SAWYER AVENUE / Name: John Sullivan /7 37" )
| ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature: &
: Week: 9/5/20 To: gH120
T Sy Lunch 1 Lunch +.:Net Hrs
g Day ; TimeIn7:' " Qut'” - i il Cor 1 =7 Worked
9/520 " Saturday 0.00
/620 Sunday 12:00 PM 2:.00 PM | 2,00
81720 Monday 8.00 AM 4:00 PM holiday 8.00
8/8/20 Tuesday 7:10 AM 4:55 PM 9.75
919120 Wednesday 7A0AM | 11:30AM | 1200 PM | 4:55 PM B.75
91020 Thursday T:15AM 4:40 PM 9.42
an120 Friday 7:30AM | 12:00PM | 12:30 PM | 4:35 PM .58
Additional hours nct shown above - after hours meeting, etc - wrte tctal hours in "Net Hrs Worked” column — 1.75
Comments: Tuesday night 48.25

911120 - - Work on HAWC 1604.01 jtems




LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. Empl. #: 1955
54 SAWYER AVENUE Name: dohn Suilivan
ATKINSON, NH 03811 w}. Signature: 7 %
u Week: 912120 o7  snam
B T N TTLT ety WTT T N B
;. Day < Timeln-® o Qub " - dn- " Time Qut v o
Saturday
Sunday
911420 Menday 7:35AM | 11:30AM | 1200 PM | 4:30 PM
911520 Tuesday 7:10 AM 4:40 PM
91620 Wednesday 7:00 AM 1:15PM
91920 Thursday 7:20AM | 11:00AM | 1130 AM | 4:00 PM
911820 Friday T00AM | 12:00PM | 1230 PM | 4:40 PM
Additional hours net shown above - after hours meeting, etc - wrte tetal hours in "Net Hrs Worked” column vt x
Comments: 41.51

614120 9-9850 HAWC rate case schedules '

HAWC rate case meetings and schedules

HAWE rate case meetings and schedules

917120 (99850 m- HAWEC Financial statements @

Lo | @od [ | | remcrmsae (@)

REDACTED




REDACTED

INVOICE

Lewis Builders Development Inc Invoice Number: 20905

54 Sawyer Ave Invoice Date: 09-30-2020

Atkinson, NH 03811

Customer ID: HAWC
To Job Location:

HAMPSTEAD AREA WATER CO.,, INC. Job # 19-9850

54 SAWYER AVE 2020 HAWC Rate Case

ATKINSON, NH 03811 Atkinson, NH

Fixed Asset No:
Unit of

Itern Description Units Measure Unit Price Amount
1 Work Performed during the Month of 105.04

September 2020

Amount Billed $105.04

Retainage Held

Amount Due $105.04
DATE DUE: 10-30-2020

A finance charge of 2% per month assessed on all invoices not paid by the due date.




REDACTED

A0 9405

Job Cost Transaction Report for Labor Burden  0.48
LBD to HAWC Jobs - September Overhead 0.23

10/9/2020

Job # {9-9850 020 HAWC Rate Case

EQID Units
01-070 Legal
9/4/2020 L AUGERI,ANTHONY 2.20 269.53
9/11/2020 L AUGERIANTHONY 8.40 1,028.11
9/11/2020 L SPRATT,LAURAJ 1.00 48.15
9/18/2020 L AUGERIANTHONY 3.90 477.80
9/18/2020 L SPRATT,LAURA J 2,50 120.38
8/25/2020 L AUGERIANTHONY 8.20 1,004.61
89/25/2020 L SPRATT;LAURA J 0.50 24,08
Total - Legal w
01-120 Project Manager
9/4/2020 L LANZA;CHARLES P 3.00 525.11
9112020 L LANZA;,CHARLES P 4.50 787.65
9/18/2020 L LANZA;,CHARLES P 1.00 175.03
9/25/2020 L LANZA;CHARLES P 4.50 787.65
Total - Project Manager m
99.923 Accounting & Management
9/4/2020 L SULLIVAN;JOHN F 5.00 525.19
9/11/2020 L SULLIVAN;JOHN F 2.00 210.07
9/18/2020 L SULLIVAN;JOHN F 3.00 315.11
9/25/2020 L SULLIVAN;JOHN F 16.50 1,7
9/4/2020 L SULLIVAN;JOHN F 'E‘LOD) 5105.04 )
Total - Accounting & Management 2,888.52
Sub-Total 8,137.62
Job Total for Last Month 67.20 8,137.62

—5032. 53



REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. Empl, #: 1955

! 54 SAWYER AVENUE Name: Joia Sulign /7 ‘
i1 ATKINSON, NH 03811 Cﬁ}ﬁ‘w Signature %ﬂﬁ /

i : .
| Week: 8122120 ﬁa: < smmzo
|

l 823720 Sunday
i 8124720 Monday |_7:00 AM 4:40 PM .67
| 82520 Tuesday | T:10AM 4:55 PM 9.75
Bi2620 Wednesday 7:00 AM 5:35 PM 10.58
8/27/20 Thursday 7:30 AM 4:45 PM 9.25
8/28120 Friday 6:50AM | 12:00 PM | 12:30 FM | 4:35PM 9.25

Additional hours not shown above - after hours meeting, ets - wite total hours in "Net Hrs Worked™ colurmn o

Comments: 48.50

BZT(Z0 - g Review Cost of Service study




REDACTED

Stephen P. St. Cyr & Associates
17 Sky Oaks Drive

Biddeford, Me. 04005

207-423-0215

stephenpstcyr@yahoo.com
October 4, 2020

John Sullivan

Lewis Builders

54 Sawyer Avenue
Atkinson, N. H. 03811

Hampstead Area Water Company

Re: Year End, ROE, Tisdale, Kelly Green, CIAC Tariff, SNHRWIP Financing &
Truck Financing

Fee for professional services rendered August 2020 (see attached detail):

Current Month (27.25 hours @ $140.00 / hour) $3,815.00
Reimbursable Expenses: Copies 0.00
Postage 0.00
Scan / Email 0.00
Tax software fee 0.00
Total Current Month Billing $3.815.00
Payment due upon receipt.

If you have any questions or comments, please call me at 207-423-0215.

Sincerely,

Stephen P. St. Cyr




REDACTED

HAWC 2020 Rate Case (DW 20-117)

(9/01 Review Tony's email re: RC filing date 0123
(9/02 Review var emails re: COS; Revisw COS Analysis; Prepare email re: Team mtz; Review
RC sch; Review payroll data; Prepare payroll pro forma; Cale pay tax pro forma;
Review legal & acct exp assoc wiCIAC tax; Cale pro forma; Prepar email re:
same; Review NBV net of CIAC w/shutter pump stat; Reply to email re: same;
Prepare email re: prop rec; Review/Reply to email re: M&S/rec period; Part in
Team mtg w/Raftelis re: COS Analysis; Review cap struct; Prepare email re:
same 4.75
09/03  Review John's email re: APIC; Review Chris” ltr re: APIC commitment; Reply to same;
Review John's email re: wages & ben; Talk w/lohn re: same; Review/Reply to
Chris' email re: APIC; Reply to Chris' email re: APIC/adder; Review/Reply to

email re: add’l rev 0.75
09/04 Review/Reply to Chris® email re: APIC/rofr: Review John's email re: same 0.375
09/14  Review/Reply to email re: team meg; Talk w/Tony re: same 0.25

09/15  Review RC sch; Review benefits data; Prepare benefits sch; Prepare pro forma; Preparc
mgmt agr pro forma; Prepare % depr pro forma, Prepare ¥ amort of CIAC pro
forma; Prepare ret plant pro forma; Prepare misc def dr pro forma; Prepare email
re: 2020 adds; Review John's reply; Review Charlie’s reply; Review notes re:
benefits; Recalc benefits for new emp; Particpate in Team mig re: RC; Review
email re: pur po, Calc pur po pro forma; Prepare email re: same; Review
Charlie's reply 8.00

09/16  Review ben pro forma; Prepare emailre; same; Review John's reply; Review Charlie’s



09/17

09/18

09/19

09721
09/22
0523

09/24
09729

09/30
Total

Reply re: pur po; Cont cale pur po pro forma adj; Prepare sum; Prepare email re:

same; Revizw/Reply to John’s email; Review Charlie's reply; Eliminate other

plant; Update RC sch; Review CIAC; Review CIAC tax; Consider def tax exp &

ADIT; Prepare ¢email re; RC sch 2.50
Review CIAC; Review CIAC tax; Review def tax related to CIAC; Cale same; Prepare

email re: same; Review pur po data; Prepare email re: same; Conduct “final™

review of RC sch; Adj LTD bal for CIAC loan; Review email re: pur po;

Review pur po date re: Angle Pond 225
Review/Reply var emails re: ext; Update pur po sch; Prepare email re: same; Review/

Reply to email re: same; Review calc of deftax re CIAC tax; Revise for ¥4 amort;

Prepare email; review/Reply to email Update RC sch for pur po; Prepare email re:

same; Review test 3
Review Tony's email re: PUC/1 week ext; Review John's reply; Review PUC ltr re: std;

Reply to same; Review John's reply 0.50
Talk w/Tony re: ext/withdrawal; Review cover Itr; Review motion to withdraw 0.50
Review PUC email; Review PUC ltr re: motion to withdraw 0.125

Review/Reply to email re: Team mtg; Review email re: notice; Review filing; Provide
Tony w/amt & % inc for notice; Talk w/PUC re: deftax on CIAC; Prepare email
re: same: Talk w/John re: APIC: Review cap struc: Cale APIC required to reach
35% equity; Prepare email re: same 1.1875

Review cmail re: Team mtg 0.0625

Review emails re: filing dates; Prep for and part in Team mtg re: MSDC fee, WICA,
temp rates, COS, etc.; Review PWW tariff for MSDC; Review Aquarium tariff
for WICA; Prepare ¢mail to Dave re: RC sch

Review/Reply to email re: APIC; Review email re: pub fire prot rate; Review reply

wh

1.87
0.25

26.5

=

SPSt. Cyr
10/04120

REDACTED




REDACTED

INVOICE

Lewis Builders Development Inc
54 Sawyer Ave
Atkinson, NH 03811

To:
HAMPSTEAD AREA WATER CO., INC.
54 SAWYER AVE
ATKINSON, NH 03811

Invoice Number: 21016
Invoice Date: 10-31-2020

Customer ID: HAWC

Job Location:

Job # 19-9850
2020 HAWC Rate Case
Atkinson, NH

Fixed Asset  No:

ltem Descriptiol

1 Work Performed during the Month of October
2020

Unit of
Units Measure Unit Price Amount
2,209.34
Amount Billed $2,209.34
Retainage Held
Amount Due $2,209.34
DATEDUE: 11-30-2020
d on all invoices not paid by the due date.

_ Afinance charge of 2% per month




REDACTED

11/3/2020

01-070
10/2/2020
10/8/2020
10/2/2020

10/23/2020
10/30/2020

01-120
10/8/2020
10/23/2020
10/30/2020

99-923
10/9/2020
10/30/2020

Job Cost Transaction Report for

LBD to HAWC Jobs - 10/1/2020 to 10/31/2020

Job # 19-9850 2020 HAWC Rate Case

Legal
AUGERLANTHONY
AUGERI;ANTHONY
SPRATT;LAURAJ
AUGERI;ANTHONY
AUGERKANTHONY
Total - Legal

ol o ol el

Project Manager
L LANZA;CHARLES P
L LANZA;CHARLES P
L LANZA;CHARLES P

Total - Project Manager

Accounting & Management
L SULLIVAN;JOHN F
L SULLIVAN;JOHN F

’ Total - Accounting & Management

Sub-Total

Job Total for Last Month

E

1D

Labor Burden 0.48

Overhead 0.23
Units
0.80 98.01
2,80 343.04
1.50 7222
2.10 257.28
260 318.53
108908
1.00 175.03
2.00 350.06
1.00 175.03
700.12
2.00 210.07
2.00 210.07
420.14
2,209.34

17.80 2,209.34




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, IN

Ge(

EMPLOYEE #: 140

54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Anthony Auge
ATKINSOM, NH 03811 Signature: T /
WEEK: 09/1%/20 ) 23 032520
Data Day [ Timein Out In Time Out Comnients/ Worked
2148”0 Saturday | . 7 7 0.C0
82020 Sunday | ! rd 0.00
82120 Monday | 7:00 AM 500 FM 8.50
82220 Tuesday 7:00 AM 515 PM 9.75
92320 | Wednesda 6:45 AM 500 PM 9.75
8r24120 Thursday 7:00 AM 4:30PM 9.C0
B2520 Friday 7.00 AM 5.00 PM 9.50
Additional hours not shown above: 0.00
Comments: 40 ﬂ,\/ 7.80

N 3 1 Frepare and fife motion o withdraw netice of intent to file rate schedules
0921720 l@, l01-c70  |and prepare new netice




REDACTED

LEW+A1:150iS BUILDERS DEVELOFMENT, INC,

54 SAWYER AVENUE
ATKINSON, NH 03811

EMPLOYEE#: 140
NAME: Anthony Augeri

PAGE2

WEEK: 09/19/20

08/25/20




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. EMPLOYEE #: 140

S4SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Anthony Aug {
ATHINSOM, HH 03841 Signature: 7 _,.. '/E '
WEEK: 03726207 23 00220
Data Day Time In Out - In Time Out nts Warked
GrRE20 Saturday _Jﬂ-&%e—— 0.00
| 927720 | . Sunday / 0.00
2820 Monday 7.00 AM 500 PM 9.5
82920 Tuesday 7.00 AM 515 PM 9.75
930720 | Wednesday | 7:00 AM 445 PM 7 9.25
1041720 Thursday 7:00 AM 4:30 PM Personal day v s 5.00
107220 Friday 7:00 AM 4:30 PM . Personalday 9.00
Additional hours not shown above: 0.00
Comments: | 46.50

flgfsﬁr#ﬁ
1/

Teams meeting with John, Steve, Charlie and Harold to discuss rate
01070 case, tamporary rates, WICA, and MSDC charges

Work on rate case submissions including review of WICA filed by
Pennichuck




REDACTED

* e mE s e g

LEWIS EUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. EMPLOYEE #: 1931
54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: TauraJ, Spratt
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature:
WEEK 09/26/20 through 10/2120
Datg Day Time In Qut In Time Out Comments Worked
f26/20 Saturday .00
27120 Sunday 0.00
128120 Monday 7:00 AM 12:00} 12:30pm | 4:30 PM 9.00
9129120 Tuesday | 7.00 AM 12:00f 12:30pm | 4:30PM 500
913020 Wednesday | 7.00 AM | 12:00pm | 12:30pm | 4:30PM | 9.00
101720 Thursday | 7:00 AM [ 12:00 PM| 12:30 PM | 4:20 PM | 9.00
1012720 Friday 7.00 AM [12:00PM | 12:30PM 1:00 PM forced to leave | 6.00
Additlonal hours not shown abnve:[
Camments: 42.00

Prepare notice of intent to PUC. Scan and email NOI out te
PUG.

|a-1806 k2

gt SRl L SILUNY.
Update and prepare affidavit of publicaticn and cover letter.
09/3020 X m 01-070 cover letter, publication and screen shot with PUC




REDACTED

TOTAL

42,0

LEW+A1:1501S BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.
54 SAWYER AVENUE
ATKINSONM, NH 03814

EMPLOYEE #: 1931
NAME: Laura J. Spratt

PAGE 2




REDACTED

A
'

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.

EMPLOYEE #: 140

54 SAWYER AVENUE Cﬁ*\\‘M NAME: Anhery Auger
ATKINSON, NH 03811 | Signature: e,
WEEK: 10!10!20/ 23 10116120
Data Da Time In Out In Time Out /\=Eomments Worked
1010720 Saturday - 0.00
-1V1120 | - Sunday 0.00
10/12/20 Monday | 7.00 AM 5.15 PM 9.73
1011320 Tuesday 7.00 AM 515PM 9.75
10114720 | Vednesday | 6:00 AM 4:45 PM 10.25
1520 Thureday | 7:00 AM 3:30 PM 1 hour personal tme ¥ .00
1620 Friday | 7:00 AM 1:30PM | 3 hours personal bme ¥ 9.00
Additional hours not shown above: 0.00
Comments: 47.15

—
11220 (|19-68567, lo-aro




LEW+A1:1501S BUILDERS DEVELOFMENT, INC,
E4 SAWYER AVENUE
ATKINSON, HH 03811

EMPLOYEE #: 140
NAME: Anthony Augarl

PAGEZ

WEEK: 10/10/20

REDACTED




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC, EMPLOYEE #: 140

54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Anthony. .augery'

ATKINSON, NH 03811 CD Signature: f oy -

. WEEK: 1017120 /{__— 23 10123120
Data Day Time in Qut In Time Out | Commuovits Worked
11720 Saturday | 0.00
10/1820 Sunday 0.00
101820 Monday 7.00 AM (15 PM 2 9.75
12020 Tuesday 6:45 AM :30 PM ¥ 10.95
1072120 | W day | 6:45 AM 15 PM / 10.00
10/22r20 | Thurscay | 7:00 AM 4:30 PM 2 hours personal time ¥ 9.00
12320 Fnday 7:00 AM 5:00 PM i 9.50
Additionzl hours not shown above:| 0.00
Comments: 48.£0

=
9850 01-070 Work on taiiff changes. and rata ease petilion” m'

] =
M’ Work on draft company testimony and exhibit tabs for petition ﬂ'



LEVY+A1:1501S BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.
54 SAWYER AVENUE
ATKINSON, NH 03811

REDACTED

EMPLOYEE #: 140
NAME: Anthony Augerl

PAGE 2

WEEK: 10M7/Z20

1IZNZI0




REDACTED

LEW1S BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. Empl #; 1204

54 SAWYER AVENUE Name; Charlie Lanza

ATKINSON, NH 03811 Slonature: L ew—t—:

Weaok: 0926720 To: 100272020

o R T X T X T e S P e T wr ey e NetHee
Y1 Data 5 o PRl - Tiemsltn Ot - In Time Ot - - Cammants - - L Warked
262020 Saturday MNA

272020 Surday A

282020 Morday 45 AM 0FM "30PM | 4:30 PM 9.25
282020 Tuesday 45 AM <00 PM =30 PM 4-30 P 025
273072020 Wednesday 45 AM 00 PM =30 PM #:30 P 9.25
1012020 Thursday 45 AM 2:00 P 2-30 P 4:30 P 025
10272020 Friday 45 AM | 12:00 PN 2:30 PM 400 PM B.TS
Additional hours not shimn abave - after hours meeting. elc « write total hours in "Rt Hra Workes [Er— e 200

Commants: 47.75

CL Time Sheel 09-26 1o 10-02 xksx




LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC, Empl & 1204
54 SAWYER AVENUE Name: Charlie Lanza
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Sigrature: ¢ __eme
Week: 10010720 To: 10/16/2020

-5 -z Lungh ;.- Lunch . ey 0 o 'NetHrs -
. Patg i e Timedn fUE Out el Time Out = - & Worked _
1011072020 Saturday NA -
101172020 Sunday TN
101272020 Monday BODAM (1200 PM| 1230FM | 4:30PM 8.00
11V2020  Tuesday BA5AM | 1200 PM| 1230 FM | &30 FM 8.25
101472020  Wednesday 45 AM (1200 PM| 1230PM | 4:30PM 9.25
100152000 Thursday 45 AM | 1200 PM| 1230 PM 430 PM 9.23
101672020 Frday 45AM [ 1200 PM| 1230 FPM 430 PM 9.25
Additionza] hours net shown above « after hours meeung, etc « write total hours in “Net Hrs Wone mesc: St g 2.00

Comments: 47.00

01-120

CL Time Sheet 10-10 o 10-16.xisx

HAWIC Rate Case Discussion

REDACTED




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. Empl. #:
54 SAWYER AVENUE

Nama:
ATKINSOM, NH 01311

1208
Charlle Lanza
Slgnature: 7 /.--'-"‘_,_..--
-

Week: 101720 To; 1872312020

CIEP M P p L e R i et T NELHT
o, : ciPmy 21 Timeldn - Oug” " oin - TimaOut 7" -7 Commenta- foit s rl yvorked |
117202 Saturday

10487020 Sunday A

101872020 Monday | _B45AM 1230 PM 430 FM 825
1020720280 Teesday 30 AR DO 12:30 P 450 P 8.50
1072172020 Wednesday A5AM (1200 PM] 1230PM | SO00PM 875
122020 Thureday 630AM | 12200 PM| 1230 PM 4:30 PM 9.50
1237020 Friday B45AM | 12200 FPM| 1230PM 400 FM 875
Additlensl hours not shewn above - after hours meeting. etc - wirle tolal hours bn “Het Hirs Worke: — 200

Comments: 48.75

L 28850 t01120 | [Review WICA calcs vaih Jobn choo ||

CL Tima Sheat 10-17 to10-23.xisx




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.
§4 SAWYER AVENUE
ATKINSON, NH 03811

Empl. #
Name:

1956
o

1- )
%&L(W Signature:
TN N
Week: 9126120 To: 10/2/20

e Quby s o Time Outv: i Comments '
92720
9128120 125AM | 1200 PM | 12230 PM | 5:00PM
2029720 7:20AM | 1:00PM | 1:30PM | 4:35PM
2730020 Wednesday T15AM | 1130 AM | 12,00 PM | 4:40FM
1011120 Thursday T10AM | 1200 PM | 12230 PM | 4:40FPM
1072120 Friday 7:30 AM E:10PM

Additional hours not shown above - after hours meeting, etc - wrile total hours in "INt Hrs Worked™ column

Comments:

9/29/20

Video call to review filing




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. Empl. #: 1955
54 SAWYER AVENUE Name: JabreSullivan / =

ATKINSON, NH 03811

Signatu
Week: 10117120

10/23i20

B'a;le

10720120 Wm- Review rate case schedules and COS study l'

Ll Day iy
101720 Saturday
10/18/20 Sunday
10r19/20 Manday 7:35AM 4:40 FM
10/20/20 Tuesday 7:30AM | 11:30AM | 12:00 FM | 4:40 PM
10721720 Wednesday 7:10AM | 12:00PM | 12:30 PM | 4:45 PM
10122120 Thursday 7:00 AM 4:50 PM
10/2320 Friday 7:00 AM 4:40 PM
Additional hours nct shown above - after hours meeting, etc- write total hoursin “Net Hrs Worked” column —
Comments: 46,33




REDACTED

Stephen P. St. Cyr & Associates
17 Sky Oaks Drive

Biddeford, Me. 04005

207-423-0215

stephenpsicyr@yahoo.com

November 2, 2020
John Sullivan :
Lewis Builders

54 Sawyer Avenue
Atkinson, N. H. 03811

Hampstead Area Water Company i

Re: Year End, ROE, Tisdale, Kelly Green, CIAC Tariff, SNHRWIP Financing &
Truck Financing

Fee for professional services rendered October 2020 (see attached detail): i

Current Month (21.375 hours @ $140.00 / hour) $2,992.50

Reimbursable Expenses: Copies 0.00 !
Postage 0.00 ;
Scan / Email 0.00 '
Tax software fee 0.00 :

Total Current Month Billing 2.992.50 E

Payment due upon receipt.
If you have any questions or comments, please call me at 207-423-0215.

Sincerely, ,

Stephen P. St. Cyr




REDACTED

Description of Service

HAWC 2020 Rate Case (DW 20-117)
10/07
10/08

10/09
10/14
10115
10/16

F/U w/PUC re: def tax asset; Review Aquarion WICA filing; Prepare WICA sch 1.375
Review/Reply to email re: APIC; Prepare temp rate sch; Prepare penm rate test; Review

Dave's email re: COS sch & ftest 3.00
Update on RC; Review / Reply to email re: Team mig 0.25
Talk w/John re: Team mtg; Review email re: same 0.125
Prepare for & part in Team mtg 1.00

Review/Reply to email re: RC filing sch; Review John;s email re: MSDC charge; Review
Chris® reply; Review email re: COS sch & test; Review sch; Review test 0.875




10/19

1026
10727

10/28

10129

10730

Total

Tzlk w/John re: RC sch w/o CIAC tax; Review email re: same; Prepare RC sch w/o CIAC

tax; Review same; Email same; Review email; Prepare email re: def tax asset on

CIAC; Review /Reply toresp; Review email same; Review email re: WICA;

Review sch; Review email re: MSDC fee; Review var emails re: due dates 225
Review email re: RC sch 0.0625
Review 2020 def tax asset on CIAC; Calc amort; Review same; Incorp into RC sch;

Review same; Talk w/John; Prepare email re: same; Review cmail 1o Dave re:

Update COS Analysis; Review Dave’s reply; Talk w/lohn re: WICA sch 2.00
Review John's email; Review proposed eligible projects; Update plant/depr/AD sch; Cale

state & local prop taxes; Cale inc taxes; Calc rev req; Cale surcharge; Review

same; Reply to email; Review/Reply to var emails 3125
Review John's email re: CIAC from Plaistow & Salem, gross up & NOL; Review CIAC

sch; Review CIAC tax cale; Talk w/John re: same; Review CIAC tax eale; Talk

wilohn 1.125
Recale CIAC tax on SNHRWIP; Recale CIAC tax on Atk tank; Adj pro forma LTD; Adj

other sch; Review same; Prepare email re: same; Review/Reply to emails re: eff

tax rate, tax depr, etc.; Talk wiJohn 1,375

SPSL Cyr
11/0220

REDACTED




REDACTED

INVOICE

Lewis Builders Development Inc Invoice Number: 21073

54 Sawyer Ave Invoice Date: 11-30-2020

Atkinson, NH 03811

Customer ID: HAWC
To: Job Location:

HAMPSTEAD AREA WATER CO., INC. Job # 19-9850

54 SAWYER AVE 2020 HAWC Rate Case

ATKINSON, NH 03811 Atkinson, NH

Fixed Asset No:
Unit of
ltem  Descripti Units Measure Unit Price Amount
1 Work Performed During the Month of 13,219.69
Movember 2020

Amount Billed $13,219.69
Retainage Held
Amount Due $13,219.69

DATEDUE: 12-30-2020

A finance éhatge of 2% per month assessed on all invoices not paid by the due date.




REDACTED

121312020

01-070
11/6/2020
11/6/2020

11/13/2020
11/20/2020
1112712020
1112712020

01120
11/6/2020
111372020
1172072020
11/27/2020

99-923
11/6/2020
11/13/2020
11/20/2020
11/27/2020

(ol ol el ol

L
L
L
L

Job Cost Transaction Report for

LBD to HAWC Jobs - 11/1/2020 to 11/30/2020

Job # 19-9850 2020 HAWC Rate Case

AUGERIANTHONY
SPRATT,LAURAJ
AUGERI,ANTHONY
AUGERIANTHONY
AUGERIANTHONY
GRANLUND;HEIDI L

Total - Legal

Project Manager

LANZA;CHARLES P
LANZA,CHARLES P
LANZA;,CHARLES P
LANZA;,CHARLES P
Total ~ Project Manager

Accounting & Management

[l ol ol o

SULLIVAN;JOHN F
SULLIVAN;JOHN F
SULLIVAN;JOHN F

.SULLIVAN;JOHN F

‘Total - Accounting & Management

Sub-Total

Job Total for Last Month

E

1D

Labor Burden 0.48

Overhead 0.23
Units
6.20 759.58
7.50 361.13
5.60 686.07
14.00 1,715.18
17.10 2,094,97
24,50 1,126.15
6,743.08
2.00 350.06
1.00 175.03
11.00 1,925.35
8.00 1,400.25
3,850.69
6.00 630.22
2.00 210.07
7.00 735.26
10,00 1,050.37
2,625.92
18.219.69

121.90 13,219.69




REDACTED

=

‘..

o el i 3 gt
R -

s

l\.._ - -
" LEW1S BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, | G EMPLOYEE #: 140
S4SAWYER AVENUE NAME: AnthoayAuge -
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature: 7
WEEK: 1 nmfzn/( 23 103020
Data Day - Jimein | - Out In Time Qut / ComMMments Worked |
10/24720 Saturd, 0.00
10/2520 Sunday e 0.00
102620 Monday 7:00 AM 5:15 PM 8.75
10727120 Tuesday 7.00 AM 5:30PM 10.25
1028720 | Wednesday | 6:00 AM 515PM 10.75
10729720 Thurseiay 6:30 AM 4:45PM 8.75
103020 Friday 7.00 AM 4:45 PM 8.25
Additonal hours not shown above: 0.00
Comments: 4 0 h £5 v

10726720 m@ lm-cm

Work on petition and draft company testmon




REDACTED

g =
LEW+A1:1501S BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC, EMPLOYEE #: 140 PAGE2
S4SAWYER AVENUE | MAME: Anthony Augerl
ATKINSON, NH 03811

Review schedules from Steve and Dave Fox for rate case and
incorporate into petiton and prefiled testmony *

oaom_fiaesd) lorero - leevencocioemaenee | D



REDACTED

e e T T T —

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. {\¢ EMPLOYEE #: 1931 %f

54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Laura,J/Spratt> [

ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature Y7 PR st —

WEEK,A0/24/20 through 10/30/20

__ Date Day Time In Qut In Tima Out Comments ‘Worked
10/24120 Saturday 0.00
10/25120 Sundzy - 0.00
10/26/20 Monday 7:00 AM 12:00] 12:3Cpm | 4:30 FM 9.00
10027120 Tuesday | 7:00 AM 12:00] 12:30pm | 4:30PM 9.00
10/28/20 | Wednesday | 7:00 AM | 12:00pm | 12:30pm | 4:30PM 3.00
1029120 Thursday | 7:00 AM | 12:00 PM| 12:30 PM | 4:30 FM n 3.00
10/30/20 Friday 7:00 AM |12:00PM_| 12:30 PM | F00FMt-4: >0 P~ 3.00

Additional hours not shown abovs:

Comments:

/ - Review WICA petition In PUC site...make changes to Rale
10/29/20 18-9850' )i01-070 - Icase petilion. Add new testimony and update current testimon

10/30/20 1 9-93 Work on rate case try and add WICA to Charlies Teslimon




LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC,

EMPLOYEE #: 140

S4S5AWYER AVENUE MAME: -‘"‘Eﬂ” ge, i
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature: ¥ .‘_/ - s
' . WEEK: 1013120 / - 23 11106120
Data Day | Timela Cut in Time Qut / Comrhents Worked
10/31120 Saturday 0.00
111720 - | Sunday i 0.00
117220 Monday 7200 AM 500 PM 9.50
11320 Tuesday 6:45 AM S.00PM 8.75
11420 | Wednesday | B:45 AM 5:30PM 10.25
115520 Thirsday 7:00 AM 5:30 AM 10.00
11820 - Friday 6:00 AM 4:45PM ' 10.25
Additional hours not shown above: 0.00
'\ Revise prefliled testimony and petiton for rate case with incorporated
1102120 S-8850 01070 WICA 1.5
. Review updated permanent rate case schedules from Steve and Dave
110320 192850 01070 Fox and revise Petiion and prefiled testimon 2.1

REDACTED




REDACTED

~

LEW+A1,1501S EVILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. EMPLOYEE # 140 PAGE 2
54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Anthony Augeri

ATKINSON, NH 03811

WEEK: 10/31/20 11/C6/20

110520 1993 \Work on incorporating Steve and Dave's schedu'es into -__ (20 ’




, ®
-

e

EMPLOYEE #: 140

T T T S T et s

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC,
' 54 SAWYER AVENUE “]\U{ NAME: Anthony-Aager —
ATKINSON, NH03811 C,BQ& Signature: 7
WEEK: 11/07.20 / 23 - 1113120
Date Day | Timeln Clut In Time Out { BemmEnts Warked
117720 Saturday 7 0.00
11820 Sunday al 0.00
114920 Monday 7.00 AM 5.00 PM 9.50
111020 Tuesday 7.00 AM 5:45 PM 10.25
1111720 | Wednesday | 6:45 AM 4:45 PM 9.50
1111220 Thureday 6:45 AM 5:00 FM 9.75
11113720 Fncay £:45 AM 5:00 PM 9.75
A ‘/ Additional hours not shown above: 0.00

exhibits to be filed

Revise prefiled testimony for Charlie and Dave Fox and review all

Work on taniff revisions and rate case submissions including prefied
on final schedules )

REDACTED




REDACTED

ke T A T WA R R Rl o ot

l\" =
LEW+A1:1501S EUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, ING. EMPLOYEE # 140 PAGE 2
54 SAWYER AVENUE HAME: Anthony Augeri

ATKINSON, NH 03811

WEEK: 11/07/20 1111320

1111200 (|is.esso

o (foses0) Lovoro

Meetwith John and Steve to review rale case documents and revise

Work on rate case filing ncluding revised prefiled testimony and
compiling all required exhibits ’




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.

EMFLOYEE #: 140

54 SAWYER AVENUE NAME: Anthopy Augérl
ATKINSON, NH 02811 Signature: .~ )
i WEEK: 1114720 [\ 23 11120120
Date - Day Tima In Out n Time Out | - Comménts Worked
111420 Saturday : Qoo
11415720 | Sunday 000
111520 Monday 700 AM 6.30PM 11.00
111720 Tuesday 630 AM 5:30 PM 1050
11118720 | Wednesday | 645 AM 5.00 PM 75
11120 | Thursday |- 645AM 65:30 PM 1125
112020 | - Fnday 7:00 AM 5:30 PM 1000
Aduitional hours not ehown above: 0.00

1111820 ‘m 01070 Work on compiling rate case exhitits and final revisions to petition -ﬂ




-

LEW+A1:15015 BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.
54 SAWYER AVENUE
ATKINSON, NH03811

111920 (}19.885; 01-070

S AL T 7

ENPLOYEE#: 140
NAME: Antheny Auger

WEEK: 1171420 11/20/20

Meel with John, Cnns, Harcid, and Charie 1o make final review ot rale
casa documents, then revisa same

Final review of rate case submission and fila sama with PUC

REDACTED




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC, U,{ EMPLOYEE #: 770
54 SAWYER AVENUE cﬁ\ﬁ NAME: Helg) Grapi o A’
ATHINSON, NH 03811 Signatures 73 .

]

WEEK 11/14/20 to 11/20/20
Date Day Time In Out n Time Out Comments Worked
1114720 Salurday 0.00
1115120 Sunday 0.00
111620 Monday | B.00 AM 12:00] 12:30pm_| 5:45AM - 9.50
1117720 Tuesday | 7:.45 AM 12:00] 12:30pm | 5:00PM | - 8.50
11118/20 | Wednesday | 8:00 AM 12:00pm | 12:30pm | 4:45pm 8.50
1119/20 Thursday | 8:00 AM | 12:00 FM| 12:00 PM { 7:00 PM 10.50
11720720 Friday B8.00 AM [12:00PM | 2:00 PM 4 6:00 PM 8.00
b{ Additional hours not shown above:!
Comments: 4, 45.00

E1 9850 01-070 Iworked on tabs {g‘r filing under Rate Case J
- | ==
199850 ) [01-070  |worked on Motion and tabs for filng on Rete Case (65):




REDACTED

B A O P P -

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC, ' Empl #; 1104
&4 BAWYER AVENUE v Namae: Charlie Lanza
ATKINZON, KH 03811 Signature: = -
Wl 10124120 To: 10302020
S LANER, _ LUNER r=w sty g 20T e s~ Wat K
TOut 9 Pl gn 7L Time Out " Comments " “an L Worked o
1200 PN | 1230 FM_| 430 P 925
TZG0PM | 1230 FM 430 PH 800
: 1200 PM| 1230 FM 4:30 PM 825
| B.00AM | 12.(0FM | 12:30 FM 430 FPM 700
Friday 12C0PM| 1230FPM | 430 PM
Additional hours rot shown abave - after hour , #1C + wiita Lgtal hours - Net Frs Vorked
Comments:

L iaanso) lotioo ] [Rev HAWE Clacuain John (XM P

Th T Shect10-24 to 10-30xax



LEW1S BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC.

+ B4 SAWYERAVENUE
- ATKINZON, NH 03811

\.‘[

i

Empl: 1208
Name: Chariie Lanza -

Signature: ¢ .o

Woek: 1013120 To: 111612020
Sl meoste Lungh o L RuneR e e e Ser e T . ~NetHrs
s Timsta -~ Ot~ <~ In - - Time Out "7 comments + Worked |
10312020
11172020
11722020 Monday T:00AM | 12200 PM 30 PM_| 430 PM 9.00
117372020 Tuasday |_T:00Al 12,00 P! S0P | 430PM 8.00
11472020 Wednesday | _7-00AM | 12:00 PM 30 P 430 PM .00
11752020 Thursday 00 A 12:00 PM 130 PM 30 PM 8.00
1182020 Friday DOAM [ 12:00 FM -30PM_| 3:30PM 8.00
Additional hours not shown rbove - afler hours meetng, eic = witie lolal hours in "Nel Hrs Vione: MR emads — |
Comments: 43.00

CL Tim Sheet 1031 1o 13-08.x5x

Rate Casa Mactng

REDACTED




REDACTED

LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INGC. Empl. #: 1204

&4 SAWYER AVENUE Name: Chariis Lanza i

ATKINSON, NH 03811 Slgaslure: ¢ o = B

Waeek: 110720 Te: 1111172020

R e ee. Lmehiper Luneh v o e Ya gt e g NetHrs
= Date - Doy Lo Nirraln - b Oup-fot 0 g7 Time Out [Comments - - o Worked
1172020 Satunday

1182020 Sunday MIA

1182020 Monday TO0AM | 12:00 PM | 12:30 PM 430 PM 8.00
102020 Tuesday TO0AM | 12:00 k] 1230 PM_) 430FPM 2.00
11112020  Wednasday TOOAM [ 12:00 PM| 1230 PM | 4:30PM 0.00
11122020 Thisrsday FOOAM | 12:00 P |  12:30 PM 4:30 P 8.00
Hnazozo Friday T.00AM | 12:00 M| 1230 PM 4:30 PM 8.00
Additlanal hours not ehown sbove - after hours mesting, ets - write talal howrs In el Firs Worke [ e 1.00

Commants: 46.00

HAWC Proied Cost breakdowns for Melissa (z00°7 [ 1

| (i1s-8850 / 101-120 [HAWG Project Cast breakdiwns for Melissa dzoo 1 |

1 HAW Project Cost breakdowns for Mehasa Az 00

Hal Laie Metl

g, MEvitw Jouments

I 51 I A ). £ i N [HAWL Kalp Case review documents I ——

CL Time Sheet 1107 fo 11-13xdsx




LEWIS BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT, INC. QA}K EmpL E: 1204
&4 SAWTER AVENUE Nama: Charlie Lanza— _—
ATKINSON, NH 03811 Signature: 7 =€ = o
Week: 11114120 Tat 11720/2020
AR Ly «mps Lunch - ..c Luneh ;. 1., ..x NetHrs -
a3 tmajn . -Out . ° o oo Modked
11714202
111152020 Sunday NA
a0z Monday ‘DOAM | 12:00 PM 20 PM 4:30 PM 8.00
11172020 Tuesday D0AM | 1200 PM| 1230 PMi_| 430 0.00
11182020  Wednesday | 7-00AM | 12:00 PrA -30 PM 3:30 PM B.OO
111182020 Thursday | T:00AM | 12:00 PM 30PM | 4:30P 8.00
117202020 Friday 00AM | 1200 P 30 PM 430 P 9.00
Additional hours not shown above - aftar hours maeeting, te - wnte tolal heurs in “Net Hrs Worke: [ — 300
Comments: i7.00

Hirviw HA

'WC Rala Case

[ (hosss/ Totso 1 [Reviewwihacors (o) | |

I (T A CE P [ IRevewAwG Rawcase G} |

© €L Time Sheet 11-14