DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Abenaki Water Company
2017 RATE CASE
FYE 12/31/20
ROSEBROOK
Account No. 186-17-13-03

TOTAL NESC OUTSIDE | MATERIALS

DATE VENDOR INVOICE # AMOUNT LABOR LABOR |sErRviCES | PURCHASED DESCRIPTION
3/16/2020|New England Service Co. JAN2020RB1 33.44 33.44 January 2020 interco payroll - SF
2/25/2020|Stephen St. Cyr Jan.2020 402.50 402.50 Services provided January 2020
3/16/2020|New England Service Co. FEB2020RB 35.28 35.28 February 2020 interco payroll - SF
4/29/2020|New England Service Co. MAR2020RB 478.04 478.04 March 2020 interco payroll - NL
5/26/2020|Stephen St. Cyr Mar. 2020 87.50 87.50 Services provided March 2020

7/6/2020|New England Service Co. Q120200H (60.36) (60.36) 1st Qtr 2020 Overhead Allocations
5/19/2020|New England Service Co. APR2020RB1 2,458.84 2,458.84 April 2020 interco payroll - NL, RG
5/19/2020{New England Service Co. APR2020RB 52.58 52.58 April 2020 interco payroll - MS
5/26/2020|Stephen St. Cyr Apr. 2020 32.08 32.08 Services provided April 2020
6/23/2020{New England Service Co. MAY2020RB 946.65 946.65 May 2020 interco payroll - NL, RG
5/26/2020|Stephen St. Cyr May-20 122.50 122.50 Services provided May 2020

6/4/2020|NH Brown Law April Rate Case 5,225.00 5,225.00 Legal services provided April 2020

7/9/2020|NH Brown Law May Rate Case 887.50 887.50 Legal services provided May 2020

8/3/2020|New England Service Co. JUN2020RB1 52.70 52.70 June 2020 interco payroll - NL

GRAND TOTAL 10,754.25 3,997.17( 6,757.08




New England Service Company
Plainville, CT 06062

DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Redacted |AVO i ce

Terms Date Invoice #
%;%% Net 30 1/31/2020 | JAN2020RBI
Bill To %Bg\'ﬁl
Abenaki Water Company
37 Northwest Drive
Plainville, CT 06062
ltem Description Account # Qty Rate Amount
920-01-03 7.14 81.57 58241
186-17-13-03 041 81.57 33.44
186-19-14-03 16 124.03 1,984.48
183-16-09-03 475 124.03 589.14
186-19-06-03 1.75 124.03 217.05
920-01-03 1.84 123.22 226,72
DV-RWS LABOR | President/General Manager 920-01-03 4 126.27 505.08
DV-RWS LABOR | President/General Manager 186-19-14-03 222 126.27 280.32
Subtotal $4,418.64
Balance Due $0.00

Please Make Checks Payable to New England Service Company.




DAILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

DATE: 1/5/2020
DAY : () M T W TH F SA
SUPERVISOR:

REVIEWED BY:

MISSION STATEMENT
Through its highly specialized employees, entreprencurial spirit, and comprchensive managerial approach;

New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and valuc-added solutions to its customers
With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable opportunities to grow its market share to maximize

corporate value for sharcholders as well as current and future opportunities for employces.

"Use Your Best Judgement At All Times"

"Some People Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At It."

DWW 1Z.165 R, 5
Supplemental Rate Case Expensep

Redacted

T

AcCT: | jo.# |

ACCT DESCRIPTION

Valley Water Systems

Work Description

920

Administrative / Accounting

903

Customer records

New England Service Company

903 Customer Records Invoicing
920 Administrative 2.75 admin, catch up on e-mails, IS by class corrections, HR, review /approve A/P, Actna bill, start overheads
Mountain Water Service
610-01 Admin 0.5 catch up on e-mails, review /approve Dec journal entries
Abenaki Water
920-01-01-00 Lakeland Administrative 0.25 review/approve Dec journal entries
920-01-02-00 | White Rock Administrative 0.25 begin overheads
920-01-03-00 [  Rosebrook Administrative 0.25 begin overheads
920-01-05-00 | Tioga Gilford Administrative 0.25 begin overheads
920-01-06-00 | Tioga Belmont Administrative 0.25 begin overheads
186-17-13-03 |  Roscbrook Rate case 0.25 catch up on e-mails re: Omni motions re: rate case expenses
| Colonial Water Company
Dover Division
610.01 Administrative / Accounting 0.5 catch up on e-mails, review /approve Dec journal entries
Plymouth Division
610.01 Administrative / Accounting 0.5 catch up on e-mails, review/approve Dec journal entries
218-18-07 2018 Rate case
Springdale Division
610-01 Administrative/ Accounting
926-01 Vacation
926-02 Sick
926-03 Holiday
926-04 Personal
926-11 Education/Training
TOTAL HOURS 5.75




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case

T e R S G QupplomnnfaLRale_Case.Expensps
[ DAILY TIME SHEET MISSION STATEMENT

o &
Through its highly specialized employecs, cntrepreneurial spirit, and comprehensive managerial approach; +
NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO. New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and value-added solutions to its customers.
72 With this approach, the Company continuously secks profitable opportunities to grow its market share to maximizc
{ A\ corporate value for sharcholders as well as current and future opportunitices for employees.
i
{ Aadi
DATE: 1/21/2020 UNY
DAY : S M ( T ) W TH F SA .
SUPERVISOR:

"Use Your Best Judgement At All Times"

REVIEWED BY: "Some People Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At It."

ACCT: | jo.# | ACCT DESCRIPTION - Work Description
Yalley Water Systems

920 Administrau'\'e/Accounting 1.75 admin, interview, review interce payroil
%03 Custormer records
183-17.42 Hard water study
\New £ngland Service Company
903 Customer Records Invoicing
920 Administrative 3 admin, discussion with Jj, 401k, review payroll, discussions with NML, W 2s
930-01 Corp/Stockholder

Mountain Warer Service

610-01 Admin

Abenaki Water

920-01-01-00 Iakeland Administrative 0.5 approve A/P, year-cnd journal entries, update acct analysis, review interco payroll
920-01-02-00 {  White Rock Administrative 0.5 approve A/P, year-end journal entries, update acct analysis, review interco payroll
920-01-03-00 |  Rosebrook Administrative 0.5 approve A/P, year-end journal entries, update acct analysis, review interco payroil
| 920-01-05-00 | Tioga Gilford Administrative 0.5 discussion with JJ, approve A/P, year-end journal entrics, update acct analaysis, review interco payroll
920-01-06-00 | Tioga Belmont Administrative 0.25 approve A/P, ycar-end journal entries, update acct analysis, review interco payroli
186-17-13-03 |  Roscbrook Rate case 0.25 catch up on c-mails re: motion/rehearing

Colonial Water Company

Dover Division

610.01 Adminimati-.-c/Accounting 1.5 admin, audit, review payroll

Plymouth Division

610.01 Adminisrrarivc//\ccounting 1.25 admin, audit, review payroll
Springdale Division

610-01 Administntivc/Accounting 0.5 admin, audit, review payroll

926-01 Vacation

926-02 Sick

926-03 Holiday

926-04 Personal

926-11 Education/Training

TOTAL HOURS 10.5 {1.5 at homc)




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Sup Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

MISSION STATEMENT

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit, and comprehensive rnanagerial approach;

New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and value-added solutions to its customers.
With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable opportunities to grow its market share to maximize
corporate value for sharcholders as well as current and future opportunities for employees.

Redacted

DATE: 1/27/2020 !
DAY : S (M) T w TH F SA
SUPERVISOR: " Use Your Best Judgement At All Times"
REVIEWED BY: "Some People Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At It."
ACCT: | jo.# | ACCT DESCRIPTION Work Description
Valley Water Systems
920 Administrative/ Accounting 0.5 discussion with J}
903 Customer records
New England Service Company
903 Customer Records Invoicing
920 Administrative 4 admin, e-mails, overheads
930-01 Corp/Stockholder
416-101 Rebrook
Mountain Water Service
610-01 Admin 0.5 approve A/P, update acct analysis
Abenaki Water
920-01-01-00 | Lakeland Administrative 0.75 overheads
920-01-02-00 [ White Rock Administrative 1 admin, e-mails, overheads
920-01-03-00 |  Rosebrook Administrative 1 admin, e-mails, overheads
920-01-05-00 | Tioga Gilford Administrative 0.25 overheads
920-01-06-00 | Tioga Belmont Adminjstrative 0.25 overheads
186-17-13-03 | Rosebrook Rate case 0.5 info. to M. Brown
Colonial Water Company
Dover Division
610.01 Administrative/ Accounting 0.5 approve A/P, update acct analysis
Plymouth Division
610.01 Administrative / Accounting 0.5 approve A/P, update acct analysis
218-18-07 2018 Rate case
<
Springdale Division
610-01 Administrative/ Accounting 0.5 approve A/P, update acct analysis
926-01 Vacation
926-02 Sick
926-03 Holiday
926-04 Personal
926-11 Education/ Training
TOTAL HOURS 10.25 (1.75 at home)




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Stephen P. St. Cyr & Associates

17 Sky Oaks Drive
Biddeford, Me. 04005
207-423-0215
stephenpstcyr@yahoo.com

February 1, 2020

Sheryl Fairchild

New England Service Company
37 Northwest Drive

Plainville, CT 06062

Fee for professional services rendered during January 2020 (see attached detail).

Current Billing (12.25 hours @ $140.00/hour) $1,715.00
Reimbursable Expenses: Copies 0.00
Postage 0.00

Mileage (  x $0.545) 0.00

$1.,715.00

Total Current Billing

Payment due upon presentation.
If you have any questions or comments, please call me at 207-423-0215.

Sincerely,

Stephen P. St. Cyr




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Date Description of Service Hours
Year End / Other
01/09 Talk w/Nick re: 2020 RC; Review emait re: same; Review PUC’s reply 0.50
01/10 Review var email re: Mtg w/PUC Staff, Reply to same 0.375
01/16 Review/Reply to email re: agenda for PUC mitg 0.25
01/20 Talk w/Nick re: Tioga Befmont tariff rate applicable to the Knolls 0.125
01/23 Review email re: def drs; Review def dr; Prepare email re: same; Review Sheryl’s resp; Review PUC email re:

conf call 0.875
01724 Prep for conf call; Talk w/Nick & Sherly; Participate in conf call; Review Nicl’s email re: conf call 2.125

01/31 Review DW 17-143 file; Review car RC/ROE & temp/perm diff docs; Prepare JEs; Review Set AGr Sch,
Review proforma adj re: PUC audit; Prepare JEs; Talk w/Shery!; Review JFs; Scan/Email same 2.00

Total 625
Note: Please charge to Outside Services (PUC account 923),
Rosebrook Rate Case (DW [7-165
01/03 Review Motion for Rehearing; Review Marcia’s email re: same; Review Don’s reply 0.375
01/10 Review var emails re: “contested” RC exp 0.25
0113 Talk w/Marcia re: Omni motion; Review Marcia's email re: Omni’s motion 025
01/20 Review email re: hearing/status conf, Reply to same; Review don’s reply; Review Marcia’s resp 0.375
01/23 Review Omni's motion; Review Marcia’s obj to motion; Prepare email re: same; Review Marcia’s reply;
Review file for “disallowed RC/ROE items; Scan/Email same; Talk wiMarcia re: same 0.75
Total .00
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)
Rosebrook Rate Case.
Rosebrouk Rate Case (DW 17-165) Step 2 — Scope of Engineering
01/07 Review Omni cover [tr; Review Omni’s obj to motion to assent; Review var emails re: same 0.50
01/08 Review var emails re; same 025
01/20 Review email re; hearing/status conf 0.125
Total 0.875
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)
Rosebrook Rate Case.
Return en Equity (IR 19-005
Total 0.00
Note: Please charge to Miscellancous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186}
Rosebrook ROE
OMNI complaing (DW 19-131)
01/07 Review email re; preharing conf, 2013 PUC audit rep re: lack of record; Reply to same 0.375
01/10 Review var emails re: prop proc sch 0.50
01/13 Review BWPOA pet for intervention; Review Marcia’s email re: proc sch; Talkk w/Marcia re; update on comp;
Review Marcia's email re; BWPOA int 0.50
01/16 Review obj to BWPOA’s motion to int; Prepare email re: same 0.25
0Nz Review email; Review partial obj to int 025
01724 Review sup reply to Omni's complaint 025
01728 Review Marcia’s email re; Staff DRs; Review Staff DRs - Set 1 to Omni 025
Total 2375
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)
OMNI complaint
Tioga Belmont Financing {DW 20-x0¢x
01/30 Talk w/Nick re: SRF emergency financing 0.25
01/31 Review email re; costs; Reply to same 025
Total 0.50
Note: Please charge to Unamortized Debt Expense (PUC account 181)
Tioga Belmont Financing
White Rock financing (DW 20-xxx)
01/30 Talk w/Nick re: SRF emergency financing 0.25
0.25

Total
Note: Please charge to Unamortized Debt Expense (PUC account 181)

White Rock Financing



DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Purchase of Millbrook (DW 20-xxx)
Total
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186}

Millbrook Aequisition Costs

(==
]
(=7

Rosebrook CoBank financing of PRP {DW 20-xxx)

Total
Note: Please charge to Unamortized Debt Expense (PUC account 181)

Rosebrook CoBank PRP

=)
=
<

Grand Total

SPSt. Cyr
2/01/20



DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

New England Service Company Redacted i e
Plainville, CT 06062 Invoic

Terms Date Invoice #

3 %"% Net 30 2/29/2020 FEB2020RB

Bill To

Abenaki Water Company
37 Northwest Drive
Plainville, CT 06062

Account # Gty Rate Amount

920-01-03 8.1 82.04 664.52

186-17-13-03 043 82.04 35.28

186-19-14-03 31 124.03 3,844.93

183-16-09-03 0.75 124.03 93.02

NL-RWS LABOR | Vice President 920-01-03 161 125.47 202.01
NL-RWS LABOR | Vice President 186-19-14-03 092 125.47 115.43
DV-RWS LABOR | President/General Manager 920-01-03 3.12 126.24 393.87
DV-RWS LABOR | President/General Manager 183-16-09-03 0.44 126.24 55.55
DV-RWS LABOR | President/General Manager 186-19-14-03 402 126.24 507.48
Subtotal $5,912.09

Balance Due $0.00

Please Make Checks Payable to New England Service Company.



DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

New England Service Compan Redacted .
"o pany Invoice
Plainville, CT 06062
Terms Date Invoice #
Net 30 3/3172020 MARZ2020RB
Bili To
Abenaki Water Company
37 Northwest Drive
Plainville, CT 06062
ltem : Description Account # Qty Rate Amount
920-01-03 4,01 82.04 328.98
186-19-14-03 10.5 124.03 1,302.32
183-16-09-03 1 124.03 124.03
NL-RWS LABOR | Vice President 920-01-03 14 125.47 175.66
NL-RWS LABOR | Vice President 186-17-13-03 3.81 125.47 478.04
DV-RWS LABOR |President/General Manager 920-01-03 3.78 126.24 477.19
DV-RWS LABOR | President/General Manager 183-16-09-03 045 126.24 56.81
DV-RWS LABOR |President/General Manager 334-20-02-03 0.45 126.24 56.81
Subtotal $2,999.84
Balance Due $2,999.84

Please Make Checks Payable to New England Service Company.




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIMESHEET MISSTON STATEMENT

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO. Through its highly specialized emplayees, entrepreneurial spirit and a comprhensive mangerial

approach; New England Service Company strives to provide first dass service and value-added
sofutions ro its customers. With this approach, the Company centinupusly seeks profitable

opportunities to grow its market share to maximize corporate value for shareholders as weil as current

DATE: 3/17/2020 and future opportunities for employees
Bav: s MO w TH O F SA
SUPERVISOR: DV
REVIEWED BY: "Some People Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At It."
AaccT: | JO.# | ACCT DESCRIBTION Nick L Work Description
Vollsy Woter Sysigms
920 Admin 1 Admin, A/P
17-08 391 Printer & software
00-24 50 +/- acre reservoir parcel
014 186 Coronavirus Planning 2.5 strategy meeting, discussions with IT
1949 391 Software Lipgrades
17-1} 186 Hardwater investigation
18-18 Day & Young Main Replacement
"
413-571 NESC Agquarion-Simsbury
93 NESC  |Administrative Other 1.25 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolic review, work on compiling OSHA 300 log
+16-330 NESC  |Arrium
392 NESC Vehicle Purchase
934 MF NESC  [DOT work
181-001 NESC Financing of Twin dlountain Prop
392 NESC | Truck Purchase
315 Twin Mountain Property
131-000 NESC  |Financing for Town Linc Rd
314-000 NESC Purchase of Town Line Rd Property 1.5 Pick up materials and monitor progress
415101 Redbrogk Mgmt Contract
930-001 Administrative Other - NH
+16-800 Bids & Praposals
G10.01 Admin-General 0.5 Admin, A/P
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Program
174 Hydrants
17-12-01 218 MVS rate case
17-18 Berkshire School Road Project
20-05-C1 109 Services & renewals
17-13-01 201 Improve Access Road and Maple
Abenaki Water Compuny
20-07-06 181 Financing Petition for DAWSTF
Installation of distribution vatves and
20-08-06 343 starage tank Ticga Belmont
19-14-03 103 Disputed Service Line Projea
160-09-03 183 Pressure reduction lor Rosebrook
19-18-0 103 Tank Replacements - WR
19-23.02 186 Financing for tank replacements - WR
17-13-03 186 Roschragk Rate Application 1 Review of past orders/submittals for 3/ 24 meeting preparation
14-11-00 183 Millbreok Water Ca
920-01-05 Tiega Gillord Village - Admin
920-01-06 Tioga Belmont - Admin
920-01-01 Lakeland Admn
920-01-02 White Rack - Admin 0.25 Admin
920.01-03 Rosebrook- Admin
Plymouh Division
610.01 Admin- General 0.5 Admin/A/P
18.07 218 2018 Rate Case
17.09 108 Tying inte Redbrook System
17-11 218 40 Linit subdivision
17.12 Peter Deasey Project
17-06 218 Cell phane lower
Lolonial Huter Compuny
610.01 Admin-General 0.5 Admin/, A/P
17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06- 19 107 L:-Celi and # log detection
19-08-10 117 Purchase of 2019 F230 Utitiny Truck
92601 Vacalion
926-02 Sick
926-03 Heliday
926-(H Persanal
926.11 Education/ Training
TOTAL HOURS I | | |




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIMESHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit and o comprhensive mangerial
approach; New England Service Company strives to p.mvideﬁrst class service and value-added
solutions to its customers. With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable
opportunities to grow its market share to maximize corporate value for sharehelders us well as current

MISSION STATEMENT

DATE: 3/18/72020 and future opportunities for employees
DAY : S M T (W) TH F SA
SLUPERVISOR: DV
REVIEWED BY: "Some People Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At It "
accT: [ Jo# ] ACCT DESCRIPTION Nick L Work Description
Fulley Higer Sp
920 Admin 1 Admin,
17.08 91 Printer & software
00-24 50 +/- acre reservoir parcel
014 186 Coronavirus Planning 2 strategy meeting, discussions with IT
19-09 391 Soltware Lipgrades
17-12 186 Hardwater investigation
13-28 Day & Young Main Replacement
New England Service Compuny
415-571 NESC | Aquarion-Simshury
920 NESC | Administrative Other 1.5 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review, cyber security policy
+15-130 NESC Atrium
392 NESC Vehicle Purchase
53+-MF DOT work
181-001 NESC Financing of Twin Mountain Prop
392 NESC Truck Purchase
313 Twin Mountain Praperty
131-000 NESC Financing for Town Line Rd
314-000 NESC _ [Purchase of Town Line Rd Property 1.5 Pick uwp materials and monitor progress
416-101 NES{ Redbrock Mamt Contract
920-00) NESC Administrative Other - NH
416-800 Bids & Proposals
Mouniatn Woer s
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Program
17-04 Hydrants
17-12-01 218 MWS rate rase
17-18 Berkshire School Road Project
20-05-01 109 Services & renewals
17-15-01 Pl Improse Access Road and Maple
Abenaki Warer Company
20-07-06 181 Financing Petition for DWSTFE
Installation of distribution valves and
20-08-06 343 storage tank Tioga Belmant
19-14-03 105 Disputed Service Line Project
16-09-03 183 Pressure reduction for Rosebrook
19-18-02 105 ‘Tank Replacements - W8
19-23.02 186 Financing for 1ank replacements - WR
17-13-03 186 Roscbrook Rate Application 2 Review of past orders/submittals for 3/24 meeting preparation
14-11-00 183 Millbrook Water Co
920-01-05 Tioga Gillord Village - Admin
920-01-06 Tioga Belmont - Admin
920-01-01 [akeland- Admn
920-01-02 White Rock - Admin
920-01.03 Rosebrook-Admin 025 Admin
Plymoush Dividen
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
18.07 218 2018 Rate Case
17.09 108 Tying into Redbrock Sysiem
17-11 218 40 Linit subdivision
17.12 Peter Deasey Project
17-06 218 Cell phone tower
fonial Water Compun,
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
17.10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20.06-10 107 E-Coli and + log detection
19-08-10 117 Purchase of 2019 F230 Ulity Truck
916-01 Vacation
916-02 Sick
926-03 Holiday
926-0+ Personal
96411 Edu('aliun/'l'rammg

TOTAL HOURS




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

DATE: 371942020

DAY : S M T

w J F  sa

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit and a comprhensive mangerial

approach; New England $ervice Company strives to provide first tlass service and value-added
selutions to its customers, With this approach, the Company continuously seeks prafitable

opportunities to grow its market share to maximize corporate value for shareholders as well as current

MISSION STATEMENT

and future opportunities for employees

SHPERVISOR: Dy
REVIEAVED BY: "Some People Dteam of Success... Whife Others Wake Up and Work Hard At ir."
AT [ Lo # ] ACCT DESCRIFTION Nick L Work Description
Valley Worer Systemy
920 Admin 1 Admin,
17-08 391 Printer & software
00-24 30 +/- acre reservoir parcel
20-14 186 {oronavirus Planning 2 strategy meeting, discussions with IT, call with DPFH
19-09 191 Software Llpgrades
17.12 186 Hardwater investigation
18-28 Day & Young Main Replacement
New Englond Service Company
+15-371 NESC Aguarion-Simshury
920 Administrative Other 225 Ad min, pricing jobs, lorcasting cash, portfolio review,
416-330 Atrium
392 Vehicle Purchase
934-MF DO work
181-001 Tinancing of Twin Mouatain Prop
392 Truck Purchase
HE Thwin Mountain Property
131-000 NESC  fFinancing for Towa Line Rd
114-000 NESC Purchase of Town Line Rd Property 1.5 Pick up materials and monitor progress
416-101 ledbrook Mame Contract
920-001 Administrative Other - N
+16-800 Bids & Proposals
Mounegin 11y QM
610.01 Admin-General 0.5 Admin
17.06.01 Lvaluate Capital Program
1704 liydrants
17-12-01 218 MAVS rate case
17-18 Beckshire School Read Project
20-05-01 109 Services & renewals
17-13-01 201 Improse Access Road and Maple
Lherighi Water Compuny
20-07-06 181 Financing Petition for DWSTF
Installation of distribution valves and
20-08-06 343 storage 1ank Tioga Belmont
19-14.03 105 Disputed Service Line Project
16-09-03 133 Pressure reduction for Rosebronk
19-18-02 105 Tank Replacements - WR
19.23.02 186 Financing for tank replacements - WR
17.33.03 186 Rosebrook Rate Application i Review of past orders/submittals for 3/24 meeting preparation
141100 183 Millbrook Water Co
920-01-03 Tioga Gilford Village - Admin 0.25 Admin
9200106 Tioga Belmont - Admin
220-01-01 1akdand-Admn
920-01.02 White Rock - Admin
920-01-03 Rosebrook-Admin
Phymowh Diviston
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
18-07 218 2008 Rate Case
17-09 108 Tying into Redbrook Svstem
17-11 218 40 Unit subdivision
17-12 Feter Deasey Project
17.06 218 Cell phone 10wer
!géaggu} Huter Cornpuiry:
610.01 Admin-General (.25 Admin

17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06- 10 107 E-Coli and + log detection
19-08-10 1k Purchase of 2019 F250 Uhility Truck
926-01 Vacation
926-02 Sick
926-03 Heliday
926-(4 Personal
926-11 Education/ Training

TOTAL HOURS




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Stephen P. St. Cyr & Associates

17 Sky Oaks Drive
Biddeford, Me. 04005
207-423-0215
stephenpstcyr@yahoo.com

April 4, 2020
Sheryl Fairchild
New England Service Company

37 Northwest Drive
Plainville, CT 06062

Fee for professional services rendered during March 2020 (see attached detail).

Prior Billing $2.695.00
Current Billing (29.00 hours @ $140.00/hour) $4,060.00
Reimbursable Expenses: Copies 0.00
Postage 0.00

Mileage (  x $0.545) 0.00

$2,695.00

Total Current Billing
Total Billing $6.755.00

Payment due upon presentation.
If you have any questions or comments, please call me at 207-423-0215.

Sincerely,

Stephen P. St. Cyr

(Cfaz

RECEAED



DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case

Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Date Description of Service Hour
Year End / Other Hours
03/02  Prepare email re: PUC Ann Rep/ rev & exp charges to TGV 0.25
03/18 Prepare email re: B/S, I/S & GL 0.125
03/23 Review/Reply to email re: AWC draft fin'ls; Review/Reply to var emails re; sane 0.50
03/24 Review Adam’s email; Save files; Prepare 2019 PUC ann Repo: Prepare LMC, WR, RB,TB & TGV I/S;
Prepare F-2 by system; Prepare F-2; Prepare LMC, WR, RB,TB & TGVBL/S; Prepare F-1 assets by
system; Prepare F-1 Eq & Liab by system; Prepare F-1; Prpare email re: out of balance 8.00
03/25 Add NI to RE; Add intereo trans to B/S; Review same; Prepare F-48, 50 & 46 by system 6.00
03/27 Review Sheryl’s email re: adj B/S, I/S & groupings; Review depr & amort of CIAC sch; Review capex sch; j
Review disposition of PPE sch; Prepar ereq for ext; Prepare email re: same 0875 .-O
03/30 Cenduct final review of req for ext; Scan/Email same 025 ; 7_7
Total 16.00 11/\
Note: Please charge to Outside Services (PUC account 923). A
Rosebrook Rate Case (DW {7-163 \%9
03/18 Review Marcia's email re: 3/24 hearing 0.1875
03/21 Review Marcia’s email re: tech ses / hearing 0.04167 )
Total 0217 [T
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186} ,\’>
Rosebrook Rate Case. v
Rosebrook Rate Case (DW 17- Step 2 ~ Scope of Engineerin; lf\
03/18  Review Marcia’s email re: 3/24 hearing 0.1875 \\p
03721 Review Marcia’s email re: tech ses / hearing 0.04167 % .
Total 0.22917 %
Note: Please charge to Miscellancous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186) A
Rosebrook Rate Case.
Return on Equity (TR 19-005
Total 0.00
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)
Rosebrook ROE
OMNI complaint (DW 19-131) /5
03/02 Review email; Review cover ltr; Review sup resp to Staff 1-10 0.25 O
03/06 Review email re: Staff DRs — Set 2; Revie Staff DRs — Set 2; Review 2-2 0.375 V\’
03/10 Review email; Review 2-2 & 2-3; Reply to email re: comments 0.50 A
03/11 Review don's reply 0.125 \0\
03/18 Review Marcia’s email re: 2-5; Review Marcia's email re: 3/24 hearing 0.125 .
03/19 Review Marcia's email re: 2-1; Review Co resp to same 0.25 :
03721 Review Marcia’s email re: tech ses / hearing 0.04166
03/24 Review email re: Co resp to Set 2 DRs; Review Co resp; Review Omni resp 0.50
Total 2.16666
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)
OMNI complaint
Tioga Belmont Financing (DW 20-%0c)
03/02 Prepare 2019 I/S; Prepare fin sch; Review same; Review email re: add’! data 1.75
03/03 Review amort of fin costs; Review notice of valie & tax bill; Review Belmont R/E tax bill; Prepare email re:
same 0.50
03/05 Update prop tax sch; Review JEs/F/S; Prepare email re: org costs, A/D & depr exp of retired plant; Review g
Email re: depr sch; Review TB depr sch; Review acct 330; Prepare email re: retired plant data; O
Update plant, A/D & depr sch; Update JEs; Review F/S; Review email re: 3-6 gate valves, etc. 2.00 -
03/16 Prepare email re; retirement 0.125 O
03/17 Review fin sch; Add retirement; Prepare email re: same 0.50 '
03727 Review email; Review draft NAL test; Reply to same; Draft SPS’s test 2.125 9&7
03/31 Review/Edit SPS’s draft test; Prepare email re: same; Prepare cover lir; Review draft; Update as appro; Prepare/ \’
Edit same; Prepare email re: same 325 \%
Total 19.25
Note: Please charge to Unamortized Debt Expense (PUC account [81)

Tioga Belmont Financing

White Rock financing (DW 20-x00x) ST
f Thies

03/20 Review Nick’s email re: emergency status for funding in 2020

Total
Note:

"_‘ ." i

Please charge to Unamortized Debt Expense (PUC account 181) zq ,
White Rock Financing



Purchase of Millbrook (DW 20-xxx)
Total
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)

Millbrook Acquisition Costs

Rosebrook CoBank financing of PRP (DW 20-xxx)

Total
Note: Please charge to Unamortized Debt Expense (PUC account 181}

Rosebrook CoBank PRP
Grand Total

SPSt. Cyr
4/04/20

DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

0.00



DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

New England Service Company I nvo i ce
Plainville, CT 06062
Terms Date Invoice #
Net 30 3/31/2020 1Q20200H
Bill To
Abenaki Water Company
37 Northwest Drive
Plainville, CT 06062
Item Description Account # Qty Rate Amount
DA JR- LMC La... |Temp. Help 11.27 11.27
DA JR-RWS LA... | Temp 1.61 1.61
DA JR-TB-Labor |Temp 1.61 1.61
DA JR- WRC La... | Temp. Help 4.83 4.83
JJ- LMC Labor Administrative Manager -8.45 -8.45
JJ-RWS LABOR | Administrative Manager -17.01 -17.01
JJ-TB-Labor Administrative Manager -13.85 -13.85
JJ-TGV-Labor Administrative Manager -18.01 -18.01
JJ-WRC LABOR | Administrative Manager -5.18 -5.18
LK-LMC LABOR | Customer Service Representative 73.66 73.66
LK-RWS LABOR | Customer Service Representative 73.24 73.24
LK-TB-Labor Customer Service Rep 82.28 82.28
LK-TGV-Labor Customer Service Rep 74.25 74.25
LK-WRC LABOR | Customer Service Representative 73.66 73.66
TK-RWS LABOR | Accountant/Customer Service Rep 0.64 0.64
TK- WRC LABOR | Accountant/Customer Service Rep 0.71 0.71
LL- LMC Labor Customer Service Rep 0.52 0.52
LL-RWS LABOR | Customer Service Rep 0.18 0.18
LL-TB-Labor Customer Service Rep 0.59 0.59
LL-TGV-Labor Customer Service Rep 0.59 0.59
LL-WRC LABOR | Customer Service Rep 0.18 0.18
NML- LMC Labor | Accountant/Customer Service 26.54 26.54
NML-RWS LAB... | Accountant/Customer Service 24.20 24.20
NML-TB-Labor ... | Accountant/Customer Service 263.20 263.20
NML-TGV-Labor | Accountant/Customer Service 23.79 23.79
NML-WRC LAB... | Accountant/Customer Service Rep 25.54 25.54
MS- LMC LABOR | Office Manager-MA 3.38 3.38
Subtotal
Balance Due
Page 1 17




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

New England Service Company I nvo i ce
Plainville, CT 06062
Terms Date Invoice #
Net 30 3/31/2020 1Q20200H
Bill To
Abenaki Water Company
37 Northwest Drive
Plainville, CT 06062
Item Description Account # Qty Rate Amount
MS-RWS LABOR | Office Manager-MA 3.78 3.78
MS-TB-Labor Office Manager-MA 3.06 3.06
MS-TGV-Labor Office Manager-MA 2.93 2.93
MS-WRC LABOR | Office Manager-MA 3.26 3.26
1st Qtr 2020 Overhead allocations
Subtotal $717.00
Balance Due $717.00
Please Make Checks Payable to New England Service Company.
Page 2 18




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

New England Service Company C re d | t Me mo
Plainville, CT 06062
Date Credit No.
3/31/2020 1Q20200H3
Customer

Abenaki Water Company
37 Northwest Drive
Plainville, CT 06062

P.C. No. Project
Description Qty Rate Amount

Director of Rates and Regulatory Affairs 214.62 -214.62
Director of Rates and Regulatory Affairs 241.14 -241.14
Director of Rates and Regulatory Affairs 169.32 -169.32
Director of Rates and Regulatory Affairs 176.89 -176.89
Director of Rates and Regulatory Affairs 222.07 -222.07
Vice President- Engineering 9,28 -9.28
Vice President- Engineering 271.28 -271.28
Vice President- Engineering 53.64 -53.64
Vice President- Engineering 288.81 -288.81
Vice President 56.78 -56.78
Vice President 125.37 -12537
Vice President 174.03 -174.03
Vice President 47.11 -47.11
Vice President 65.81 -65.81
President/General Manager 179.75 -179.75
President/General Manager 312.33 -312.33
President/General Manager 44,74 -44.774
President/General Manager 18.33 -18.33
President/General Manager 51.88 -51.88
st Qtr 2020 Overhead allocations

Subtotal $2,723.18

Sales Tax (0.0%) $0.00

Total -$2,723.18

Balance Credit  -s2723.18




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case

DAILY TIME SHEET MISSION STATEMENT Supplemental Rate Case Expenses
Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit, and comprehensive managerial approach; C oo
NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO. New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and valuc-added solutions to its customers.
With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable opportunitics to grow its market share to maximize
corporate value tor sharcholders as well as current and future opportunitics for employees.
DATE: 17572020
DAY : ( S ) M T w TH F SA
SUPERVISOR: "Use Your Best Judgement At All Times"
REVIEWED BY: "Some People Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At It."
ACCT: | J.O.# |  ACCT DESCRIPTION _ Work Description
Valley Water Systems
920 Administrative/ Accounting
903 Customer rccords
}New England Service Company
903 Customer Records Invoicing
920 Administrative 2.75 admin, catch up on ¢-mails, IS by class corrections, HR, review /approve A/P, Aetna bill, start overheads
Mountain Water Service
610-01 Admin 0.5 catch up on e-mails, review/approve Dec journal entries
Abenaki Water
920-01-01-00 Lakeland Administrative 0.25 review /approve Dec journal entries
920-01-02-00 | White Rock Administrative 0.25 begin overheads
920-01-03-00 | Rosebrook Administrative 0.25 begin overheads
920-01-05-00 | Tioga Gilford Administrative 0.25 begin overheads
920-01-06-00 | Tioga Belmont Administrative 0.25 begin overheads
186-17-13-03 [ Roscbrook Rate case 0.25 catch up on ¢-mails re: Omni motions re: rate case expenses
Colonial Water Company
Dover Division
610.01 Administrative / Accounting 0.5 catch up on e-mails, review /approve Dec journal entries
Plymouth Division
610.01 Administrative/ Accounting 0.5 catch up on e-mails, review/approve Dec journal entries
218-18-07 2018 Rate case
Springdale Division
610-01 Administrative/ Accounting
926-01 Vacation
92602 Sick
926.03 Holiday
926-04 Personal
926-11 Education/Training
20
TOTAL HOURS 5.75




DAILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

DATE: 1/27/2020 ,
DAY : s (M) T W TH F SA
SUPERVISOR:

REVIEWED BY:

MISSION STATEMENT

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit, and comprehensive raanagerial approach;

DVV T7=TOO N
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses
Redacted

New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and valuc-added solutions to its customers.

With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable opportunities to grow its market share to maximize

corporate value for shareholders as well as current and future opportunities for cmployees.

"Use Your Best Judgement At All Times"

"Some People Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At It."

ACCT: [ J.O.# |  ACCT DESCRIPTION I Work Description
Valley Water Systems
920 Administrative/ Accounting 0.5 discussion with JJ
903 Customer records
New England Service Company
903 Customer Records Invoicing
920 Administrative 4 admin, e-mails, overheads
930-01 Corp/Stockholder
416-101 Rebrook
Mountain Water Service
610-01 Admin 0.5 approve A/P, update acct analysis
Abenaki Water
920-01-01-00 Lakeland Administrative 0.75 overheads
920-01-02-00 | White Rock Administrative 1 admin, e-mails, overheads
920-01-03-00 | Rosebrook Administrative 1 admin, e-mails, overheads
920-01-05-00 | Tioga Gilford Administrative 0.25 overheads
920-01-06-00 | Tioga Belmont Administrative 0.25 overheads
186-17-13-03 |  Rosebrook Rate case 0.5 info. to M. Brown
Colonial Water Company
Dover Division
610.01 Administrative/ Accounting 0.5 approve A/P, update acct analysis
Plymouth Division
610.01 Administrative/ Accounting 0.5 approve A/P, update acct analysis
218-18-07 2018 Rate case
'/
Springdale Division
610-01 Administrative/ Accounting 0.5 approve A/P, update acct analysis
926-01 Vacation
926-02 Sick
926-03 Holiday
926-04 Personal
926-11 Education/ Training
TOTAL HOURS 10.25 (1.75 at home)




DARY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

DATE: 1/21/2020
DAY : S M (T) W TH F SA
SUPERVISOR:

REVIEWED BY:

D\N47-466-Resebrook Ra&e-GeI
MISSION STATEMENT Supplemental Rate Case Expens
Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit, and comprehensive managerial approach; 0C oo

New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and value-added solutions to its customers.
With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable opportunities to grow its market share to maximize
corporate valuc for sharcholders as well as current and future opportunities for employees.

"Use Your Best Judgement At All Times"
"Some People Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At It."

ACCT: I 1.0.# ! ACCT DESCRIPTION _ Work Description
Valley Water Systems
920 . Administrative/ Accounting 1.75 admin, intcrview, review interse payroil
%03 Customer records
1831742 Hard water swdy
New £ngland Service Company
303 Customer Records Invoicing
920 Administrative 3 admin, discussion ~wvithJ}, 401k, review payroll, discussions with NML, W .2s
930-0i Corp/ Stockholder :
Mountain Warer Service
610-01 Admin
Abenaki Water
920-01-01-00 Lakeland Administrative 0.5 approve A/P, year-cnd journal entries, update acct antalysis, review interco payrofl
920-01-02-00 | White Rock Administrative 0.5 approve A/P, year-end journal entries, update acct analysis, review interco payroll
'920-01-03-00 |  Rosebwook Administrative 0.5 approve A/P, year-end journal entries, update acct analysis, review interco payroil
920-01-05-00 | Tioga Gitford Administrative 0.5 discussion with }}, approve A/P, year-end journal enirics, update acct analaysis, review interco payroll
920-01-06-0C | Tioga Belmont Administrative 0.25 approve A/P, year-end journal entries, update acct analysis, review interco payroli
186-17-13-03 |  Rosebrook Rate case 0.25 catch up on e-mails re: motion/rehcaring
Colonial Water Company
Dover Division
610,01 Administrative/ Accouriting 1.5 admin, audit, review payroll
Plymouth Division
610.01 Administrative/ Accotnting 1.25 admin, audit, review payroll
Springdale Division
610-01 Administrative/ Accounting 0.5 admin, audit, review payroll
926-01 Vacation
926-02 Sick
926.03 Holiday
926-04 Personal
926-11 Education/Training
TOTAL HOURS 10.5 {1.5 at home) 2




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEET

NEYW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit and a comprhensive mangerial
approach; New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and value-added
solutions to its customers. With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable
opportenities to grow its market share to maximize corporate value for shareholders as well as current

MISSTON STATEMENT

DATE: /1772020 and future opportunities for employees
pav: 5 M D w TH O F sA
SUPERVISOR: DV
REVIEWED BY: "Some People Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At It.”
accr: | Jo# | ACCT DESCRIPTION NickL Work Description
 olley Woier Systems
920 Admin 1 Admin, A/P
17-08 3N Printer & sofiware
00-24 50 +/- acre reservoir parcel
20-14 185 Coronavirus Planning 2.5 strategy meeting, discussions with IT
19-09 391 Software Lipgrades
17-12 186 Hardhwater investipation
18-23 Day & Young Main Replacement
] 2 vige
+15-571 NESC _ [Aquarien-Simsbury
920 NESC  fAdministrative Other 1.2§ Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review, work on compiling OSHA 300 log
+16-330 NESC  |Atrium
392 NESC | Vehicle Purchase
934-MF NESC  |DOT work
181-001 NESC _ [Financing of Twin Mountain Prep
392 NESC  |Truck Purchase
115 Twin Mountain Propesty
181-000 NESC __ [Financing for Town Line Rd
314-000 NESC _ JPurchase of Towa Line Rd Property 1.5 Pick up materials and monitor progress
416-101 NESC  |Redbrook Mgmt Contract
920-001 NESC  |Administrative Other - NH
416-800 Bids & Propasals
Mounrain Warer Sisterns
60.01 [Admin-General 0.5 Admin, A/P
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Program
17-04 Hydrants
17-12-01 218 MWS rate case
17-18 Berkshire School Road Project
20-05-01 109 Services & renewals
17-15-01 201 tmprove Access Road and Maple
nghkl Water
20-07-06 181 Financing Petition for DWSTF
Instaltation of distribution valves and
20-08-06 343 storage tank Tioga Belmont
19-14-03 105 Disputed Service Line Project
16-09-03 183 Pressure reduction lor Resebraok
19-18-02 105 Tank Replacements - WR
19-23.02 186 Financing for tank replacements - WR
17-13.03 185 Rosebrook Rate Application 1 Review ol past orders/submittals for 3/24 meeting preparation
14-11.00 183 Millbrook Water Co
920-01-05 Tioga Gilford Vitlage - Admin
920.01.06 Tioga Belmont - Admin
920-01.¢1 Lakeland-Admn
91)-01-G2 White Rock - Admin 0.25 Admin
920-01-03 Rosebrook-Admir
Plyrupuch Division
§10.01 | Admin.General 0.5 |Admin/A/P
18-07 218 2018 Rate Case
17-09 108 Tying into Redbrook System
17-11 118 40 Linit subdivision
17-12 Peter Deasey Project
17-06 213 Cell phone tower
610,01 Admin-General 0.5 Admin/, A/P
17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 E-Coli and 4 log detection
19-08-10 1n? Purchase of 2019 F250 Uiility Truck
926-01 Vacation
926-02 Sick
926.03 Holiday
916-04 Personal
916.11 Education/ Training
TOTAL HOURS 9 | | I

23



DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERYICE CO.

MISSION STATEMENT

Through its highly specialized emplayees, entrepreneurial spirit and a comprhensive mangerial
approach; New England Service Company strives to provide first class service ond value-added
solutions to its ¢ 5. With this app h, the Company continuously seeks profitable
opportunities to grow its market share to maximize corporate value for shareholders as well as current

DATE: 371872020 and future opportuitities for employees
DAY: § M T (@ T™ F SA
SUPERVISOR: DV
REVIEWED BY: "Some People Dream of Success, ., While Others Wake Up and Work Hord At It."

acct: | JO.# ] ACCT DESCRIPTION NickL Work Description
 Yalley Worer Systems

920 Admin 1 Admin,

17.08 91 Printer & soltwars

00-24 50 +/- acre reservoir parcel

20-54 186 Coranavirus Planaing 2 strategy meeting, discussions with IT

19-08 391 Soltware Upgrades

17-12 186 Hardwater investigation

18-28 Day & Young Main Reptacement
 evr England Service Lompany

415-571 NESC __|Aquarion-Simsbury

910 NESC | Administrative Other 1.5 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review, cyber security policy
+16-330 NESC  |Atrlum
392 NESC _ |Vehicle Purchase

934-MF NESC  |DOT work

181-001 NESC __ [Financing of Twin Mountain Prop

352 NESC  |Truck Purchase

31§ Twin Mountain Property

131-060 NESC  |Financing Jor Town Line Rd

114-000 NESC __|Purchase of Town Line Rd Propenty L5 Pick up materials and moniter progress
416-101 NESC Redbrook Mgmt Contract
910901 NESC  |Administrative Other - NH
+16-800 Bids & Proposals
Mounzain Water, Sptems
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
17-06-0f Evaluate Capital Program
17-C4 Hydrants
17-12-01 218 MWS rate case
17-18 Berkshire School Road Project
20-05-01 109 Services & renewals
17-15-01 201 improve Access Road and Maple
dbenedi Water Company
20-07-06 181 Financing Petition for DWSTF
Installaticn of distribution valves and
20-08-06 343 storage tank Tiopa Belumoast
19-14-03 105 Disputed Service Line Praject
16-09-03 183 Pressure reduction for Rosebrook
19-13-02 10§ Tank Replacements - WR
19.23-02 136 Finanging for tank replacements - WR
17-13-03 136 Rosebrook Rate Application 2 Review of past orders/submittals for 3/24 meeting preparation
14-11-00 183 Millbrock Water Co
920.01-05 Tioga Gilford Yillage - Admin
220-01-06 Tioga Belmont - Admin
920-01-01 Lakeland-Admn
920.01-02 White Rock - Admin
920-01-03 Rosebraok-Admin 0.25 Admin
Pi th Divis
£10.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
18-07 218 2018 Rate Case
17-09 108 Tying into Redbrook System
17-11 218 40 Unit subdiviston
17.12 —|Peter Deascy Project
17-06 218 Celt phene tower
al
610,01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
17-19 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 E-Coli and + log detection
19-08-190 17 Purchase of 2019 F250 Utility Truck
926-01 Vacation
926-02 Sick
526-03 Holiday
5926-0+ Personal
926-11 Education/ Training

TOTAL HOURS

24



DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case

Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERYVICE CO.

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit and a comprhensive mangerial
approach; New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and value-added
solutions to its customers. With this appreach, the Company continuously seeks profitable

opportunities to grow its market share to maximize cotporate value for shareholders as well as current

MISSION STATEMENT

DATE: 3/19/2620 and future opportunities for employees
DAY: 5 M T w JI> F  sA
SUPERVISOR: DV \
REVIEWED BY: / "Some People Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At it. "
ACCT: | 1.0.# | ACCT DESCRIPTIONL ™ NickL Work Description
Valley Water f%
920 Admin 1 Admin,
17-08 191 Printer & software
00-24 50 +/- acre reservoir parcel
20-14 186 Coronavirus Planning 2 strategy meeting, discussions with IT, call with DPH
18-09 391 Software Upgrades
17.12 186 Hardwater investigation
18-18 Day & Young Main Replacement
w England n
415-571 NESC  |Aquarion-Simsbury
520 NESC  JAdmi Other 225 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review,
416-330 NESC Atrium
52 NESC _ |Vehicle Purchase
934-MF NESC _ |DOT work 7
181-001 NESC __ [Financing of Twin Mountain Prop
392 NESC  [Truck Purchase
3l Twin Meuntain Property /
181-000 NESC  [Financing lor Town Line Rd d
314-000 NESC _ |Purchase of Town Line Rd Property 1.5 Pick up materials and monitor pfogress
+16-101 NESC | Redbrock Mgmt Contract
920001 | NESC |Administrative Other - NH )
416-800 _ [Bids & Proposals pd
 Mountalo Water Stgms £
510.01 Admin-General 0.5 |Admin
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Program Py
17-04 Hydrants 4
171201 218 |MWS rate case /
17-18 Berkshire School Road Project /
20-65-01 109 Services & renewals A
17-15-01 201 Improve Access Road and Maple /
taki mpan) /
20-07-06 181 {Financing Petition for DWSTF s
Installation of distribution vatves and /
20-08-06 343 storage tank Tioga Belaont
19-14-03 105 Disputed Service Line Project /
16-0%-03 183 Pressure reduction far Rnsebrm}(
19-18-02 105 Tank Replacements - WR
19-23-02 86 Financing for 1ank replaccqa{ms - WR
17-13-03 186 Rosebrook Rate Applic;t‘.llon 1 Review of past orders/submittals for 3/2¢ meeting preparation
14-11-00 183 |Millbrook Water Co/”
920-01-05 Tiogz Gillord Villae - Admin 0.25  [Admin
920-01-06 Tioga Relmoag Admin
920-01-01 Lakeland-Agtfnn
920-01-02 White Rdtk - Admin
920-01-03 Rosebfook-Admin
610.01 [Admin-General 0.25 Admin
1807 2 W/ 2018 Rate Case
17.09 A8 Tying inta Redbrock Sysiem
17-11_| / 2183 [40 Linit subdivision
17-12 Peter Deasey Project
17-06 218 Cell phong tower
Jon )
610.0i Admin-General 0.25 Admin
17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 E-Cali and + log detection
19.08-10 117 Purchase of 2019 F250 Liulity Truck
526-01 Vacation
926-02 Sick
$26-03 Holiday
926-04 Personal
926-11 Education/ Training
TOTAL HOURS | ] | B

25



DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses
Red

New England Service Compan acte .
. pany Invoice
Plainville, CT 06062
Terms Date Invoice #
Net 30 4/30/2020 APR2020RB1
Bill To
Abenaki Water Company
37 Northwest Drive
Plainville, CT 06062
Description Account # Qty Rate Amount
920-01-03 477 82.04 391.33
186-19-14-03 35.75 124,03 4,434.07
186-17-13-03 2 124.03 248.06
NL-RWS LABOR | Vice President 920-01-03 242 125.47 303.64
NL-RWS LABOR | Vice President 186-17-13-03 17.62 125.47 2,210.78
NL-RWS LABOR | Vice President 186-19-14-03 1.43 125.47 179.42
DV-RWS LABOR | President/General Manager 920-01-03 1.7 126.24 214.61
DV-RWS LABOR | President/General Manager 186-19-14-03 1.4 126.24 176.74
DV-RWS LABOR | President/General Manager 183-16-09-03 1.89 126.24 238,59
Subtotal $8,397.24
Balance Due $8,397.24

Please Make Checks Payable fo New England Service Company.

26



New England Service Company
Plainville, CT 06062

DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Redacted I nvoi ce

Terms Date Invoice #
Net 30 4/30/2020 APR2020RB
Bill To
Abenaki Water Company
37 Northwest Drive
Plainville, CT 06062
item Description Account # Qty Rate Amount
920-01-03 043 45,75 19.67
920-01-03 3.92 51.91 203.49
920-01-03 11 29.50 324.50
920-01-03 6 23.18 139.08
920-01-03 575 30.92 177.79
920-01-03 9 42.06 378.54
186-17-13-03 1.25 42.06 52.58
Subtotal $1,295.65
Balance Due $1,295.65

Please Make Checks Payable to New England Service Company.,

27




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Redacted

DAILY TIME SHEET MISSION STATEMENT
NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO. Thraugh its highly specialized employ P il spirit und b comprh gerial
upprouch; New Englund Service Company sirives to provide first duss service end vulue-udded solutions
. toits With this approach, the Componr contingouslr seeks profituble opp to grow
NAME BOE GALLO \ f\ its market share {o muvimize corporate vulae for shurehalders s well us carrent und futwre
[DATE /672010 °, Dﬂﬂni[l‘llﬁ)l emplayees
DAY: s QO T w T F  SA T PP oy
SUPERVISOR DY NI
RETEWED BY: \ \ ‘ “Somc People Dresm af Soctest... White Qthers Wake Up and Aork Nued Atle "
ACCT: | jo.# ] ACCT DESCRIFTIGN Billable? Work Descrip
920 Admin
1703 I Printer & sofiware
00-14 SO +7- et rescrsoir parcel
13-21 186 Due Diligenice for CareFree HOA
19-14 M3 Tustall lnsertion Valve 31 WA
1435 [ Woodfard Ave. Treatment Faalicy
1712 183 |Hardwater mveitigstion hid 1.25|status update; landawner rescarch; begin letter to adjicent prop awner {easement)
19-06 21 Update Valve Cards /100 Seales
19-16 315 Maria Road VFD's
19-20-10 133 Duc Diligence Chatfield Hills Assoc. yes 0.25 __|correspandence with John Hoffinan
20-12 107 Cedar Strect Main Replacemeut ves 0.28 status update
2012 107 [Spruce Street Man Rephicement ves 0.25  [etatusupdate
15-18 107 [Helen, Day & Young Maiis yer 0,25 0 over project irogress and status
[New Englund Scovee Compunt.
415-11 _[ NESC Engincering Services
20-07-01 218 MWS System Registrotion
17-18-01 201 (Berkihire Rood Bridae ves 0.5 project status and order materials
s Wagter o
19-14-03 186 Onmi Carnphiint (Easter line Ureak) ves 25 [review of data resy call ws s ch PUC annual rpts (CTAC)
1512 18+ Duc Diligence Tiogs
17-16-03 186 Finanainng for Roscbrook Pressure Red
16-09-04 133 Presswre reduction for Rosebrook
151802 105 [ Tank Replaceuieints - WR
19-21-02 136 Tank Inspection - WR
17-13.03 116 1017 Rate Case - RBW yes 2| mreting, confer with Don Re: hearing questions
19.03-0¢ 313 Servacet/Renewals/Curh Stop Locations {Lakeland)
133 Services/Rencwals/ Cuth Stop Locatlons {WR)
333 Scrvices /Renewali/Curb Stop Locations (RBW)
333 Services/Renewals/Curb Stop Lacations {TGV)
333 Services/Rencwals/Curb Stop Locations (TGB)
186 Digibze & Prepare distribution paus {Lakelandy
186 Digitize & Prepare distributlon plans (White Rock)
186 Digituize & Prepare dltribution plans (Roscbroak)
1286 |Digituee & Prepare distribution plans (Tioga-Gilford)
136 [Digitaize & Frepare distribution plans (Tioga-Belinont}
186 Installation & Evd
Fo) Min_replacenient at 19 Rocky Point Drive (WRWC)
Financing peiition for Drinking Water State Trust Funds (T~
200706 u6 B)
20-03-06 343 [installation of distnbution valves and Lnkia)
20-08.02 (White Rock Tank Lining
1411.00 183 Millbrook Water Co
E‘# [Adwsin-Genera
Culenial Watex Compuny
610.0) Admin-Geinera
Investigale, Reniedy and Respand to the DEP Consent Ociler al
20-R6-10 10?7 the Deaper R4 Well €1 [yes 0s work on project
20-08-30 103 Draper Road Generator Repar
12-18 218 Springtle Farms Acquisition
13-09 186 Systemn distrbuuon taapping
17-30-10 20 Picardy & Abbe Roud
20-02-10 304 Picardy Lune Ollice Developnient
19-07-30 201 Cranberry Lane main replscement
TIa-12-1) Webate design
18-10-10 104 D¢ma & reinove fonner Knoltwood PS
19:42-10 103 Draper Road clecirical Controls
19-09-30 303 Springddc PS Fire Puimp Replaceinent
19-10-30 165 Springdule PS SCADA Syatem linegration
20-06-30 218 Springdule PS Tank Inspection (2020)
19-15-10 113 [Emer gency Responie Plan
15.16-10 213 WMA Pernit Renewal 0.25  |droughit management plan update
19.1¢-10 108 [ Taylar Lasie Main tistalltion
19-17-10 103 [Franris Streel Chean Pumnps backpressure
19-18-30 105 [Droper Road Chein Pumps backpressure
15-19-10 105 Chickeriteg Drive Chent Pusnips backpressure
19-20.9 104 Knollwood Avenur Clicmical Plunibing Replacement
19-24- 10 108 System hydraulic imodeling
926-01 [Vacation
926-01 Sick
926-03 Robiday
9264 Persond
926-11 {Education /Training
TOTAL HOURS 3 | 1 |
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
upplemental Rate Case Expenses
Redded

DAILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

MISSION STATEMENT

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit and a comprehensive managerial approach;

New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and value-added solutions to its customers. With this approach, the
Comnpany continuously seeks profitable opportunities to grow its market shore to maximize corporate value for shoreholders as well as
current and future opportunities for ernployees,

DATE: 4/20/2020
DAY : s (M) T W TH F  SA
SUPERVISOR:  Nick LaChance "Use Your Best Judgement At All Times"
REVIEWED BY: "Some People Dream of Success. .. While Others Wake Up and Work Hard Ac I."
ACCT: | J.O.# | ACCT DESCRIPTION Billable Work Description
Valley Water Systems
920 Administrative Other
903 Customer records
391-15-22
w England Service Compan
903 Customer Records Invoicing
920 Administrative Accounting
520 Administative Other
416-10% Redbrook/Agawam Water Y 0.5 Process IC Payracnts
416890 Ad Meloria
416-930 West Swanzey
416-340 FVCP
Mountgin W, 421
119-100 Sheffield acquisition
119-300 Hutchinson acquisition
610.01 Administrative/Accounting Y 1.25 Calls/Emails/Process IC Payments/Update Cash Activity Summary Report/ Update MS Money
218-17-12 Mountain 2017 Rate case expense
111-1702 Install Meters
Abengkj Water
Administrative
920-01-01 Lakeland -Admin Y 0.25 Emails/Process IC Payments/Update Cash Activity Summary Report/Update MS Money
920-01-02 White Rock -Admin Y 0.2§ Emails/Process IC Payments/Update Cash Activity Summary Report/Update MS Money
920-01-03 Rosebrook - Admin Y 0.25 Emails/Process IC Payments/Update Cash Activity Summary Report/Update MS Money
920-01-05 Tioga Gilford Village - Admin Y 0.25 Emails/Process IC Payments/Update Cash Activity Summary Report/Update MS Money
920-01-06 Tioga Belmont - Admin Y 0.25 Emails/Process IC Payments/Update Cash Activity Summary Report/Update MS Money
186-17-13-03 Rosebrook - Rate Case Y 0.75 Pull and Email NL 2019 NESC Invoices for Redbrook Rate Case
Calls/Emails/Process IC Payments/Billing/Invoicing/ JE's/ Create New Customer Accounts in ND5/Dig Safe Notices/Create JO's for DC/Load Meter Files
610.01 Administrative/ Accounting Y 2.25 for DC
218-18-07 2018 Rate Case Application
215-18-07 2018 Rate Case Application
Colopjal Division
610.01 Administrative/ Accounting Y 2 Calls/ Emails/Process IC Payments/ Billing/Invoicing/Dig Safe Notices/ Create JO's for MT & JK/Update MS Moncy
ingdale Divisi
610.01.00.31 Administrative/ Accounting
111-18-02-31 Install Meters - Springdale
926-01 Vacation
92602 Sick
926.03 Holiday
926-04 Personal
926-11 Education/Training
TOTAL HOURS 8




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
R&Tgel&(ﬂental Rate Case Expenses

DAJILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

MISSION STATEMENT

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit and a comprehensive managerial approach;
New England Service Company strives to provide first class service ond value-added solutions to its customers. With this approach, the

Company continuously seeks profitable opportunities to grow its market share to maximize corporate value for shareholders as well as
current and future opportunities for employees.
DATE: 4/14/2020
DAY : s M (T) W TH F  sa
SUPERVISOR:  Nick LaChance "Use Your Best Judgement At All Times"
REVIEWED BY: "Some People Dream of Success. .. While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At It."
AccT: | jo.# | ACCT DESCRIPTION Billable -
Valley Water Systems
920 Administrative Other
903 Customer records
391-1§-22
New England Service Company
903 Customer Records Invoicing
920 Admini tive A ing
920 Administrative Other
416-101 Redbrook/Agawam Water
416-340 FVCP
| Mountain Water Service
1159100 Sheffield acquisition
119-300 Hutchinson acquisition
610.01 Administrative/ Accounting Y 0.75 Calls/Emails/Dig Safe Notices/ Create JO's for TH
218-17-12 Mountain 2017 Rate case expense
111-17-02 Install Meters
Abengki Water
Administrative
920-01-01 Lakeland -Admin
920-01-02 White Rock -Admin
920-01-03 Rosebrook - Admin
920-01-05 Tiogs Gilford Village - Admin
920-01-06 Tioga Belmont - Admin
186-17-13-03 Rosebrook - Rate Case Y 0.5 Verify Additional Expenses Incurred for 2019
Plymouth Division
610,01 Administrative/Accounting Y 2.5 Calls/Emails/Dig Safe Notices/Create JO's for DC/Billing/ Update Cash Activity Summary Report/Update MS Money
218-18.07 2018 Rate Case Application
218-18-07 2018 Rate Case Application
Colonial Division
610.01 | I Administrative/ Accounting Y 3.75 Ca.lIs/Emails/Payroll/Bi]ling/Dig Safe Notices/ Create JO's for MT & JK/Update Cash Activity Summary Report/Update MS Money
Springdale Division
610.01.00.31 Administrative/ Accounting Y 0.5 Update Cash Activity Summary Report/ Update MS Money
111-18-02.31 Install Meters - Springdale
926-01 Vacation
926-02 Sick
926-03 Holiday
926-04 Personal
926-11 Education/ Training
TOTAL HOURS 8

wU




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERYICE CO,

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneuriel spirit and a comprhensive mangerial

approach; New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and value-added
solutions to its customers. With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable

opportunities to grow its marker share to maximize corporate value for shareholders as well as current

MISSION STATEMENT

DATE: 4/6/2020 and future opportunities for employees
DAY: 5 @D T w TH F SA
SUPERVISOR: DV
REVIEWED BY: “Some People Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At ft."
accT: [ jo# | ACCT DESCRIPTION Nick L
l'! Jgr W for M
920 Admin 1.5 Admin, A/P
17-08 391 Printer & software
00-24 50 +/. acre reservoir parcel
20-14 186 Coronavirus Planning 1.5 Discussions & Strategy, memo and calendar outline
19.09 391 Soflware Upgrades
17-12 186 Hardwater investigation
18-28 Day & Young Main Replacement
e EEE!%"“' Service Company
415-571 NESC Aquarion-Simsbury
920 NESC  [Administrative Other 2,5 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review,
416-330 NESC Atrium
392 NESC Vehicle Purchase
93+ MF NESC DOT work
181-001 NESC Financing of Twin Mountain Prop
9 NESC Truck Purchase
315 Twin Mountaia Property
181-000 NESC Financing for Town Line Rd
314-000 NESC Purchase of Town Ling Rd Property
416-101 NESC_ |Redbrook Mgmt Contract
920-003% NESC Administrative Other - NH
416-800 Hids & Proposals
o ster
610.0¢ Admin-General 0.5 Admin
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Program
17-04 Flydrams
17-12-01 218 AMAWS rate case
17-18 Berkshire Schoo! Road Project
20-05-01 L0% Services & renewals
17-15-0t 201 Improve Access Road and Maple
Abenaki 15uter Compon
20-07-06 181 Financing Pctition for DAVGTTF
Tawstallation of distribution valves and
20-08-06 343 storage tank Tioga Belmont
19-1+-03 105 Disputed Service Line Project
16-09-03 183 Pressure reduction for Rosebrook
£9-18-02 103 Tank Replacements - WR
19-23.02 186 Financing lor tank replacements - WWR
17.13.03 186 Roscbrook Rate Application 1.5 Conference Call with Marcia Bown & Steve $t. Cyr to review upcoming hearing
1411-00 183 Millbrook Water Co
920-01-05 Tioga Gilford Village - Admin
920.01-06 Tioga Belmont - Admin
970.01-01 Lakeland- Admn
§20-01-02 White Rock - Admin
920-01.03 Roschraok-Admin
Flvmouth Divisien
610.01 Admia-General 0.75 Admin
18-07 214 2015 Rate Case
17-69 108 Tying into Redbrock System
17-11 218 40 Unit subdivision
£7-12 Peter Deascy Project
17-06 218 Cell phane tower
Coloniol Water Company
610.01 Admin. General 0.75 Admin
17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 167 F-Cali and 4 log detection
15-08-10 t17 Purchase of 2019 F130 Utiliy Truck
926-01 Vacation
926-102 Sick
926-03 tloliday
926-04 Personal
926-11 Education / Training
TOTAL HOURS |
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DATE:

DAILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

4/7/202Q

DAY: 5 M CDw TH OF SA

SUPERYISCR: Dy

AMISSION STATEMENT

Through its highly specialized employees, entreprencutiol spirit and a comprhensive mangerial
approach; New England Service Company strives to provide first dass service and value-added
solutions to its customers, With this appreach, the Company continuously secks profitable
opportunities to grow its market share to maximize corporate value for sharekolders as well as current
and future opportunities for employees

"Some People Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard 4¢ Ir.”

ACCT: | J.O.& | ACCT DESCRIPTION Nick L Work Description
Voller Bater Spaems
920 Admin 1.5 Admin, A/P
17-08 391 Printer & soltware
00- 24 50 +/- acre reservair parcel
20-14 186 Coronavirus Planning 15 Discussions & Strategy, several follow up with the lender
19-09 391 Software Upgrades
17-12 186 EFlardwater investigation
18-28 Day & Young Main Replacement
New Englond Service Compan
+15-571 NESC Agquarion-Simsbury
G20 NESC Administrative Other 25 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review,
416-330 NESC Atrium
392 NESC Vehicle Purchase
934-MF NESC DOT work
181-001 NESC Financing of Fwin Mountain Prop
392 NESC Truck Purchase
315 T'win Mountain Property
181-000 NESC _ |Financing for Town Line Rd
314000 NESC Purchase of Town Line Rd Property
416-101 NESC Redbrook Memt Contract
920-001 NESC Administrative Other - NH
+16-8K) Bids & Proposals
Mountain HWoter Systems
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Program
17-4 Hydrants
17-12-01 218 MWS rate case
17-18 Berkshire Schaol Road Praject
20-03-01 109 Services & renewals
17-15-01 201 Improve Access Road and Maple
Abenaki Hui EngE" 9
20-07-06 181 Financing Petition for DAYGTF
Installation of distribution valves and
20-08-06 343 storage tank Tioga Belmont
19-1+4-03 103 Disputed Service Line Projeal
16-09-03 183 Pressure reduction for Rosebrook
19-18-02 103 Tank Replacements - WR
19-23-02 186 Financing for tank replacements - WR 0.5 DWSRF Funding Final Application
17-13-03 186 Rosebrook Rate Application 1 Preparation of wpcoming hearing
1+11-00 183 Millbrook Water Co
920-01-05 Tioga Gillord \'i]lagﬂ - Admin
920-01-06 Tioga Belmont - Admin
920-01-01 Lakeland-Adma 0.25 Admin
920-61-02 White Rock - Admin
$20-01-03 Roscbrook-Admin

610.01

Admin-General 0.5 Admin, A/P
18.07 218 2018 Rate Case
17-08% 108 Eying into Redbrook System
17-11 218 40 Unit subdivision
i7-12 Peter Deasey Project
17-00 218 Cell phane 10wer

[ wlonjul Woter Company

610.01 Admin-General 0.5 [Admin, A/P
17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
200610 107 I Coli and 4 log detection
19-08-10 117 Purchase of 2019 F230 Litility Truck
926-01 Vacation
926.02 Sick
926-011 Floliday
926-14 Personal
926-11 Education/ Training

TOTAL HOURS

s | 1 I |
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIMESHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

DATE: 47842020

DAY : S M T

D TH F sA

MISSION STATEMENT

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit and o comprhensive mengerial
approach; New England Service Company strives te provide first class service and value-added
solutions to its customers. With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable
opportunities to grow its market share to maximize corporaite value for shareholders as well as current
and future opportunities for employees

SUPERVISOR: DV
REVIEWED BY: "Some Peaple Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard Ae ft. "
ACCTE: [ JO.# ] ACCT DESCRIPTION Nick L Work Description
Valley Waree Spseemg
920 Admin 1.5 Admin,
17-08 391 Printer & soltware
00-24 50 +/- acre reservoir parcel
20-14 186 Coronavirus Planning 1 Discussions & Strategy, several follos up with the lendee
19-09 391 Sofiware Upgrades
17-12 186 Hardwater investigation
Day & Young Main Replacement
435-371 NESC | Aquarian-Simsbury
920 NESC Administrative Other 2,5 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio resicw,
+16-330 NESC Atrium
392 NESC Vehicle Purchase
934-MiF NESC DOT work
181-001 SO Financing of Twin Mountain Prop
392 NESC Truck Purchase
s Twin Mountain Property
181-000 NESC Financing for Tawn Line Rd
314-000 NESC_ |Purchase of Town Line Rd Property
+16-101 NESC Redbrook Mgmt Contract
920-001 NESC Administrative Other - NH
+16-800 Bidls & Proposals
Wonngain Harer Sysems
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Program
17-(4 FIydrants
17.12.01 218 MWS rate case
17-18 Berkshire School Road Project
20-05-01 109 Services & renewals
17-15-01 201 Improve Access Road and Maple
Abepaki Woter Compuny
20-07-06 181 Financing Petition for DAWGTF
Installation of distribution valves and
20-08-06 3+3 storage tank Tioga Belmont
19-14-03 105 Disputed Service Line Project 1.5 Technical Session
16-09-03 183 Fressure reduction for Rosebrook
19-18-02 105 Tank Replacements - WR
19-23-02 186 Financing for tank replacements - WR
17-13-03 186 Roscbrook Rate Application 2 Preparation of upcoming hearing
T+ 11-00 18} Millbrook Water Co
920-01-05 ga Gillord Village - Admin
a920-01-06 ‘Tioga Belmont - Admin
920-01-01 Lakeland-Admn
920-01-02 White Rock - Admin
920-01-03 Rosebrook-Admin

Plywouth Division
610.01

Admin-General

0.25 Admin,

18-07 218 2018 Rale Case
17-09 108 Tying into Redbrook System
17-11 218 40 Unit subdivision
17-12 Peter Deasey Project
17-06 218 Cell phone 10wer
A -
G610.01 Adrmin-General 025 Admin,
17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 E-Coli and + log detection
19.08-10 117 Purchase of 2019 T250 Ltility Truck
9206-01 Vacation
92612 Sick
926-13 Haoliday
926-0+ Personal
926-11 Tducation/ Training

TOTAL HOURS

Cr| [ [ —
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case

Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIMESHEET
NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.
DATE: $/972020
pAwv: 5 M T w @ r o osa
SHIPERVISOR: DY

REVIEWED BY:

MISSION STATEMENT

Through its highly specialized emplayees, entrepreneurial spirit and a comprhensive mangen'n'l
approcch; New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and value-added
solutions to its customers. With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable
opportunities to grow its market share to maximize cotporate value for shareholders as well as current

and future apportunities for employees

“"Some Peopie Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard A it."

ACCT: | J0.F | ACCT DESCRIPTION Nick L Work Description
Faifey HWiater Systens
Q20 Admin 1.5 Admin,
17.08 391 Printer & software
o)-24 50 +/- acre reservoir parcel
20-14 186 Coranavirus Planning 0.5 Discussions & Strategy, several follow up with the lender
19-09 391 Software Llpgrades
17-12 186 Elardwater investigation
18-28 Day & Young Main Replacement
Nw Eng.lgm.' Service Ciy
+15-5M1 NESC | Aquarion-Simshury
920 NESC Administrative Other 2.5 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review,
+16-330 NESC Atrium
392 NESC Vehicle Purchase
934-MF NESC DOT work
181-001 NESC Financing of Twin AMountain Prop
392 NESC Truck Purchase
315 Twin Mountain Propernty
13:-000 NESC Financing lor Town Line Rd
314-000 NESC Purchase of Town Line Rd Propenty
H6-101 NESC Redbrook Mgt Contract
920-001 NESC Administrative Other - NH
+16-800 Bids & Proposals
Mountoir Water Systems
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Program
17-04 Hydrants
17-12-01 218 MW rate case
17-18 Berlshire School Road Projent
20-05-01 109 Services & reacwals
17-15-01 201 Improve Access Road and Maple
dbenghi
20-07-06 181 Financing Petition for DWGTE
Installation of distribution valves and
20-08-06 343 storage tank Tioga Belmont
19-14-03 105 Disputed Service Line Project
16-09-03 183 Pressure reduction for Rosebrook.
19-13-02 105 Tank Replacements - WR
19-23-02 186 Financing for tank replacements - WR
17-13-03 86 Roscbrook Rate Application 1.5 Prepatation of upcoming hearing
14-11-00 183 Millbraok Water Co
920-01-05 Tioga Gillord Vitlage - Admin
920-01-06 Tioga Belmont - Admin
920-01-0 Lakeland- Admn 0.5 Discussions with Taylor regarding billing issue
920-01-02 White Rock - Admin
920.01-03 Rasebrook-Admin
i)
610.01 Admin.General 0.25 Admin,
1§-07 2t8 2018 Rate Case
17.08 108 Tying into Redbrook System
17-11 2t8 40 LInit subdivision
17.12 Peter Deasey Projed
17-06 218 Cell phone tower
Colovial Warer Compony
410,01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin,
1710 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 E-Coli and + log detection
19-08-10 117 Purchase of 2019 F250 Utility Truck
92601 Vacation
926-02 Sick
926-03 Holiday
926-04 ersonal
926-11 Education/ Training

TOTAL HOURS

5] | |
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TI

D: 4/ 1072020

MESHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

DAY : 5 M T

w TH (D sa

MISSTON STATEMENT

Through its highly specialized emplayees, entrepreneurial spizit and a comprhensive mangerial
approach; New England Service Company strives to pravjd‘eﬁrst class service und value-added
solutions ta its customers. With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable
oppertunities ta grow its market share to maximize corporate value for sharehelders as well as current
and future opportunities for employees

SUPERVISOR: DV
REVIEWED BY: "Some People Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At It.”
A [ o ] ACCT DESCRIPTION Nick L Work Description
Satley Woarer Spstom;
920 Admin 1 Admin,
17-08 391 Printer & soltware
00-24 53400 +/- acre reservoir parcel
26-14 186 Coronavirus Planning 1 Discussions & Strategy, several follow up with thelender, Beard mecting prep/narrative
19-09 391 Sofiware Upgrades
17-12 186 Hardwater javestigation
18-28 Day & Young Main Replacement
New England Service Compuny:
415.571 NESC Aquarion-Simsbury
920 NESC  |Administrative Other 1.5 Admin, priciog jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review,
416-330 NESC Atrium
192 NESC Vehicle Purchase
934-MF NESC DOT work
181.001 NESC Financing of Twin Mountain Prop
392 NESC | Truck Purchase
313 ‘Fwin Mountain Property
181.000 NESC  [Financing for Town Line Rd
314-000 NESC  [Purchase of Town Line Rd Property
+16-101 NESC Redbrock Mpmt Contract
920-001 NESC Administrative Other - NH
+16-800 Bids & Proposals
Mounrgin Hter
610,01 Admin-Genera! 0.25 Admin
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Program
1744 Hydrants
17-12.01 218 MWS rate case
17-18 Beykshire School Road Project
20-05-01 109 Services & renewals
17-13-01 201 Improve Access Road and Maple
Lhenobi Wter Company
20-07-06 81 Financing Petition for DWGTE
Installation of distribution valves and
20-08-06 343 storage tank Tioga Belmont
19-14-03 105 Disputed Service Line Project
16-09-03 181 Pressure reducticn for Rosebrook
19-18-02 103 ‘Tank Replacernents - R
19-13-02 186 Financing lor tank replacements - WR
17-13-03 186 Roscbraok Rate Application 0.75 Preparation of upcoming hearing
14-11-00 183 Millbrook Water Co
920-01-05 Tioge Gillord Village - Admin
920-01-06 Tioga Belmont - Admin
920-01-01 Lakeland- Admn
920-01-02 White Rock - Admin
920-01-03 Rosebrook-Admin
Plymouth Division
G10.01 Admin-General (.25 Admin,
13-07 218 2013 Rate Case
17-09 108 Tying inlo Redbrook System
17-11 218 40 Lnit subdivision
17-12 Peter Deasey Project
17.06 218 Cell phone tower
y iny
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin,
17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisitian
20-06-10 107 E-Cali and 4 log detection
1%-08-10 17 Purchase of 2019 1250 Unility Truck
926-01 Yacation
926-02 Sick
226-01 Holiday 3
926-04 Personal
926-11 Lducation/ Training

TOTAL HOURS
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

DATE: +13/2000
DAY: 5 @D T w TH F SA
SUPFRVISOR: DV

REVIEAVED BY'

MISSION STATEMENT

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit and @ comprhensive mangerial
approach; New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and value-added

solutions to fts customers, With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable
opportunities to grow its market share to maximize corporate salue for shareholders as weil as current
and futture opportunities for employees

"Some People Dream of Sucress... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At it "

Accl | low | ACCT DESCRIPTION Nick L Work Description
Yolkyy Waner &
920 Admin 1.5 Admin, A/P
17-08 391 Printer & software
00-24 50 +/- acre reservoir parcel
20-14 186 Corpnavirus Planning 1.25 Discussions & Strategy, several follow up with the lender, Board meeting prep/narrative
19-09 3N Soltware Upgrades
17-12 186 Hardwater investigation
18-28 Day & Young Main Replacement
,\'Eu' Eng] n, é‘ §£:rirg Compuiry
+15-571 NESC Aquarion-Sinsbury
920 NESC Admipistrative Other 2.5 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review,
416-330 NESC Atricm
192 NESC Vehicle Purchase
93-ME NESC DOT work
181-001 NESC Financing of Twin Mountain Prop
392 NESC ‘Truck Purchase
HE Twin Mountain Property
181-000 NESC Financing for Town Line Rd
314-000 NESC Purchase of Towa Line Rd Property
416-101 NESC Redbrook Mpme Contract
920-001 INESC Administrative Other - NI|
+16-800 Bids & Proposals 0.25 Ferrandina & Son / CT College
Mouptein Water Srstems
610.01 Admin-General 0.5 Admin
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Program
17-0+ Hydrants
17.42.01 218 AWS rate case
17-48 Berkshire Schogl Road Project
20-05-01 109 Services & renewals
17-15-01 201 Improve Access Read and Maple
Abenaki Hater Compgny
20-07-06 181 Financing Petition for DWGTF
Instatlation of distribution valves and
20-08-06 343 storage fank Tioga Belmont
19-14-03 1S Disputed Service Line Project
16-09-03 183 Pressure reduction [or Rosehrook
19-18-02 105 Tank Replacements - WR
15-23-02 186 Financing lor tank replacements - WR
17-13-03 186 Rosebrook Rate Application 0.5 Preparation of upcoming hearing/Review various exhibits
14.11.00 183 Millbrook Water Co
NC-01-63 Tioga Gillord Village - Admin
920-01-06 Tioga Belmont - Admin
Discussions with several customers on billing issue, discussion with Evergreen Harvard and
920-01-01 Lakeland-Admn 1.5 Laconia Housing Authority, draft up bilting procedures to be followed
920.01-02 White Rock - Admin
920-01-03 Rosebrock-Admin
Blymouth Divigion
610.01 Admin-General 0.5 Admin, A/P
18-07 218 2018 Rate Case
17-09 108 Tying inte Redbrook System
17-11 218 40 Llnil subdivision
17-12 Peter Deascy Project
17-06 218 Cell phone 1ower
Colonia! Wies Company
610.01 Admin-General 0.5 Admin, A/P
17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 E-Celi and + log detection
19-08-10 117 Purchase of 2019 F250 Ultility Truck
926-01 Vacation
926-02 Sick
926-03 Holiday
926-04 Personal
226-11 Education/ Training
TOTAL HOURS [ | T | |
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit and a comprhensive mangerial
approach; New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and value-added
solutions to its customers, With this approach, the Compeny continuously seeks profitable
opportunities to grow its market share to maximize corporate value for shareholders as well as current

MISSION STATEMENT

DATE: 471072020 and future opportunities for employces
DAY: 5 (D T w TH F  SA
SUPERVISOR: DY
REVIEYWYED BY: “Some fPeaple Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At It."
ACCT: I J.O. # | ACCT DESCRIPTION Nick L Work Description
Vlley Wuter Systems
920 Admin 1.5 Admin,
17.08 391 Printer & soltware
00-24 50 + /- acre reservoir parcel
20-1% 136 Coronavirus Plarning 0.5 Info gathering with Ion Bank for PPP funding
19-0% 191 Software Upgrades
1712 186 Hardwater investigation
18-28 Day & Young Main Replacement
New Englund Service Compony
$13-571 NESC Aquarion-Simsbury
920 NESC Adeministrative Other 3 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review,
+16-330 NESC Atrium
192 NESC Vehicle Purchase
934-MF NESC DOT work
181-001 NESC Financing of Twin Mountain Prop
392 NESC Truck Purchase
315 Twin Mountain Property
181-000 NESC Financing Jor Town Line Rd
314-000 NESC  |Purchase of Town Line Rd Propesty
415-101 NESC Redbrook Mgmt Contract
920-001 NESC Administrative Other - NIT
+16-800 Bids & Proposals
Mountain Huter Systems
610.01 Admin-General 0.5 Admin, A/P
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Program
17.04 Hydrants
17-12-01 218 MWS rale case
17-18 Berkshire School Read Froject
20-05-01 109 Services & renewals
17-15-01 201 Improve Acress Road and Maple
i15y Luf2l% 1]
20-07-06 131 Financing Petition [or DAYGTF
Installation ol distribution valves and
20-08-06 343 storage Lank Tioga Belmont
19-14-03 105 Disputed Service Line Project
16-09-03 183 Pressure ceduction for Rosebrook
19-18-G2 105 Tank Replacements - WR
19-23-02 186 Financing for tank replacements - WR 1 Work on Final Application items
17-13-03 186 Rosebrosk Rate Application 1 Preparation for Hearing on 4.23
14+-11-60 183 Millbeaok Water Co
520-01-03 Tioga Gilford Village - Admin 0.25 Admin
920.01-06 Tiaga Belmont - Admin
920-01-01 Lakehnd Admn
920-01-02 White Rock - Admin
920-01-03 Rosebrook-Admin
Plymouth Division
610.01 Admin-General 0.5 Admin, A/P
18-07 21§ 2018 Rate Case
17-09 108 Tying inlo Redbrook System
17-11 213 40 Llrit subdivision
17-12 Peter Deasey Project
17-06 218 Cell phone tower
b ol 0 gi’ H'gsrg Smpuity
610.01 Admin-General 0.5 Admin, A/P
17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 E-Cali and + log detection
19-08-10 17 Purchase of 2019 1250 Lility Truck
926-01 Yacalion
926-02 Sick
426-03 Haliday
926-04 Persanal
926-11 Fducation/ Training
TOTAL HOURS 875 | | I
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case

Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY T1

ME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERYICE CO.

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit and @ compthensive mangerial
approach; New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and value-added
solutions to its customers. With this approach, the Company continucusly seeks profitable
opportunities to grow its market share to maximize corporase value for shareholders as well as current

MISSTON STATEMENT

DATE: +/21/2020 and future opportunities for employees
DAY: 5 M CID) w TH F sA
SUPERVISOR: Dy
REVIEWED BY: "S$ome Peaple Drcam of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At it "
ACCT: , 10 # I ACCT DESCRIFTION Nick L
| Futiey Wuter Syarem
220 Admin 1.5 Admin,
17.08 391 Printer & software
00-24 50 +7- acre reservair parcel
20.14 186 Coronavirus Planning 0.5 Info gathering with fon Bank for PPF funding
19-09 in Soltware Upgrades
17-12 186 Hardwater investigation
18-28 Day & Young Main Replacement
Xew rvice Computny
+415.571 NESC Aquarion-Simsbury
920 NESC Administrative Other 3 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review,
+16-130 NESC Atrium
392 NESC Vehidle Purchase
944-MF NESC DOT work
L81-001 NFSC Financing of Twin Mountain Prop
in NESC Truck Purchase
315 Tawin Mountain Property
181-000 NESC Financing for Town Line Rd
314-000 NESC Purchase of Town Ling Rd Property
+16-101 NESC Redbrook Mgmi Contract
920-001 NESC Administrative Other - NH
+16.800 Bids & Propesals
Mounigin 15yter fusems
610.01 Admin-General 0.5 Admin,
17-06.01 Evaluate Capital Program
17-04 Hydrants
17-12.01 218 MWS rate case
17-18 Berkshire School Road Project
20-05-01 105 Services & rencwals
17-15-01 201 Improve Acvess Road and Maple
dbenaki Weter Compuny
20-07-06 181 Financing Petition for DWGTF
Installation of distribution valves and
20-08-06 343 storage tank Tioga Belmont
19-14-03 105 Dispitted Service Line Project
16-09-03 183 Pressure reduction for Rosebrook
19-18.02 105 Tank Replacements - WR
19-23.02 186 Einancing for tank replacements - WR 1.5 Woark on Final Application jtems
17-13-03 186 Rosebrook Rate Application 1 Preparation for Hearing on 4.23
14-11.00 183 Millbraok Water Co
920.01-03 Tioga Gitord Village - Admin
920-01-06 Tioga Belmont - Admin 0.25 Admin
920-01-01 Lakeland-Admn
920-01-02 White Rock - Admin
920-01-03 Roschrook- Admin
Plymouth Division
410.01 Admin. General 0.25 Admin
18-07 218 20%8 Rate Case
1709 108 T'ying into Redbrook Sysiem
17-11 218 40 Llnit subdivision
17-12 Peler Deasey Project
17-06 218 Cell phone tower
Coloniaf Wurer Coppany
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
17.10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 E-Caoli and 4 log detection
19-08.10 117 Purchase of 2019 F230 Unkity Truck
926-01 Vacation
926-02 Sick
226-03 l{oliday
926-D4 Personal
926-( | Lducation/Training

TOTAL HOURS

8,75
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

DATE. 42242020
pav: 5 M T W) TH O OF O SA
SUPERYISOR: DY

REVIEAVED BY:

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit ond a comprhensive mangerial
approach; New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and velue-added
solutions ta its customers. With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable
opportunities to grow its market share to maximize corporate value for shareholders as well gs current

and future opportunities for employees

MISSION STATEMENT

"Some People Dream of Success, .. While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At Tt

ACCT: | 10.# L ACCT DESCRIPTION Nick L Work Description
I'EHS__‘ Hister Syt
920 Admin 1.5 Admin,
17-08 391 Printer & software
00-24 30 +/. acre reservoir parcel
20-14 186 Corgnavirus Planning 0.5 Info gathering with lon Bank for PPP funding
19-09 391 Soltware Upgrades
17-12 136 Hardwater investigation
18.28 Day & Young Main Replacement
Sew England Service Company
+15-571 NESC Aquarion-Simsbury
R0 NESC Adminisirative Other 2.25 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review,
+16-330 NESC Atripm
392 NESC Vehicle Purchase
G34-MF NESC DOT work
181-001 NESC_ |Financing of Twin Mountain Prop
392 NESC Truck Purchase
315 Twin Mountain Property
181-000 NESC Financing for Town line Rd
314-000 NESC Purchase of Town Line Rd Property
+16-101 NESC  |Redbrock Mgma Contract
920-001 NESC  |Administrative Other - NH
+16-800 Bids & Propasals
Mouniyin 31
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin,
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Program
17.04 Hydrants
17-12-01 218 MWS rate case
1718 Berkshire School Road Praject
20-05-01 109 Services R renewals
17-15-01 201 [mprove Access Road and Maple
Abgawki Sbarer Compuny
20-67-06 181 Financing Petition for DWGTE
Installation of distribution valves and
20-08.06 343 storape 1ank Tiops Belmont
19-14-03 105 Dispuced Service |ine Praject
16-09-03 183 FPressore reduction lor Rosebrook
19-18.02 105 Tank Replacements - WR
19-23-02 186 Fmancing for tank replacements - WR L5 Work on Final Application items
17-13-03 186 Rosebrook Rate Application 25 Preparation for Hearing on 4.23
L4-11-00 183 Millbrogk Water Co
920-01-05 Tioga Gillord Village - Admin
920-01-06 Tioga Belment - Admin
920-01-01 Lakeland- Adme
920-01-02 White Rock - Admin
920-01-03 Rosebrook-Admin
Pl vision
G1¢.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
18.07 218 2015 Rate Case
L7-0% 108 Tying into Redbrook System
17.11 218 40 Ulnix subdivision
17-12 Peter Deasey Project
17.06 21§ Cell phone tower
Loloniaf Water Compeny
610.01 Admiin-General 0.25 Admin
17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 E-Coli and + log detection
15-08.10 17 Purchase of 2019 E250 Lhility Teuck
926-01 Vacation
926-02 Sick
92603 Holiday
926-04 Personal
926-11 Education/ Training
TOTAL HOURS s | | | |
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO,

DATE +/23/2020
DAY: 5 M T w G F SA
SUPERVISOR: DV

REVIFWED BY:

MISSION STATEMENT

Thraugh its high[y speciglized employees, enteepreneurial sp}rit and a comprhensive mangeriaf
approach; New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and value-added
solutions to fts customers. With this approach, the Company contimtously seeks profitable
opportunities to grow ity market share to maximize corporare value for shareholders as well as eurrent

and future opportunities for employees

"Same Pegple Dreant of Suecess... White Others Wake Up and Wark Hard A¢ 1"

accr [ Jo# | ACCT DESCRIPTION Nick L work Description
Folley Wener ﬁ
920 Admin 1 Admin,
17-08 321 Printer & software
0024 30 +/ - acre reservoir parcel
20-14 136 Corgnavirus Planning
19-09 391 Software Upgrades
17-12 186 1lardwaler investigation
18-28 Day & Young Main Replacement
Mé viF g
415-571 NESC  [Aquarion-Simsbury
920 NESC Administrative Other 1 Admin
+16-330 NESC Atrium
392 NESC  |Vehicle Porchase
934-MF NESC DOT work
181-001 NFSC Financing of Twin Mountain Prop
392 NESC "Truck Purchase
315 Twin Mountain Property
181-000 NESC Financing for Town Line Rd
314-000 NESC _ [Purchase of Town Linc Rd Properiy
+16-101 NESC Redbrock Mg Contract
920-001 NESC Administrative Other - N1
+16-800 Bids & Proposals
Moumain Iaer Sraems
610.01 Admin-General .25 Admin,
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Program
17-04 Hydrants
17-12-01 218 MWS rate case
1718 Berkshire School Road Project
20-05-01 109 Services & renewals
17-15-01 201 Improve Access Road and Maple
Abenuki Huter Compupy
20-07-06 181 TFinancing Petitien for DWGTF
Installation of distribution valves and
20-08-06 343 storage tank Tioga Belmont
15-14-03 105 Dispuied Sexvice Line Project
16-09-03 183 Pressure reduction for Rosebrook
15-18-02 105 T'ank Replacements - WR
19-24-02 136 Tinancing lor tank replacements - WR
17-13-03 186 Rosebrook Rate Application 6.5 Hearing
15.11.00 133 Millbrook Water Ca
920-01-0% Tioga Gillord Village - Admin
520-01-06 Tioga Belmont - Admin
920-01-01 Takeland-Admn
920-01-02 White Rock - Admin
920-01-03 Rosebrook- Admin
Plemouth Divisic
¢i.04 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
18-07 218 2018 Rate Case
17-09 108 Tying into Redbrook System
17-11 218 40 Llnit subdivision
17-12 Peter Deasey Project
17-06 218 Cell phone tower
Cafoniaf urer Company
6510.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 E-Coli and 4 log detection
1%.08.10 117 Purchase ol 2019 F230 Uil
926-11 Vacation
926-02 Sick
926-03 toliday
926-04 Personal
926-11 Education/ I'raining
TOTAL HOURS 925 | I 1
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILYT1

ME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

DATE: 47 2423020
DAY, S M T w TH (B sa
SUPERVISOR: DV

REVIEWED BY:

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit and a comprhensive mangerial
approach; New England Service Company strives to provide firse class service and value-added
solutions to its customers. With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable
opportunities to grow its market share to maximize corporate value for shareholders as well as current

and future opportunities for employees

MISSION STATEMENT

“Some People Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At s

ACCT: [ JO# ] ACCT DESCRIPTION Nick L Wark Description
Valley Warer Systems
920 Admin (%3 Admin, meeting prep
17-08 39 Printer & software
00-24 50 +/- acre reservoir parcel
20-14 186 Coronavirus Planning 0.5 Discussiens with [on Bank re: PPP Loan
19-09 391 Saltware Upgrades
17-12 136 Hardwater investigation
18-28 Day & Young Main Replacement
sice Compyny
+15-571 NESC Aquarion-Simsbury
920 NESC  [Administrative Ciher 2.5 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review,
+16-330 NESC Atrium
192 NESC Vehicle Purchase
934-MF NESC DOT work
181-001 NESC Financing of Twin Mountain Prop
392 NESC | Truck Purchase
HE Twin Mountain Praperty
131-000 NESC Financing for Town Line Rd
344-000 NESC Purchase of Town Line Rd Property
+16-101 NESC  [Redbrack Mgmt Contract
920-001 NESC Administrative Other - NEI
+16-300 Bids & Proposals
Mountzin Marer s s
G100t Admin-General 0,25 Admin,
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Program
17-04 Hydrants
17-12-0% 218 MAVS rate case
17-13 Berkshire Schoul Road Project
20-03-04 109 Services & repewals
17-15-0¢ 201 Imprave Access Road and Maple
Abenuki WWater Comrpan,
20-07-06 181 Financing Petition for D GTF
Installation of distributicn valves and
20-08-06 343 storage tank Tioga Belmant
19-14-03 105 Diisputed Service Line Project
16-09-03 183 Pressure reduction for Rosebrook
19-18-02 103 Tank Replacements - WR
19-23-02 186 Financing lor tank replacements - WR
17-13-03 186 Roscbrook Rate Application 1 E/ 1L discussion from hearing with Marcia Borwn and DV
L+-11-00 184 Millbrook Water (o
920-01-05 Tioga Gilford Village - Admin
920-01-06 Tioga Belmont - Admin
920-01-01 [ akeland- Admn
920-01-02 White Rock - Admin
920-01-03 Rosebrook-Admin
¥rfu ivf
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
18-07 218 2018 Rate Case
17-09 108 Tying into Redbrook System
17-11 218 40 LInit subdivision
17-12 Peter Deasey Project
17-06 238 Cell phone tower
Cofoniuf SEuter Company:
630.01 Admin-General 0,25 Admin
17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 E-Coli and 4 log detection
1%-08-10 L7 Purchase of 2019 F230 Utiliiy Treck
926-01 Vacalign
926-02 Sick
926-04 1oliday
9264 Personal
926-11 Education/ Training,
TOTAL HOURS 6.25 T | |
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
' Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Stephen P. St. Cyr & Associates

17 Sky Oaks Drive
Biddeford, Me. 04005
207-423-0215
stephenpstcyr@yahoo.com

May 2, 2020

Sheryl Fairchild

New England Service Company
37 Northwest Drive

Plainville, CT 06062

Fee for professional services rendered during April 2020 (see attached detail).

Prior Billing $6.755.00
Current Billing (44.6875 hours @ $140.00/hour) $6,256.25
Less: April 2020 DW 17-165 RC Exp (9.00 @$140.00/hour) (1,260.00)
Reimbursable Expenses: Copies 0.00
Postage 0.00
Scan/Email 10.55
Mileage (  x $0.545) 0.00
Total Current Billing $5.006.80
Total Billing $11.761.80

Payment due upon presentation.
If you have any questions or comments, please call me at 207-423-0215.

Sincerely,

ﬁ% Stephen P. St. Cyr
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Date Desgription of Service Hours
Year End / Other
04/01 Review Staff’s rec re: ext 0.125
04/02 Review email re: fina! TB; Review email; Review PUC approval of ext; Review final TB 0.50
04/11 Review/Reply to email re; Aff Agr 0.125
04/12  Review Don's email re: AWC & payment to NESC 0.25
04/13 Review/Reply to email re: rent pay to NESC 025
04/14 Review emails re; aff agr; Review Aff Agr; Reply to email re: charges 0.25
04/15 Review/Reply to email re; cost rates / labor + ben + OH 0.1875
04/24 Review status; Review TB groupings; Review “A” sch; Review “S™ sch; Prepaie email re; same; Prepare F-1;

Prepare F-1 by system; Prepare F-2; Prpare £-2 by system; Review varemails re: cover, A-3, A-4,

A-5, A6, A-T & A-8 4.00
04/25 Prepare 2019 PUC Ann Rep; Update “A” sch; Prepare F-8; Prepare F-8 by system . 400
04127 Prepare 2019 PUC Ann Rep; Prepare F-11; Prepare F-11 by system; Prepare F-12; Prepare F-12 by system;

Review email re; Aff Agr 4375
04/28 Reply to email re: Aff Agr; Review reply; Prepare 2019 PUC Ann Rep 3.125
04729 Prepare 2019 PUC Ann Rep; Review same; Prepare email re: same; Talk w/Nick te: LL/TGV cap ex/ fin 4.00
Total 21.1875
Note: Please charge to Outside Services (PUC account 923).
Rosebrook Rat 17-165
04/02 Review emall re: conf call 0.125
04/03 Review/Reply to emails re: conf call; Review file re; RC exp; Review var docs; Prepaxe email re; sum of NESC

charges 0.625
04/06 Prep for and part in conf call for hearing 0.625
04/07 Review Q&A for Nike re: RC exp; Prepare comments; Prepare email re; same 0.50
04/08 Review Don's email re: Q&A; Review resp; Prepare comments; Reply to same; Talk w/Don re: Q&A 0.50
04/09 Review Nick’s email re: NESC charges broken down; Review file; Reply to same; Review multiple email re:

conf info at hearing; Review email re: Q&A for Nick; Review file; Reply to same; Review multiple

emails re: exh list; Review Marcia’s email re: exh; Review Getz’s email re; exh; Review email re;

postponement; Review email re: set; Review Don’s reply 1.25
04/10 Review email re: “final ver of Q&A; Review PUC ltr re: post; Review Marcia’s email re: same; Prepare email

re: sup docs; Review mul emails re: sup docs; Review mul emails re: Aff Agr 0.75
04/13 Review mul emails re: hearing date; Review email re: resch hear date; Review var emails re; same 0.25
04/14 Review Omni’s offer, Reply to same; Review email re: resch hear date; Review var emails re: same 0.375
04/15 Review email; Review PUC lir re: resch hear date; Review/Reply to email re: add'l RC exp; Review/Reply to

email re: counter offer; Review/Reply to email re: 2020 RC exp 0.625
04/16 Review var emails re: counter offer 0.125
04/17 Review Omni offer; Prepare outline of counter offer; Prepare email re: same; Talk w/Don re: same; Talk w/

Marcia re: same; Review email to parties re: same 0.625
04/20 Review email re: add’l RC exp; Review zip file; Review sum 0.25
04721 Review/Reply to Marcia’s email re: prop surcharge; Review Nick’s reply; Review Co pos on contested amt

surcharge; Reply to same 0.875
04/22 Review/Reply to email re: Co offer; Review/Reply to email re: prep ses; Review Don’s reply 025
04/24 Talk w/Don re: hearing 0.25
04/30 Review draft written closing; Talk w/Marcia re: same; Review Nick's comments; Review multiple emails w/

OCA; Review var parties closing arguments 100
Total 9.00
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)

DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expegnses

Rosebrook Rate Case.

Rosebraok Rate Case (DW 17-165) Step 2 — Scope of Engineering
i 0.25

04/06
04/09

04/10
04/13
04/14
04/15
04/16
04/17

04/22
Total
Note:

Prep for and part in conf call for hearing
Review multiple email re: conf info at hearing; Review 12/31/19 TB; Prepare email re: reg costs assoc w/PRS;

Review multiple emails re: eng costs / Step 2; Review multiple emails re: exh list; Review Marcia’s
email re: exh; Review Getz’s email re: exh; Review email re: pos:ponement Review email re: set;

Review Don’s reply e
Review PUC lir re: post; Review Marcia’s email re: same

025

Review mul emails re: hearing date; Review email re: resch hear date; Review var ¢ axl; re: same 025
Review Omni’s offer; Reply to same; Review email re: resch hear date; Review var'e%ails re same 0375
Review email; Review PUC lItr re: resch hear date; Review/Reply to email re: counter ffeli‘ et e et (375 %
Review var emails re; counter offer 0.125
Review Omni offer; Prepare outline of counter offer; Prepare email re: same; Talk w/Don re: same; Talk w/

Marcia re: same; Review emai! to parties re: same 0.625
Review/Reply to email re: Co offer; Review/Reply to email te: prep ses; Review Don’s reply 025

3.50

Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)
Rosebrook Rate Case.

o 100 oy
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses ,—b

&

J

Return on Equity (IR 19-005) o
04/06 Talk w/Steve F re: ROE calc; Review email re: ROE calc; Forward same; Revigw Don’s email re; same 0.50
04007 Talk w/ayson re: ROE cale 0.125 \
04/27 Review email re: ROE docket 0.125 /
04/28 Reply to email re: ROE docket 0.125 ﬁz}()
Total 0875\
Note: Please charge to Miscellancous Peferred Debits (PUC account 186)
Rosebrook ROE -
OMNI complaint (DW 19-131) ’b
04/06 Prep for and part in conf call for hearing; Talk w/Don re: CIAC; Review amort of CIAC sch; Prepare email re: /o
same; Review Don’s email re; CIAC 0.875 WA
04/07 Review Don’s email; Review CIAC sch; Identify mains, calves, etc.; Reply to email; Review tech ses Q&A; AY
Draft cert resp; Reply to email, 125 Y
04/08 Review Marcia’s email re: CIAC sch; Reply to same; Talk w/Don re: tech ses 0375 N\
04/09 Review 2012 file; Reply to email re: CIAC 0.50 ~
04/13 Review tech ses DRs to both Omni & Co.; Review var emails re; same 0375 %9
Total 3375 o
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)
OMNI complaint \C)
Tioga Belmont Financing (DW 20-xxx ‘O
04/02 Review Nick's test; Prepare email re: comments; Review auditors’ F/S grouping, Verify B/S acct bal; Talk w/ e
Nick re: pet, test., efc. 1.375 O
04/03 Review nick’s email re; comments on SPS’s test; Reply to same; Incorp same into SPS’s test; Review “final” 4
TB; Update fin sch; Prepare email re; balance; Make final changes to cover Itr, pet, NAL’s test.” ?)
& SPS’s test.; Review DES ltr to PUC; Review Nick’s email re: cover ltr.; Reply to same 3.50
04/06 Gather “final” docs; Conduct “final” review; make minor edits; Review same; Scan/Email same 0.50 \ ’
04/07 Review PUC email; Review ack Itr; Reply to same; Forward to Don/Nick 0375 % 9’-
Total 5.75 AN k.)’
Note: Please charge to Unamortized Debt Expense (PUC account 181) 7{'
Tioga Belmont Financing ?
[
White Rock financing (DW 20-xxx) 2N
04720 Review/Reply to email re: conf call 0.125 ,\ :
04721 Prep for and parti in conf calt 0875 \o
Total 1.00 ,\$
Note: Please charge to Unamortized Debt Expense (PUC account 181)
‘White Rock Financing
Purchase of Millbrook (DW 2¢-xxx)
Total 0.00
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)
Millbrook Acquisition Costs
AWC 2020 Rate Case (DW 20-xxx}
Total 0.00
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)
2020 Rate Case

Rosebrook CoBank financing of PRP (DW 20-xxx} :
Total 0.00
Note: Please charge to Unamortized Debt Expense (PUC account 181)

Rosebrook CoBank PRP

Grand Total

SPSt. Cyr
05/03/20
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

New England Service Compan :
vE 2 pany Redacted InV0|ce
Plainviile, CT 06062
Terms Date Invoice #
Net 30 513172020 MAY2020RB
Bill To
Abenaki Water Company
37 Northwest Drive
Plainville, CT 06062
Item Description Account # Qty Rate Amount
920-01-03 418 82.06 343,01
186-19-14-03 11 124.04 1,364.44
186-17-13-03 0.5 124,04 62.02
347-20-06-03 0.25 124.04 31.01
186-19-06-03 1 124.04 124.04
183-16-09-03 0.5 124.04 62.02
NL-RWS LABOR | Vice President 920-01-03 1.38 125.48 173.16
NL-RWS LABOR | Vice President 186-17-13-03 7.05 125.48 884.63
DV-RWS LABOR | President/General Manager 920-01-03 1.55 122.92 190.53
Subtotal $3,234.86
Balance Due $3,234.86

Please Make Checks Payable to New England Service Company.
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEET

MISSTON STATEMENT

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO. Through its highly specialized emplayees, entreprencurial spirit and a comprheasive mangerial
approach; New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and value-added solutions
to its customers. With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable opportunities to grow
its market share to maximize corporate value for shareholders as well as current and fisture
DATE: 5/29/2020 opportunities for emplayees
PAY: S M T w  TH CE) SA
SUPERYISOR: DY
REVIEMWED BY: “"Same People Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hard At "
ACCT. [ 0% ] ACCT DESCRIPTION Nick L Work Description
Valler Weter St
920 Admin 1 Admin,
17-08 191 Prinler & software
00-24 50 +/- acre reservoir parcel
20-14 186 Coronavirus Planning
1912 156 Rate Case Expense
17-12 i86 Hardwater investigation
18-28 Day & Yourg Main Replacement
New England Service Compyiy
+15-571 NESC | Aquarion-Simsbury
920 NESC Administrative Other 2.5 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portlolie review,
416-330 NESC Atrium
192 NESC Vehicle Purchase
934-MF NESC DOT work
181-001 NESC | Financing of Twin Mouasain Prop
392 NESC Truck Purchase
315 “F'win Mowntain Property
+16-801 NESC | Bids & Proposals - NIT
314000 NESC | Purchase of Tawn Line Rd Property 1 Review of property and next steps to set up printing
1i6-301 NESC Redbrook Mgt Contract
920-001 NESC Administrative Other - NH
+16-800 Bids & Proposals
| Mountain Warer Systems
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
17-06.01 Evaluate Capital Pragran
17:04 1ydrants
17-12.01 218 MIWVS rate case
17-18 Berkshire Schaol Road Praject
20-05-01 109 Services & renewals
17-15-01 201 Improve Access Road and Maple
| Abenki Water Lompuny
20-07-06 181 Financing Petition far DAWGTF
[nstallation of distribution valves and
20-08-06 343 storage tank Tioga Belmom
19.14-03 165 [Disputed Service Line Prajret
16-09-03 183 Pressure reduction for Rosebrook
19.18-02 103 Tank Replacements - WR
£9.23.02 186 Financing for tank replacements - WR
17-13-03 186 Rascbrook Rate Application 1.5 Discussions with Marcia Brown & Don V.
20.06-01 186 Consalidated Rate Application - LMC
20.09.02 186 Consolidated Rate Application - \WWR
20.0605 186 Consolidated Rate Application - TGY
200906 186 Cansolidated Rate Application - TB
200701 186 Cansolidated Rate Applicatian - 13VW
14:11-00 183 Millbrook Water Co
920-01-03 Tioga Gilford Village - Admin
920-01-06 Tioga Belmont - Admin
920-01-01 Lakeland-Admn
920-01-02 White Rock - Admin
920-01-03% Roscbrock-Admin 0.25 Admin
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
L§-07 218 2018 Rate Case
17-09 18 Tying into Redbrook System 0.5 Drscussion with Guastella
L7-11 218 40 Unit subdivisien
17-12 Peter Deasey Project
17-06 218 Cell phone tower
Cofoniaf Il'urcE famEun 3
610.01 Adwmin-General 0.25 Admin,
1710 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 E-Coli and + log detection
19-08-10 L7 Purchase of 2019 F230 Wiility Trudk
926-01 Yacation
916-02 Sick
916-03 Ioliday
926-04 Personal
926-11 Education / Training
TOTAL HOURS 65 | | | |
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case

Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

DATE: 3/6/ 2010

DAY : 5 Ll

T a2 TH O F sA

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spitit and a comprhensive mangerial
approach; New England Service Company strives to provide firse class service and rolze-added solutions
te its custoriters. Iy secks profitable opportunities to grow

Fts market share to matimize corporate value for shareholders as well as current and future

With this g

MISSTON STATEMENT

h, the C F

PF P

opportunities for employees

SUPERVISOR: DY
REVIEWED BY “Seme People Dream of Success... While Qthers Wake Up and Work Hard Atlt"
accT: | jow ] ACCT DESCRIFIION Nick L Work Description
Vailey Water Spstems
220 Admin 2z Admin, A/P, annual report review
17.08 391 Printer & software
00-24 50 +/- acre reservoir parcel
20-14 136 Coronavirus Planning 0.5 Internal procedure discusions
19.09 191 Saliware Lpgrades
17-12 136 Hardwater investigation
18-28 Day & Young Main Replacement
New Eng}und Service Compuny
415371 NESC Aquarien-Simshury
920 NEsC Administrative Other 4.5 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, pertfolio review, ops mecting, annual report review
+16-330 NESC Atriwn
92 NESC Vehicle Purchase
234-MI NESC BOT work
LE1-001 XNESC Financing of Twin Mountin Prep
392 NESC Truck Porchase
315 Twin Mountain Property
181-000 NESC Financing for Town Line Rd
314-000 NESC Purchase of Tawn Linc Rd Property
+16-101 NESC Redbrock Mgmt Centract
920-001 NESC Administrative Other - NE[
416-800 Bids & Propasals
SMountoin Worer Systems
6]0.01 Adinin-General 0.5 Adunin,
17.06-01 Evaluate Capital Program
17-04 Hydrants
17-12-01 218 MWSrate ase
17-18 Berkshire Schaol Road Project
20-05-01 109 Serrices & rencywvals
17-15-01 201 Improve Access Road and Maple
.lbﬂmé! ]l'g__(e! Sgﬂ.c_ﬂgl
20.-07-06 181 Financing Petition for DWGTF
Installation of distribution valyes and
20-08-06 33 |storage tank Tioga Belmont
19-14.03 105 Disputed Service Line Project
16-09-03 183 Pressurc reduction for Roschrook
19-18-02 103 Tank Replacements - WR
19-23.02 186 Financing for tank replacements - WR
17-13-03 136 Roscbrook Rate Application 1 Discussion w/ Steve St. Cyr on Record Requests
20-06-01 186 Consolidated Rate Application - LMC
20-08-02 186 Conselidated Rate Application - WR
20-06-03 186 Consolidated Rate Application - TGV
20-0%-06 186 Censolidated Rate Application - TB
20-07-01 186 Consalidated Rate Application - LYWW
14-11-00 183 |Millbrook Water Co
920-01.05 Tioga Gilford Village - Admin
920-01-06 Tioga Belmam - Admin
920-G1-01 Lakeland- Admn 0.25 Admin
920-01.02 VWhite Rock - Admin
920-01-03 Roschrook-Admin
Flymeuth Divisivn
[ ewoi Adnmin-General 0,25 Admin,
18.07 218 2018 Rate Case
17-09 108 Tying ima Redbrook Systeny
7-11 218 |+0 Unil subdivision
17-12 Peter Deasey Project
17.06 3t Cell phene tower
Colonigl Woater Company
G100 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisttion
20-06-10 107 E-Cali and 4 log detection
19-08.10 "7 Purchase of 2019 F230 LIt Truck
926-01 Yacalion
92602 Sivk
226-01 Haliday
926-0+ Personal
926-11 Education Training,
TOTAL HOURS | | |
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEET MISSION STATEMENT
NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO. Through its highly specialized emplosees, entrepreneurial spirit und a comprhensice mangerial
approach; New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and value-added solutions
to its customers. With this appreach, the Company continucusly seeks profitable opportunities to grow
its market share to maximize corporate volue for shareholders as well as current and future
DATE: 3/7/2020 oppottunities for employees
DAY: 5 M T w JB F s
SUPERVISOR: Dy
REVIEVWED BY “Some People Dream of Success... While Othees Wake Up and Work Hard Avic”
ACCT: | JO.# | ACCTDESCRIPTION Nick L Work Description
Yalfgr Water Spstems
920 Admin L5 Aclmin
17-08 391 Printer & software
00-24 50 +/ - acre roservoir parcel
2014 186 | Coronavirus Planning
1909 191 |Sofiware Upgrades
17-12 186 Hardwater investigation
18-28 Day & Young Main Replavement
New Epgland Service Company
415-571 NESC | Aquarion-Simsbury
920 NESC Administrative Other 2.5 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review, annual reportreview
416330 NESC Atrium
92 NESC Vehicle Purcase
934-MF NESC 1DOT work
181-001 NESC Firansing of Twin Mountain Prop
392 NESC Truck Purchase
B Trrin Mountain Property
181-006 NESC Financing for Town line Rd
114-000 NESC | Purchase of Town Line Rd Froperly 1 Review progress and next steps ta printing ops
+16-101 NESC Redbrook Mgm1 Contract
220-001 NESC Administrative Cther - NH
416-800 Bids & Proposals
Mountain Water Sysiems
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin,
17-06-01 Evaluats Capital Progran
1704 Hydrans
17-12-01 218 MW rate vase
17-18 Berkshire Schoal Road Project
20-05-01 109 Services & renewals
17-15-21 201 Improve Access Road and Maple
| Abenuki 'lfmg EEEBE'
20-07-06 181 Financing Petition for DWGTE 0.5 Further work on application
Instaliation ol distribution salves and
20.08-06 341 storape tank Tioga Belmont
19-14-03 195 Disputed Sertice Line Project
16-09-04 183 Pressure reduction for Rosebrook
19-13-02 105 Tank Replacements - WR
19-23.02 186 Financing for tank replacements - WR
17-13-03 186 Rascbrock Rate Application 2.5 Assembly of Record Requests
20.06.01 186 Consolidated Rate Application - LMC
20:00-02 186 |Consolidated Rate Application - WR
20-06-03 186 Consolidated Rate Application - TGY
200906 186 |Consolidated Rate Application - TB
20-0701 186 Consolidated Rate Application - LWW
14-11-00 183 Millbrook Water Co
920-01.03 Tioga Gilford Village - Admin
920-01.06 Tioga Belmont - Admin
92¢-01.01 Lakeland- Admn
920-01-02 White Rock - Admin
920-01-03 Roschbrook- Admin
Plymouth Divisien
61001 Admin-Genvral 0.25 Admin,
18-07 218 2018 Rate Case
17.09 108 Tying into Redbraok Systein
17-11 218 40 Llnit subdivision
1742 Peter Deasey Praject
17.06 218 Cell phone tewer
Colonial Worer Company
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin
17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 T-Coliand 4 log detection
19-08-10 17 Purchase of 2019 F230 Unility Truck
92601 Vacation
92602 Sick
92604 Holiday
93604 Peraonal
926-11 Cducation 7 Training
TOTAL HOURS 375 ] | | |
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEET

NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

Through its highly specialized employees, entreprencurial spirit and a comprhensive mangerial
approach; New England Seevice Company strives to provide fiest class service and volue-added solutions
to its customers. With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable opportunities to grow
its market share to maximize corporate value for shareholders as well as current and future

MISSTON STATEMENT

DATE: 57872020 opportunities for employees
DaY: § M T w TH (B> sA
SUPERYISOR: DY
REVIEWED BY: "Some Peaple Dream of Success... While Qthers Wake Up and Work Hard At 1"
ACCT: [ 1O & | ACCT DESCRIPTION Nick L Work Description
l'n!!c- "’ult{ S!-.ncmx
920 Admin 1.5 Admin
1708 17 Printer & software
00-24 50 +/- acee reservoir parcel
20-14 186 Coronavirus Planning
19-09 391 [Software Upgrades
17-12 186 Hardwaler investigation
18-28 Dy & Young Main Replacement
o
NESC Aquarion-Simsbury
920 NESC Administrative Other 5 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review, anneal report review
+16-330 NESC Atrium
392 NESC Vehicle Purchase
934-MF NESC DOT work
131-001 NESC [ Financing of Twin Mountain Prop
132 NESC Treck Parchase
1135 Trin Mountain Property
181-000 NESC Firancing for Town Line Rd
314-000 NESC Purchase of Town Linc Rd Praperty
416-101 NESC Redbrack Mgmt Contract
$20.001 NESC Adm inistrative Other - NI
416-800 Bids & Proposals
Hountgin Weater Systems
610.01 Admin-General 0.25 Admin,
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Program
17-04 Hydrants
17.12-01 1t8 MWS rate case
17-18 Berkshire School Road Project
20-03-01 109 Services & renewals
17-15-01 201 Jinprove Access Road and Maple
Abenaki Water Company
10-07-06 181 Financing Petition for DWGTF 0.5 Further werk on application
Installation of distribution valves and
20-08-06 33 [storage tank Tioga Belmont
191403 105 |Disputed Service Line Project
16-09.63 183 Pressure reduction for Roschrook
19-158.02 163 Tank Replacements - WR
19.23.02 186 [Financing for tank replacements - WR
17-13.03 186 Rascbrook Rale Application L Assembly of Record Requests
20.06-01 186 Consalidated Rate Application - LAC 0.25 RFP discussions with rate consultam bidders
20.09-02 186 Consalidated Rate Application - WR 0.25 RFP discussions with rate consullant bidders
20.06-0% 136 Consalidated Rate Application - TGV 023 RFP discussions with rale consullant bidders
20.09-06 186 Consalidated Rate Application - TB 023 RTP discussions with rate consuliant bidders
00701 186 Consalidated Rate Application - LWW 623 REP distussions with rate consultant bidders
L4-11-00 183 Millbrook Water Co
920-01-03 Tiaga Gilford Yillage - Admin
920-01-06 Tiaga Belmane - Admin
920-01-01 | akeland- Admn
920-01-02 White Rock - Admin
910-01-03 Rosebrook -Admin
Plymoutk Dirisioq
610,01 Admin-General 0.25% Admin,
18-07 218 2018 Rate Case
17-0% 108 Tying into Redbrook System
17-13 218 40 Lnit subdivision
17-12 Peter Deasey Project
17-06 218 Cell phone tower
Coluntal Warer Compony
610.01 Admin-General 0.2§8 Admin
17.10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 E-Coli and 4 log detcction
19-08-10 117 Purchase of 2019 1230 Lhility Truck
926-01 Valion
926-02 Sick
926.03 Holiday
9264 Personal
226-11 Edycation/ Training
TOTAL HOURS 75 | | | |
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEEF

NEY ENGLAND SERVICE CO.

Through its highly specialized employees, entrepreneurial spirit und a comprhensive mangerial
appreach; New England Service Company strives to provide first closs service and value-added solutions
to its customers. With this approach, the Company continuously seeks prafitoble opportunities to grow
its matket share to maximize corporate value for shareholders as well os current and future

MISSION STATEMENT

DATE: 51142020 opportunities for employees
. s (G T W TH F SA
SUPERVISOR. DV
REVIEA LN BY "Some Peuple Dream of Success... While Others Wake Up and Work Hacd At 1t.”
ACCT: J JO.# | ACCT DESCRIFTION Nick L Work Description
Yoffer Water Systems
220 Admin 2.5 Admin, pay plans
17.08 391 Printer & software
00-24 50 +/- acve reservoir parcel
0-14 186 [Coronavirus Planning
19.09 391 Saliware Upgrades
17-12 186 Hardwater investigation
18-28 Day & Young Main Replacement
New Englund Servicy any
415.571 NESC Aquarion-Simsbury
920 NESC | Administrative Other 3 Adlmin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, partfolio review; pay plans
46330 NESC | Atripm 0.25  |Discussion with Prop Mgr
392 NESC Yehicle Purchase
93+-MF NESC 130T work
131-001 NESC [ Finanding of Twin Mountain Prop
39z NESC Truck Purchase
313 Twin Mountain Propezty
181-000 NESC  [Financing for Town Line Rd
314-000 NESC__ | Purchase of Town Line Rd Praperly _
+16-101 NESC Redbrook Mgmt Contract
920-001 NESC Administrative Other - NH
416-800 Bids & Proposals
Hountain Woter Ssstyms
51001 [Admin General 0,75 | Admin, A/P
17.06-01 Evatuate Capinal Program
17-0+ Hydranis
17-12-01 213 MWS rate case
17-18 Berkshire School Road Project
20-05-0% 109 Services & renewals
17-15-01 01 Improve Access Raad and Maple
Abeneiki Water Company
20-07-06 131 Financing Petition for DWGTT
Installation of distribulion yalves and
20-08-06 343 slorage tank Tioga Belmont
19-14-0% 105 | Disputed Service Line Praject
16-09-03 183 Pressurc reduction for Rosebrook
19-18-02 103 Tank Replacements - WR
19-23-02 186 Financing lor tank replacements - WR
17-13-03 186 Rascbrook Rate Applinu‘nn ] Assembly of Record Requests, review OCA's scttlement offer
20-06-01 186 Consalidated Rate Application - LM
20-09-02 186 Consolidated Rate Application - WR
20.06-03 186 |Cunsolidated Rate Application - TGV’
20-09-06 186 [Consolidated Rate Application - TB
20-07-01 186 Consolidated Rate Application - LYWW
1+-11-00 183 Alillbrock Water Co
920.01.05 Tioga Gilford Village - Admin
920.01.06 Tiaga Belmont - Adinin
920.01-01 Lakeland- Adimn .25 Admin
920-01.02 White Rock - Admin
920-01-03 Roscbrock-Admin
Admin-Geperal 05 Admin, A/P
15.07 218 2018 Rate Case
17-09 108 Tying into Redbrook System
17-11 213 40 Uit subdivision
17:12 Peter Deascy Praject
17-0G 218 Cell phone tower
Caloniaf Bater Company
610,01 T Admin-General 0.5 Admin, A/P
17-10 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 E-C'ali and 4 log detection
19.08.10 117 Purchase of 2019 F250 Utility Truvk
926-01 Vacation
926-02 Sick
926-03 Holiday
226-04 Per somal
926-11 L'ducation / Training
TOTAL HOURS 375 | T | |
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

DAILY TIME SHEET MISSION STATEMENT
NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO. Through its highly speciafized emplayees, entrepreneurial spirit and a comprhensive mangerial
approach; New England Service Company strives to provide first class service and value-udded solutions
to its customers. With this approach, the Company continuously seeks profitable opportunities to grow
its market share to masimize corporate value for shareholders as well as current and future
DATE: 31242020 opportunities for emplayees
pv. 5 M w HF Sa
SUPERVISOR DY
REVIEMED BY: “Some Peaple Dreum of Success. .. While Others Wake Up and Work Hurd At Je.”
st [ jo# ] ACCT DESCRIPTION Nick L work Description
l‘g.’"e s Wuter S}-:u%é
920 Admin 2 Admin, A/P
17.08 391 Printer & soflware
00-24 5D +/- acre reservoir parcel
20-14 186 Coronavirus Planning
19-05 391 [Sofiware Upgradrs
17-12 186 Hardwater investigation
1828 Day & Young Main Replacement
New Englund Scrvice Company
413-371 NESC Aquarion-Simsbury
920 NESC Administrative Other 3 Admin, pricing jobs, forcasting cash, portfolio review, Heary Noyes Offer Letter
+16-330 NESC . Awrium
392 NESC Vehicle Purchase
F34-MF NESC DOT werk
181001 NESC  [Financing of Twin Mountain Prop
392 NESC Truck Purchase
115 Twin Mountain Property
151-000 NESC Financing for Town Line Rd
314-000 NESC Purchase of Town Line Rd Property
+16-101 NESC Redbrook Mpmt Contract
920-001 NESC Administrative Other - NH
+16-800 Eids & Proposals
Mountale Weter Systems
610 Q| Admin-General 0.25 Admin _l
17-06-01 Evaluate Capital Propram
17-04 Hydrants
17-12-01 218 MYS rate case
17-18 Berkshire School Read Praject
20-03-01 [ Services & renewals
17-15-01 1061 Tprave Access Road and Maple
Abenuk Woter Cam
20-07-06 151 Financing Petition for DWGTF
Inslallation of distribution valves and
20-08-06 143 storage tank Tioga Belmonr
19-14-03 105 Drisputed Serviee Line Project
16-09-03 184 Pressure reduction for Rosebronk ﬁ{
19-18.02 103 Tank Replacemeats - \WR
19-23-02 186 |Financing for tank replacements - WR
Assembly of Record Requests, review OCA's settlement offer, C/C with Marcia Borwn and
17-13.03 186 Rosebroak Rate Application 2 Steve St Cyr
20-06-01 186 Consolidated Rake Application - LMC
20-09-02 180 Consolidated Rate Application - WR
20-06-03 186 Cansolidated Rate Application - TGV
20-0%-08 186 Consolidated Rate Application - TB
20-07 01 186 Consolidated Rate Application - LWW
1+-11-00 183 Millerook Water Co
920.01.05 Tioga Gillord Village - Admin
920.01-06 Tioga Belmont - Adimin
N
920-01.01 1 akeland-Admn
920.01.02 White Rock - Admin 0.25 Admin
920-01-0% Raoschrook-Admin
Admin General 0.5 Admin,
18.07 2i8 2018 Rate Case
17-09 108 Tying inta Redbrook System
17-11 218 40 Unit subdivision
17.12 Peter Deasey Project
17-06 218 |Cell phone tawer
Cofoniol Water Compagy
61001 Admin-General 0.5 Admin,
17-16 Springdale Farms Acquisition
20-06-10 107 E-Coli and ¢ log detection
14.08-10 17 Purchase of 2012 F230 Uiility Truck
226-01 Vacation
926-02 Sick
226-01 Ioliday
926-0+ Personal
226-11 Eduation/ Training
TOTAL HOURS X | | |
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Redacte

DAILY TIME SHEET
ME SH MISSION STATEAENT
NEW ENGLAND SERVICE CO. Thiough its bighly speciali P lai spitit and a coph d
appraach; New Englaad Service (‘onpanj nnu: 1o provide first class nﬂhf “"' atue-added
tolutions to itx With this ap the Com, i

AME: BOB GALLO empary
gA > e ot opportunities to grow it market sbare to morimlze corporate value for :banhddm o5 sellax
2 - M- 20X T o turreat and future apportunities for employees
SUPERVISOR: bvY
REVIEWED BY: Some People Deedro of Satcees., While Gubers 1¥ake Up and IVork Hord Arin™

aceT 1 _Jo. R [ ACCT DESCRIPTION Billable? Work Descriptian

o e
Admia

19¢ Priater & sofhwaze
50 +7- acre vescrvoir parcel

186 Due Dillgeace for Cuefree HOA
Hy astall lasertlon Yalve st W.A.
332 Woodlord Ave. Treaunent Facilil;

1212 183 [Hirdwater inveniptioa e 0.5|CapEx update
1906 jii] Update Valve Cards/ 100 Scdles
19:18 325 Maria Rosd VED'y
19:20-10 183 Dy Diligeace Chatfield Hitl Auce.
2013 107 Cedar Sureet Male Replicement
20-92 107 e Sueet Main Replicement
18.28 106 |Helea, Day & Youag Bains
| Amcticold Praject - Northwtit Drive v 0.5 contact with engineer regarding design and construction schedule
Scvics Cogpont
T746 |NESC Brusford Manoe Flow Tats
415-11 NESC iog Servicts

415571 NESC Aquirion-Simehary

510 NESC _ |Admialitative Otber
416110 NESC Atriym
92 NESC Vrhicle Purchase
6000 160 Service Seunel
418535 City of Norwlich
150 NESC Website Development
000

314000
315000

H&101
920.00(
$16240
416-101 Agawam Speiogs
416740 NESC | Groute Pofat
416-800 Bids & s

0]

130701 1118 Update Yalve Cards/ 100 Scales/ Ties
3|

25 Discuss subject issues for 5/21 hearing, and OMNIZAWC scttlement offen

19-14-03 186 Omal Complalnt {Eastei break) il
151 18¢ | Due Diligeacs Tiops

171603 186 Fiawndag for Roscbrook Presure Red

16-030% s Pressure reduction for Rosebroak

19-18.02 195 Task Replicemenu - WR

18-21-02 185 Tank lospection - R

12-13.08 186 2067 Rata Case - REW yes 0.5 | Coafereace calt with Murcia aod Steve St. Cys
200801 Q.28
0.25
' -4'

20-10-02
2006-03
2047.05
10-10-06
190608
19.06.05
190606
15:25.0%
10-06-02

200706
200806
200802 White Rock Tank Ualag
191400 s | WRWC tarall test wells for sew supply

H-E1-00 183 [Millbrook Wates Co

920-0108 Tieg Gilford Village - Admla
920-01-06 | Tioga Beimoat - Admin
910-01-01 Lakeland- Adma
911.01.0} 'White Rock - Admia
[931:0103} _|Rosdrook-Admin__
610.01 Admfa-Geaeval
18.07 118 12018 Rale Case
17.09 08 Tyieg Inlo Redbrook Syitzm
[EAT] 218 |40 Usit mbdivislan
17-13 [Peler Deasey Project
£7.06 218 Cell phone tawer
Colentel uee Ca
£19.0t Admla. Genera

010031 605 [ Lead and Copper Plan

Invesligate, Remedy &6 Respond (o (he DEP Conscrt Onder st
N Drsper R Well st = 125 |CapBx update, work on plan

20-06-10 107

105 |Draper Rord Generator Repair
105 [System bydraulie modeling

Vacaticn

f]
Educrtion Tralaing
TOTAL HOURS [ | I 1




DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Stephen P. St. Cyr & Associates

17 Sky Oaks Drive
Biddeford, Me. 04005
207-423-0215
stephenpstcyr@yahoo.com

June 6, 2020

Sheryl Fairchild

New England Service Company
37 Northwest Drive

Plainville, CT 06062

Fee for professional services rendered during May 2020 (see attached detail).

Current Billing (47.18741 hours @ $140.00/hour) $6,606.24
Less: May 2020 DW 17-165 RC Exp (8.43747 @$140.00/hour) (1,181.25)
Reimbursable Expenses: Copies 0.00
Postage 0.00

Scan/Email 0.00

Mileage (  x $0.545) 0.00

$5.424.99

Total Current Billing

Payment due upon presentation.
If you have any questions or comments, please call me at 207-423-0215,

Sincerely,

Stephen P. St. Cyr
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Date

DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Description of Service

Year End / Qther

05/01
05/04
05/05
05/06
05/07
05/08

0s/11

05/12
05/13
05/26
05/27
05/28

05/29
Total

Prepare email re: S sch, PUC Ann Rep & PA-20; Review/Reply to email re: oath pg/S sch; Prepare PA-20 Ext;

greparc email re: same; Review § sch; Talk w/Taylor; Review/Reply to email re: online access to
UuC
Review/Reply to email re: 2019 PUC Ann Rep

Review/Reply to Jessica’s email re: filing PUC Ann Rep; Review Aff Agr; Scav/Email same; Review/Reply to

email re; S sch
Talk w/Taylor re: 8 sch
Review email re: S sch; Review S sch; Prepare email re: 8-2, §-5 & $-6
Review revised 5-2, S-5 & 8-6; Prepare email 1e: $-9; Prepare S-1; Review same

Review reply re: S-9; Update same; Scan same; Reply to email; Review email re: audited F/S; Reply to same;
Review email re; aff agr; Review Staff’s rec; Forward same; File 2019 PUC Ann Rep; Prepare

email re: same

Review PUC email re; info sheet & oath pg.; Update info sheet; Scan/Email same; Review email re: PA-20 est;

Reply to same / depr & amort of CIAC sch

Review PUC email, Review PUC ack Itr;, Forward same

Review 2020 PA-20; Prepare emails re; 2019 PA-20; Populate 2020 PA-20 with 2019 data; Prepare email re:
non-taxable property; Review F-1, F-6, F-8, F-11 & F-12; Tie F-12 systems cost basis to PKF’s TB
database; Tie F-8 by system to F-12; Tie F-6 by system to F-8

Prepare F-12 by system; Prepare F-11 by system; Prepare F-8 by system; Prepars F-6 by system

Prepare email re: 2019 PA-20; Review reply; Review 2019 PA-20; Reply to same; Prepare PA-20; Prepare sup
docs

Prepare 2020 PA-20; Prepare email re: same

Note: Please charge to Quiside Services (PUC aceount 923).

Rosebrook Rate Case (DW 17-165)

05/04

05/05
05/06

05/07
05/11

05/12

05/13

05/14
05/15
05/19
05/21
05/22

05/23
05/28
05/29

Total
Note:

Review var emails re: add’l RC exp; Review email re; revised motion for prot treat; Review email re: amended
Motion; Review email re; RC exp 6/19-1/20

Review emails re: RR; Review RR; Review/Reply to emait re: RR

Prep for call; Review RR 27 & 28; Review 2018 PUC ann Rep; Prepare email re: A-8; Part in call; Discuss
RR 27 & 28; Review final audit rep - revised; Prepare email re: same

Review email re: RR; Review resp

Review Marcia's email re: transcript; Review Nick’s email re: RR 27; Review Marcia’s reply; Review email;
Review OCA’s set offer

Review OCA’s set offer; Prepare email re: same; Part in conf call re: offer; Review draft resp; Review Don's
email; Reply to same; Review reworked draft; Provide add’l com; Talk w/Marcia; Part in conf call;
Review “final” draft; Review don’s email; Reply to same; Review Marcia’s reply

Review DW 15-199 Staff perm rate sch; Review Oplnc & OpIncAdj sch; Review 2014 TB; Determine A&G
sal reflected in rev req; Review/Edit Co resp to RR 27 & 28; Review Don's email re; counter ofier;
Review var emails re: Co resp to OCA's set offer

Review QCA’s revised offer; Review Marcia’s comments, Review Nick's comments

Review Marcia’s email re; Pamaude’s invoice; Review Co. filing re: RC exp — Patnaude inv

Review Marcia’s email; Review RR 27 & 28

Review OCA email re; rev set offer; Review Marcia’s email re; same

Review/Reply to email re: WR & LL G&A wages in resp to RR 27; Review Nick’s reply; Review Marcia’s
reply; Reply to same; Review/Reply to same; Talk w/Marcia re RC exp sup docs; Search emails;
Review Nick’s resp; Review Don's email re: OCA’s rev set offer; Review Nick's email re: same;
Review Don’s email re: comments

Review Marcia’s reply; Review Don’s reply

Talk w/Marcia re: OCA’s offer

Review Marcia’s email re; sum; Review OCA’s email; Review Don’s reply; Review Marcia’s reply; Review

Don’s reply; Review OCA’s Itr

Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)
Rosebrook Rate Case.

Hours

1125
035

0.625
0.125
025
0.75

1.00
0.50
025
4.00
2,00

2375
0.875

14,125

1l).SO
0.375

1.50
0.25

0.50
1.04167

22252
0.1667
0.25
0.25
0.0625
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Rosebrook Rate Case (DW 17-165) Step 2 — Scope of Engineering

DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

05/06 Review PUC ltr; Review Marcia's email re: same; Review Don & Nick’s emais 0375
05/11 Review email; Review OCA’s set offer 0.125
05/12 Review OCA's set offer; Prepare email re: same; Part in conf call re: offer; Talk sbout RRs; Review draft resp,;
Review Don’s emait; Reply to same; Review reworked draft; Provide add'l com; Talk w/Marcia; Part
in conf call; Review “final” draft; Review don’s email; Reply to same; Review Marcia's reply 1.29167
05/13 Review Don’s email re: counter offer; Review var emails re: Co resp to OCA’sset offer 0.2292
05/14 Review OCA’s revised offer; Review Marcia's comments; Review Nick’s comments 0.1667
05/15 Review email re: postponement of hearing; Review Itr; Review Marcia’s Itr re: same 025
05/19 Review cmailer: webex mig 0.125
05/21 Review OCA email 1e; rev set offer; Review Marcia’s email re: same 0.0625
05/22 Review Don's email re: OCA’s rev set offer; Review Nick’s email re: same; Review Don's email re: comments 0.0625
05/23 Review Marcia’s reply; Review Don’s reply 0.0625
05/28 Talk w/Marcia re; OCA’"s offer 0.2083
05/29 Review Marcia’s email re; sum; Review OCA's email; Review Don’s reply; Review Marcia's reply; Review .
Don’s reply; Review GCA's ltr 0.1666
Total 3.12497
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)
Rosebrook Rate Case,
Return on Equi 19-005
Total 0.0600
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)
Rosebrook ROE
OMNI com plaint (DW 19-131)
05/11 Review email; Review OCA’s set offer 0.125
05/12 Review OCA’s set offer; Prepare email re: same; Review revised proc sch; Part in confcall re: offer; Review
draft resp; Review Don’s email; Reply to same; Review reworked draft; Provide add’l com; Talk w/
Marcia; Part in conf call; Review “final” draft; Review Don’s email; Reply to same; Review Marcia’s
reply 1.16667
05/13 Review Don's email re: counter offer; Review var emails re: Co resp to OCA’s set offer 0.2292
05/14 Review OCA's revised offer, Review Marcia’s comments; Review Nick’s comments 0.1667
05/21 Review OCA email re; rev set offer; Review Marcia’s email re: same 0.0625
05/22 Review Don’s email re: OCA’s rev set offer; Review Nick’s email re: same; Review Don’s email re: comments 0.0625
05/23 Review Marcia’s reply; Review Don’s reply 0.0625
05/28 Talk w/Marcia re: OCA’s offer 0.2083
05/29 Review Mareia’s email re: sum; Review OCA’s email; Review Don’s reply; Review Marcia's reply; Review
Don'’s reply; Review OCA’s ltr 0.1666
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)
OMNI complaint
Tioga Belmont Financing (DW 20-xxx)
0.375

05/04
05/05

05/06
05/07
05/08

0511
05/29

Total
Note:

Review email; Review Staff DRs —Set 1
Setup Co resp; Drafl cert resp; Prepare email re: Co resp; Prepare E-22; Prepare ¢mail re: same; Review Nick’s

resp; Review email re: Co resp/att; Review att 1.375

Calc gtrly bill for present & projected rates; Draft resp 0.50
Review email; Review Co resp / att 0.25
Review Nick’s resp; Combine resp; Review same; Gather att; Prepare email re: same; Talk w/Nick re: 1-6;

Review Tioga’s 2018 PUC Ann Rep; Recalc cust bill for pres & prof rates; Review same; Scam/

Email Co resp for “final” review 1375
Review email re: att/1-6; Redo resp to 1-6; Review same; Scan/Email same; Review Nick’s reply to email re:

Co resp; Review/reply to email re: att; Prepare email; File Co resp to Staff DRs —Set 1 1.125
Review email; Review Staff DRs — Set 2 025

525

Please charge to Unamortized Debt Expense (PUC account 181)
Tioga Belmont Financing
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

White Rock financing (DW 20-xxx)

0.125

05/07 Review/Reply to email re: sch
05/11 Review file; Setup sch; Prepare email re: add’] data 0.50
05713 Review Nick’s email re: cost breakdown; Setup financing sch; Prepare same 1.00
05/14 Prepare fin sch; Review same; Prepare email re: same; Review Nick’s test; Prepare draft SPS’s test; Prepare
draft pet; Review/Reply to email re: fin ach 4.625
05/15 Review email re; PUC support ltr; Review petition, Review SPS’s test; Review NAL's test; Prepare email re:
comments; Review DES ltr re; support; Review/Reply to email re: depr rates; Edit petition; Edit
SPS’s test; Prepare email re: same; Review Nick’s email re: comments; Reply to same 3,125
05/19 Review Nick’s email re: test; Review Nick’s comments on pet; Review Nick’s updated test; Review NALL & 2 0.625
05121 Prepare email re: Bob's test; Review Nicks reply 0.125
Total 10.125
Note: Piease charge to Unamortized Debt Expense (PUC account 181)
White Rock Financing
Purchase of Millbrock (DW 20-xxx}
Total 0.00
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186)
Millbrook Acquisition Costs
AWC 2020 Rate Case (DW 20-xxx)
05/18 Reply to email re; engagement & kickoff conf call, Review/Reply to email re: conf call 0.25
05/19 Review/Reply to email re: notice & timing; Review emails re: conf call; Review/Reply to email re: notice &
amts & %s; Review Nick’s reply 0.625
05/20 Prep for and part in conf ¢all re: RC 1.50
05/21 Review 12/31/19 TB; Review CWIP, PS&! & Dref Drs; Highlight projects; Prepare email re: same 1.00
05/27 Review Nick’s email; Review comments on CWIP, PS&I & defs 0.25
05/28 Reply to email re: on CWIP, PS&I & defs; Review Nick’s reply 0.25
Total 3875
Note: Please charge to Miscellancous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186}
2020 Rate Case
Rosebrook CoBank financing of PRP (DW 20-xxx)
Total Q.00
Note: Please charge to Unamortized Debt Expense (PUC account 181)
Rosebrook CoBank PRP
Grand Total 47.18741
$PSt. Cyr
06/06/20
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Redacte
Date NH Brown Law - Rosebrook Rate | Hours | Rate Total
Case
4/2/20 mab | Prepared for hearing on Omni motion

for hearing on rate case expenses.

4/7/20 mab | Prepared for hearing.

4/8/20 mab | Prepared client for hearing.

4/9/20 mab | Reviewed hearing exhibits necessary
for hearing. Prepared for hearing.

4/10/20 mab | Telephone calls with client team
regarding hearing questions and
exhibits.

4/13/20 mab | Corresponded with client regarding
draft questions; revised same.

4/15/20 mab | Reviewed secretarial letters regarding
upcoming hearing. Discuss secretary
of state annual reports.

4/16/20 mab | Telephone call with client to discuss
counter proposal.

4/17/20 mab | Telephone call with S. St. Cyr and D.
Vaughan regarding settlement terms.
Forwarded terms to parties' counsel.

4/20/20 mab | Telephone call with Attorney Getz
regarding counter offer.

4/21/20 mab | Prepared for hearing. Revised
hearing questions. Reviewed exhibits
for presentation and hearing
questions.

4/22/20 mab | Prepared for hearing. Conference
call with client.

4/23/20 mab | Telephone calls with client regarding
hearing preparation.

4/23/20 mab | Represented client at hearing on
Omni motion re rate case expenses.

4/29/20 mab | Reviewed additional rate case
expenses data and identified data to
be marked as confidential.
Corresponded with client regarding
data responsive to record requests.
Drafted closing statement for client
review.




4/29/20 mlt Prepared confidential and public
versions of backup documentation.
4/30/20 mab | [Correspond with client regarding

revisions to closing. N/C] Reviewed
for content written closings from
Omni, Staff, and BWPOA.

DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Redacte

Total:

$5,225.00
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

Redacted

Date

NH Brown Law - DW 17-165
Rosebrook Rate Case

5/4120

mab

Drafted motion for protective
treatment. Finalized rate case
expense filing,

5/4/20

mlt

Finalized rate case expense filing.

5/12/20

mlit

Registered witnesses with moderator
and requested service list revisions.

5/12/20

mab

Conference call with client
regarding OCA proposed settlement.
Drafted response terms for client
review. Corresponded with client
regarding same.

5/13/20

mab

Reviewed revised settiement terms
with client. Corresponded with
OCA regarding settlement.
Reviewed revised seitlement from
OCA. Identified issues for client to
consider. Corresponded with client.

5/14/20

mab

Telephone call with OCA to discuss
settlement. Telephone call with
client regarding same,

5/15/20

mab

Corresponded with OCA, client,
Staff regarding settlement.

5/19/20

mab

Reviewed record request responses
and corresponded with client,

5/20/20

mab

Reviewed revisions to settlement
agreement from OCA; compared
changes to prior drafts;
corresponded with client.

5/27/20

mab

Corresponded with client regarding
Record Request.

5/28/20

mab

Review settlement terms and weight
of evidence on the issues for client.

Rate Total

Hours

TN

Total:/” | $887.50 | /
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DW 17-165 Rosebrook Rate Case
Supplemental Rate Case Expenses

New England Service Company Redacte I nvo | ce
Plainville, CT 06062 :

Terms Date Invoice #
Net 30 6/30/2020 JUN2020RBI
Bill To
Abenaki Water Company
37 Northwest Drive
Plainville, CT 06062
item Description Account # Gty Rate Amount
920-01-03 6.52 82.06 535.03
186-19-14-03 1 124.04 124.04
1ce President 186-17-13-03 0.42 125.48 52.70
NL-RWS LABOR | Vice President 920-01-03 1.29 125.48 161.87
NL-RWS LABOR | Vice President 183-16-09-03 0.69 125.48 86.58
DV-RWS LABOR | President/General Manager 920-01-03 0.39 122.92 109.40
Subtotal $1,069.62
Balance Due $1,069.62

Please Make Checks Payable to New England Service Company.
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